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NOWALSKY, BRONSTON & GOTHARD
A Professional Limited Liability Company

Attorneys at Law
Leon L. Nowalsky 3500 N. Causeway Boulevard Monica R. Borne
Benjamin W. Bronston Suite 1442 EllenAnn G. Sands
Edward P. Gothard Metairie, Louisiana 70002

Telephone: (504) 832-1984
Facsimile: (504) 831-0892

May 8, 2000
VIA AIRBORNE EXPRESS

Florida Public Service Commission

2540 Shumard Oak Drive LTs
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 ODOL /57T

RE: Long Distance International, Inc.
Application for cancellation of
Certificate of Public Convenience
Dear Sir:

Enclosed herewith for filing please find an original and three (3) copies of the
Application of Long Distance International, Inc. to cancel it's Certificate of Public
Convenience and Necessity.

An additional copy of this Application has been enclosed to be date stamped and
returned in the enclosed stamped self-addressed envelope.

Sincerely, .
Lo A ﬂ/mﬁJ}
Leon L. Nowalsky

LLN/rph
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BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

APPLICATION OF LONG DISTANCE )

INTERNATIONAL, INC. )
TO CANCEL IT'S CERTIFICATE OF ) Docket No.
PUBLIC CONVENIENCE AND )
NECESSITY )

lication to Cancel
Certificate of Public Convenience and Necessity

NOW COMES Long Distance International, Inc. ("LDI™) an in support of it's Application
to cancel it's Certificate of Public Convenience and Necessity states the following:

1. On October 7, 1994, in Docket No. 94-0900-T1L, LDI was issued a Certificate
of Public Convenience and Necessity ("Certificate") to provide interexchange
telecommunications service which Certificate was numbered 3540.

2. Due to a change in the business direction of the Company LDI no longer seeks
to be a provider of interexchange telecommunications services within the
State of Florida. ’

3 LDI ceased marketing and has not provided service to any customers within the
State of Florida for over a year. As a result, cancellation of LDI's Certificate is
reasonable and would not be unduly disruptive to the present
or future public convenience.

NOW THEREFORE, by filing this verified Application, Long Distance International, Inc.
secks the entry of an Order by the Florida Public Service Commission ("Commission”) canceling
and terminating both it's Certificate and tariff effective with the date of such Order of the
Commission.

Respectfully submitted,

Leon L. Nowalsky ’
Nowalsky, Bronston & Gothard, APLLC

3500 N. Causeway Blvd., Suite 1442
Metairie, Louisiana 70002

Attorney for Long Distance International,
Inc. :
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STATEOF _NEW Ry )
COUNTY OF__(p) { ON )

1, David Hess, on my oath say that the foregoing application to abandon or discontinuation
of the provision of public utility service in the State of Florida is true and correct to the best of my
knowledge, information and belief and that I am an officer of the applying entity with full authority
to make such application and representations.

O 0 O
David |

SIGNED AND SWORN TO (OR AFFIRMED) BEFORE ME
BY David Hess

THIS [ DAY OF mﬂ% ~, 2000.

(Signature of notarial officer)

My Commission expires;_ /3 /d
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Paula Isler’
To: Martha Coggins
Subject: RE: Long Distance Internationals

I had written the company 5/15 and advised they owed $121.01 if they
owed the minimum due, broken down as follows:

$100.00 - RAF
$17.51 - penalty
$3.50 - interest

1994 - $5.00 penalty and $1.00 interest

1995 - $2.51 penalty and $.50 interest

1999 - $50 RAF, $10.00 penalty, and $2.00 interest
2000 - $50 RAF

HOWEVER, I just noted in the RAF system that on 5/10, the company paid
all of the 1999 RAF except $ .29 RAF, $4.46 penalty, and § .01 interest.
I would like to point out that this 5/10 payment was not posted in the
RAF database when I wrote the company on 5/15. This means that
everything changes. I would apply the $121.00 as follows:

$107.52 - RAF
$11.97 - penalty
$1.51 - interest

1994 - $5.00 penalty; $1.00 interest

1995 - $2.51 penalty; $ .50 interest
1999 - $ .29 RAF; $4.46 penalty; $ .01 interest
2000 - $107.23 RAF

Please send Jackie Gilchrist in the Division of Regulatory Oversight
proof of payment.

Jackie, I will be sending you the file so that a docket can be opened to
voluntarily cancel the company's certificate since they have now paid in
full.

----- Original Message-----

From: Martha Coggins

Sent: Friday, May 26, 2000 12:23 PM

To: Paula Isler
Subject: Long Distance Internationals

LDI(TI234) sent me a check for $121.00 and I'm not sure of the breakdown
between Raf and P&I. Could you please e-mail me back the breakdown.

Thanks

5/3¢ /00
bnc RECEIVED
Lﬁf l Ve //» /&f /czuZL f//éc/ s MAY 3 0 2000
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STATE OF FLORIDA 6 %/JD
Commissioners:
JOE GARCIA, CHAIRMAN DIVISION OF
J. TERRY DEASON TELECOMMUNICATIONS
SusaN F. CLARK WALTER D’HAESELEER
E. LEON JACOBS, JR. DIRECTOR
LILA A. JABER (850) 413-6600
Public Serbice Commission

May 15, 2000

Mr. Leon L. Nowalsky

Nowalsky, Bronston & Gothard
3500 N. Causeway Blvd., Suite 1442
Metairie, LA 70002

RE: Long Distance International, Inc.
Dear Mr. Nowalsky:

This is in response to your letter dated May 8, 2000, in which you requested cancellation of
Long Distance International, Inc.’s IXC Certificate No. 3540. Before I can recommend voluntary
cancellation of a certificate, the company must be in good standing with the Commission and cannot
have a past due balance of the regulatory assessment fees.

In this case, the company has a past due penalty and interest balance of $6.00 from 1994 and
$3.01 from 1995. Also, the 1999 fee, plus penalty and interest charges, has not been received. In
addition to the above outstanding balances, the company will also owe the 2000 fee. The 2000 fee
will become due January 30, 2001. The company has the option of paying the 2000 fee when the
past due amount is paid, or providing the Commission with a date certain when it will be paid.

Until the past due amount and information concerning the 2000 fee is received, I cannot
proceed with your request for voluntary cancellation of Long Distance International’s certificate.
Please respond in writing by May 30, 2000. If you have any questions, just let me know. I can be
reached at (850) 413-6502-voice, (850) 413-6503-fax, and by internet e-mail at
pisler@psc.state.fl.us. )

Sincerely,

Paula J. Isler, Research Assistant
Bureau of Service Evaluation & Compliance

Enclosure

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER ° 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD * TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850
) An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Employer
PSC Website: http://www.floridapsc.com . Internet E-mail: contact@psc.state.fl.us



Long Distance International,
IXC Certificate No.

Inc.
3540 (TI234)

Year

Fee

Penalty

Interest

Notes

1994

Paid

$ 5.00

$1.00

LDI paid the fee on 9/14/94
(due 7/30/94), but did not
pay the penalty and interest
charges.

1995

Paid

$ 2.51

For the period ended
6/30/95, LDI paid the fee
8/5/95 (due 7/30/95), but
did not pay the penalty and
interest charges. For the
period ended 12/31/95, LDI
paid the fee 2/5/96 (due
1/30/96), and paid $17.75 of
the $17.76 penalty and paid
the $3.55 interest.

1999

$ 50.00

$10.00

$2.00

Payment was due 1/31/00. If
paid by May 30, 2000, the
minimum due is $62.00 with
penalty and interest.

2000

$ 50.00

n/a

n/a

Payment is due 1/30/01.

Total

$100.00

$17.51

$3.50

Grand total is $121.01.
NOTE: $71.01 is past due.
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Attorneys at Law
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Ms. Paula J. Isler ;4/ A2 o0
Bureau of Service Evaluation & Compliance //'/7 0
Capital Circle Office Center
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850
OEROSIY DATE

RE: Long Distance International, Inc.

D3¢ # A7 S 0zt)
Dear Ms. Isler:

I am in receipt of your letter of May 15, 2000, regarding the past due assessments and
‘penalties that must be paid prior to the Florida Public Service Commission ("FPSC") allowing Long
Distance International, inc. ("LDI") to cancel its certification.

I have enclosed our check in the amount of $121.01 which will satisfy the past due amounts.
Upon receipt of this payment I would appreciate your processing LDI's cancellation request.

Sincerely,

AT G

Leon L. Nowamky

LLN:sw
Enclosure
cc: Richard Heidecke
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Capital Circle Office Center
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850
DEPOSIT DATE
RE: Long Distance International, Inc. .
D3¢o# [y 3 GZiid
Dear Ms. Isler:
A
I am in receipt of your letter of May 15, 2000, regarding the past due assessments and
‘penalties that must be paid prior to the Florida Public Service Commission ("FPSC") allowing Long
_ Distance International, inc. ("LDI") to cancel its certification. | '
I have enclosed our check in the amount of $121.01 which will satisfy the past due amounts.
Upon receipt of this payment I would appreciate your processing LDI's cancellation request.

Sincerely,

el

LeonL. Nowalsky
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