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Linda Williams

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Friday, February 02, 2001 11:11 AM
To: Linda Williams

Subject: FW: Time Warner Connect

FYI

----- Original Message-----

From: Jackie Knight

Sent: Friday, February 02, 2001 9:52 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: Time Warner Connect

HI Paula. I apologize for taking so long. They are all ok. I have not yet received
payment for 2000, but its still too early to say they are late with their filing.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Friday, February 02, 2001 9:20 AM -
To: Jackie Knight

Subject: RE: Time Warner Connect

Good morning, Jackie. I'm just following up since I haven't received a response yet.
Thanks for your help.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2001 8:18 AM

To: Jackie Knight

Cc: Matilda Sanders; Linda Williams; Kay Flynn
Subject: RE: Time Warner Connect

Jackie, please let me know if these three companies owe any RAFs, including the 2000 fees.
According to the new RAF System, it appears that only TS177 does not have any kind of
balance. The System shows that TX041] and TI531 do have balances, but again, that could be
because they show multiple payments. Thanks.

----- Original Message-----

From: Kay Flynn

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2001 6:39 PM
To: Paula Isler

Cc: Matilda Sanders; Linda Williams
Subject: Time Warner Connect

We received a letter from aty Karen Camechis requesting we cancel ALEC Cert 4724, IXC Cert
4723, and STS Cert 4725.

Is it okay to open a docket to cancel these 3 certs?
Kay

P.S. Please respond to Matilda and Linda. Thanks.
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