REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET

(PLEASE TYPE)

Date__ October 1, 2001 Docket No. DII 3 3 2‘ i n-

1. Division Name/Staff Name REGULATORY OVERSIGHT/HAWKINS

2. OPR_HAWKINS

3. OCR

ALeC

4. Suggested Docket Title Request for cancellation of IXC Certificate No. 7109 Network Access Solutions

Corporation, effective 7/17/01.

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)

A. Provide NAMES ONLY for regulated companies or ACRONYMS ONLY regulated industries,
as shown in Rule 25-22.104, F.A.C.

B. Provide COMPLETE name and address for all others. (Match representatives to clients.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any)

2. Interested Persons and their representatives (if any)

6. Check one:
XXX Documentation is attached.

Documentation will be provided with the recommendation.

1 :\PSC\RAR\WP\ESTDKT.

PSC/RAR 10 (Revised 01/96)

DOCUMENT NUMEFR-DATE
12638 0CT-L5

FPSC-COMMISSION CLERK
.
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COMPANY NAME: Network Access Solutions Corporation CC. CODEjx TX333
COMPANY LIAISON: Don Sussman, Director/Requlatory Affairs
DOCKET NO. : CERTIFICATE NO.: 7109 EFFECTIVE: 08/30/99

RAF RETURN NOTICE:

DELINQUENT NOTICE:

OTHER RETURNED MAIL:

RAR’S RETURNED MAIL:

YEAR (s) RAFs NOT PAID: 2001
YEAR (s) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID: 1999, 2000
REVENUES/YEAR: $0 - 2000 (paid 02/08/01)

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT:

OTHER INFORMATION

07/17/01 - From company — letter requesting cancellation of certificate.

08/01/01 - E-mailed company and advised it to pay $6 past due P&I and either

pay 2001 RAF or provide date certain it would be paid.

Response due 08/16/01.

08/07/01 - From company via fax - letter dated 08/06/01 advising check for

2001 RAF is enclosed. Awaiting hard copy with payment.
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August 6, 2001 /791 2000 * 2001 )’M% i /&

Paula Isler JEPOSIT DATE
Florida Public Service Commission D12 ' SE .
Capital Circle Office-Ceiter . tP 2 6 2001
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 o 5 5

J A Das

RE: Request for Cancellation of NAS’ Certificate

Dear Ms. Isler:

Pursuant to your e-mail dated 8/1/01, Network Access Solutions encloses a check for
$56.00, which will cover our past due penalty of $6 plus the $50 RAF Fee for 2001.

NAS requests cancellation of our certificate due to our not providing service in Florida
nor did we ever provide service in Florida. Therefore, we have no customers in the state

of Florida to be notified or billed.

If you have any further questions, please call me.

\

Don Sussman
Vice President

Regulatory Affairs/Vendor Relations 8
703-793-5102 (phone) =
208-445-7278 (fax) =
=
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13650 Dulles Technology Drive *+ Herndon Virginia 20171 » 703.793.5000 + 703.793.5010 (fax) * www.nas-corp.com



Paula Isler

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Mr. Sussman:

On August 7th,
being mailed.

Paula Isler

Wednesday, September 19, 2001 10:35 AM
‘dsussman@nas-corp.com'’

Request for cancellation of your ALEC certificate

I received a fax from you which stated that a check for $56 was
Just wanted to let you know that as of today, September 19, it

has not been received, therefore, a docket has not been established to grant
Network Access a voluntary cancellation.

If our records are incorrect and you show a cancelled check, please let me

know as soon ag possible,

Thanks, Paula.
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NETWORK ACCESS SOLUTIONS \ P
13650 Dulles Technology Drive,
Hemdon, VA 20171
Single
Source F A x
Solutions

www.nas-corp.com

Date:  8/07/01

Number of pages including cover sheet:

From: Don Sussman, VP of Regulatory Affairs

To:
0: Paula Isler Phone 703.793.5102 Fax 208.445.7278

Phone:
Fax: 850.413.6503 E-mail: dsussman@nas-corp.com

For your review Reply ASAP Please comment

RE: Request for Cancellation of NAS’ Certificate
We will be sending our check for $56 by US Mail with a copy of this letter.

If there are any problems with transmission, please contact Kathleen Manning (703.793.5159).

Don Sussman

1007 Xvd 92:91 T00Z2/.0/80



August 6, 2001

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
Capital Circle Office Center

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0850

RE: Request for Cancellation of NAS’ Certificate
Dear Ms. [sler:

Pursuant to your e-mail dated 8/1/01, Network Access Solutions encloses a check for
$56.00, which will cover our past due penalty of $6 plus the $50 RAF Fee for 2001.

NAS requests cancellation of our certificate due to our not providing service in Florida
nor did we ever provide service in Florida. Therefore, we have no customers in the state
of Florida to be notified or billed.

If you have any further questions, please call me.

=

Don Sussman

Vice President

Regulatory Affairs/Vendor Relations
703-793-5102 (phone)
208-445-7278 (fax)

Sincere

—\

DS:kpm
Enclosure

13650 Dulles Technology Drive + Hemdon Virginia 20171 + 703.783.5000 + 703.793.5010 {fax) + www.nas-corp.com

2003 Xvd L2:91 1003/.0/80



Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2001 10:00 AM

To: ‘dsussman@nas-corp.com'

Subject: Request for cancellation of your ALEC certificate

alacrule
Dear Mr. Sussman:

In order for the Commission to grant a voluntary cancellation, Network Access
Solutions (NAS) needs to pay a $6 past due penalty and interest balance for
late payments of the 1999 and 2000 RAFs, and either pay the 2001 RAF or
provide a date certain it will be paid.

In addition, NAS needs to comply with Rule 25-24.820(2) (a), (b), f{(c), and (d),
F.A.C. A copy of that rule is attached (WordPerfect document). As soon as
payment and the information required by the above rule is received, I will
open a docket to cancel your certificate. Please respond by August 16, 2001.

Let me know if you have any questions. My telephone number is 850-413-6502
and fax # is 850~-413-6503. Thanks, Paula.



Paula Isler

From: Catherine Smith

Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2001 12:22 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: FW: New filing in undocketed matter

————— Original Message-----

From: Lwilliam@psc.state.fl.us [mailto:Lwilliam@psc.state.fl.us]
Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2001 9:48 AM

To: CCRAIG@psc.state.fl.us; LGIVENS@psc.state.fl.us;
DFORDHAM@psc.state.fl.us; SHOWARD@psc.state.fl.us

Subject: New filing in undocketed matter

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = Network Access Solutions {Sussman) - Letter dated
7/10/01 requesting
cancellation of ALEC Cert 7109. [CCA Note: Forwarded to CMP/Isler for

collection of penalties and interest.]

DOCUMENT PATH =
file://L:\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\01\08703-01

Document Filed 07/17/01

The filing described above is now available in PDF format, and may also be
available in WordPerfect or other formats.

To access it, click on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows
Explorer window. You will see the PDF (Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also
see other versions if they exist. Double-click on the preferred version and
the document will open.

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later
when the reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips
on the How To menu.)

You can also go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUMBER,

typing ctrl-C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste the docket number
into the query line in CMS.

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary.
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July 10, 2001

Blanca S. Bayo, Director

Division of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumark Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

RE: Cancellation of Certificate for Network Access Solutions; Docket # 990737-TX

Dear Ms. Bayo:

Please be advised that Network Access Solutions, the applicant in the above proceeding,
respectfully requests cancellation of our certificate in the state of Florida.

[ am enclosing the original and 1 copy of this letter for filing. Please stamp the extra
copy to reflect the filing date and then return the stamped copy to me in the enclosed
envelope.

[f you have any turther questions, please contact me.

Sincerely,

/% k\/ ,<+°”b’b

Don Sussman

Vice President

Regulatory Aftairs/Vendor Relations
703-793-5102 (phone)
208-445-7278 (fax)

DATE

DOCUMENT NU'MRf -

a

08703 JuL17

13650 Dulles Technology Drive = Hemdon Virginia 20171 « 703.793.5000 » 703.793.5010 (fax) * www.nas-corp.com
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CCA Official Filing:

7/17/01%x*¥x*x*  4:37 PM**x*xxx**Linda Williams******x*x***1

Linda Williams

To: Jackie Knight
Subject: RE: Network Access

Yes, I am. Thanks Jackie.

————— Original Message-----

From: Jackie Knight

Sent: Tuesday, July 17, 2001 4:26 PM
To: Linda Williams

Cc: Ray Kennedy; Barbara Bailey
Subject: RE: Network Access

Ray - Of course we trust you. I think everyone should have access. I believe it will
happen soon. In the meantime, if you want access you can request it from BIP.

Linda- the company paid their RAFs through 2000, but they owe $6 in penalty and interest
for paying late in 1999 and 2000. (I assume you are referring to Network Access Solutions

Corporation) .

————— Original Message-----

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Tuesday, July 17, 2001 4:18 PM
To: Jackie Knight

Subject: FW: Network Access

Jackie can you answer this for me?

----- Original Message-----

From: Ray Kennedy

Sent: Tuesday, July 17, 2001 4:15 PM
To: Barbara Bailey

Cc: Paula Isler; Linda Williams
Subject: RE: Network Access

Linda, you can't pick on me. They won't give me access to the
trust me). Barbara has access and she can check tomorrow.

Barbara, if you are not sure, please check with Jackie Knight.

————— Original Message-----

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Tuesday, July 17, 2001 4:10 PM
To: Ray Kennedy

Cc: Paula Isler

Subject: Network Access

data base (don't think they

Thanks.

Hi Ray. Since Paula is out I'll pick on you. The above company has asked for
cancellation of their ALEC cert. Can you tell me if they are paid up on RAFS and if it's

ok to open the docket to cancel cert? Thanks Ray.



Paula Isler

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Tuesday, July 17, 2001 10:22 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: Network Access Solutions

is requesting cancellation of ALEC cert 7109. Are they paid up?



