: i ORDOCA-TC

AVOID PENR‘LTY AND INYEREST CHARGES. THE REGULA" AS {ENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFOR.E .. 3077 O R b ' /‘
Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment ree Return !
\e/ Florida Public Service Commissi FOR PSC USE ONLY
ission
TATUS: 6 ﬁ (See Filing Instructions on Back of Form) Check# ‘9’3 ?3
gcmal Rsmm & TF612-01-0-R " | W s 50,00 0603002
— Estimated Retu Antonio Gellona, Incorporated ' b
> $
—— Amended Retum 2125 N.E. 25th Street o
Wilton Manors, FL 33305- 1529 004011
ERIOD COVERED: DEPOSIT - DATE $ - !
10012001 TO 12312001 | pyga @~ MAR 08 70 oot ben. 2SR
- ~ Initials of Preparer Z/ZQ
Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed

(Name of Company) (Address) (Ciry/State) (Zip)
eINE :
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMOUNT
L. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) f $ 0.00
A Gross Intrastate Revenue 0.00
5. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* ( 0.00 )

(see "2. Fees" on back)
. TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $ 0.00
~ (Line 2 less Line 3)
5 Regulatory Assessment Fee Due — (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) : 0.00%
B Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 0.00
1. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 0.00
3. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 0.00
AUS _ *See attached copy of return filed.
C{; F; M AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50
=
COM TIIIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPOFE!}T;L‘;‘:D
CTR i i
ECR
9.5CL Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered 0 -
OFC by this Retu
MMS =
SEC _]

Tiwesg ahounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable.

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a
rue and correct statement. | am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a
yublic servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree.

Pre ident
(Signature of Company Official) (Title)
Duncanson & Sheinfeld, P.A. Telephone Number (954 463-1518

(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) FELNo. 65-0573364

PSC/CMU-26 (Rev.11/11/99)
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ARNETTE CREELY DUNCANSON & SHEINFELD, LLP
CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS AND CONSULTANTS

2131 HOLLYWOOD BOULEVARD ¢ SUITE 507
HOLLYWOOD, FLORIDA 33020

TELEPHONE (954) 923-1090
FACSIMILE (954) 923-2785

March 2, 2002

Ms. Jackie Knight

Bureau of Administrative Services
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

Re: Antonio Gellona, Inc.
EIN: 65-0573364 >

Dear Sir/Madam:

Pursuant to our conversation on Friday, March 1, 2002 I am enclosing herewith our client’s check in the
amount of $50 payable to the Florida Public Service Commission.

As I indicated to you during our telephone conversation, the company is still active, but the “telephone
operation” ceased on October 31, 2000.

Should you have any questions concerning the foregoing please feel free to contact me.

Very truly yours,

AREZ E CREELY
an L. Sheinfeld

Certified Public Accou

NSON & SHEINFELD, LLP

ALS/Ig

Enclosures
cel Antonio Gellona, President

Member of the American Institute of Certified Public Accountants and Florida Institute of Certified Public Accountants



DUNCANSON & SHEINFELD, PA.

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS

January 4, 2002

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard

Tallahassee, FL 32399-0876 Q .
Attn: Fiscal @ '

Re: Antonio Gellona, Inc.
EIN: 65-0573364

Dear Sir/Madam: %

We received Form PSC/CMU-26 - Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee
Return for the above referenced company. We filed a final return for this company for the
period 1/1/00 to 12/31/00, a copy of which is attached for your convenience.

The company closed its telephone operation effectively 10/31/00, therefore, please adjust
your records accordingly.

Thank you in advance for your cooperation in this matter.
Respectfully submitted,

DUNCANSON & SHEINFELD, P.A.

Alan L. Sheinfeld ot
Certified Public Accountant

ALS/lg
Enclosures
cc: Antonio Gellona, President

2131 Hollywood Boulevard » Suite 507 = Hollywood, Florida 33020 » Broward (954) 923-1090 » Dade (305) 945-8057 « Fax (954) 923-2785
Member of the American Institute of Certified Public Accountants and Florida Institute of Certified Public Accountants
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Linda Williams

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE:

Ok, thank you maam.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2002 3:44 PM
To: Linda Williams

Subject: RE:

Hi Linda. Open dockets on Verizon and Lizzie's Payphones. Antonio Gellona's docket
(020062-TC) has already been handled. RonCo needs to pay 2002 RAFs or provide date
certain they will be paid. I will attempt collection of RonCo, so do not open a docket on
this one. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2002 11:19 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject:

Hi Paula. We have copies of RAF payments and request for cancellation from:

Verizon Advanced Data

Lizzie's Payphones

RonCo Telecommunications (TF601)
Antonio Gellona (TF612)





