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Linda Williams 0 2 C 8 3 S - 7  
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
RE: 

Ok, thank you maam. 

- - - - -  Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2002 3:44 PM 
To: Linda Williams 
Subject: RE: 

Hi Linda. 
(020062-.TC) has already been handled. 
certain they will be paid. 
this one. Thanks. 

Open dockets on Verizon and Lizzie's Payphones. Antonio Gellona's docket 
RonCo needs to pay 2002 RAFs or provide date 

I will attempt collection of RonCo, so do not open a docket on 

- - - - -  Original Message----- 
From: Linda Williams 
Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2002 11:19 AM 
To: Paula ,Isler 
Subject : 

- 
Hi Paula. We have copies of RAF payments and request for cancellation from: 

Verizon Advanced Data 
Lizzie's Payphones 
RonCo Telecommunications (TF601) 
Antonio Gellona (TF612) 
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