
Ruth Nettles 

To: Paula I s h  
Subject : RE: TG384/Communications Services of Sarasota, Inc. 

We'll do. Thanks. 
- - _ _  -Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Wednesday, November 06, 2002 1 2 ~ 5 6  PM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
Subject: RE: TG384/Communications Services of Sarasota, Inc 

Yes, it i s  OK t o  open t h e  docket. 
request. Thanks. 

Make the effective date the date you received his 

- - _ _  -Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Tuesday, November 05, 2002 4:22 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG384/Communications Services of Sarasota,  Inc.  

Paula, I have copy of payment record, within the l e t t e r  this company is also requesting 
cancellation. I will place this DN 12119-02 i n  our undocketed files for now. I see t h a t  
you are getting a copy of this filing as well, just let me know if we need to open a 
docket on t h i s  one as well. Thanks. 
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