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Ruth Nettles

From: Paula Isler O ?)067 (O"‘PTP

Sent: Friday, June 27, 2003 10:50 AM

To: Ruth Nettles O R l G I NA L
Subject: RE: TJ305/Meridian Telecom, Inc.

Yes, you can open the docket, effective today for all 3 certificates. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Friday, June 27, 2003 10:34 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TJ305/Meridian Telecom, Inc.
Importance: High

Good morning, I have a request to cancell all certifications from Meridian Telecom, Inc.;

they have included payments for TJ305 2002 RAFS w/P&I and 2003 regular RAF payment of $50;
for TG525 they have included 2002 RAFs with P/I and 2003 RAFs of $50; for TX367 they have

included payment for 2002 RAFs with P/I and $50 for 2003 RAFs. Let me know if I can open a
docket to process cancellation request for three certificates.

Thanks Paula,

Ruth
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