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cc: David Brown CAF - 
Subject: RE: TG292 ORIGINAL 
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Very good. I s h a l l  do it i n  t h e  a . m . ,  w i t h  t o d a y ' s  d a t e .  Thanks, P a u l a .  
----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: P a u l a  Isler 
S e n t :  Monday, December 29, 2003 4:17 PM 
T o :  David Brown; Ruth Nettles 
C c :  Ruth N e t t l e s  
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S u b j e c t :  RE: TG292 

Thanks David. Ruth, you can go ahead and open t h e  docket  w i t h  an  e f f e c t i v e  d a t e  of t o d a y .  

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: David B r o w n  
S e n t :  Monday, December 29, 2003 4:11 PM 
T o :  Paula  Isler 
C c :  Ruth Nettles 
S u b j e c t :  RE: TG292 

Paula ,  w e  r e c e i v e d  payment today  i n  t h e  amount of  5 0 . 0 0 .  The check # is 1785.  Thanks and 
have a n i c e  day  . . . . . . . .*.  
----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: P a u l a  Isler 
S e n t :  Monday, December 29, 2003 11:06 AM 
T o :  Ruth Nettles 
C c :  David Brown; Jackie G i l c h r i s t  
S u b j e c t :  RE: TG292 

Ruth, t h e  2003 RAF r e t u r n  does n o t  re f lec t  t h a t  $50 was r e c e i v e d  and RAF System does  n o t  
show t h a t  i t  h a s  been r e c e i v e d .  If David can conf i rm t h a t  payment f o r  t h e  2003 RAF h a s  
been r e c e i v e d ,  t h e n  you can go ahead and open a d o c k e t .  I f  payment h a s  n o t  been r e c e i v e d ,  
1 would s u g g e s t  a docket not be opened. 

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
S e n t :  Monday, December 29, 2003 1 O : Z O  AM 
To:  Paula  Isler 
S u b j e c t :  FW: TG292 

Good morning, Paula .  I ' m  f a x i n g  

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
S e n t :  Monday, December 29,  2003 
T o :  J a c k i e  G i l c h r i s t  
C c :  David Brown 
S u b j e c t :  TG292 

Good morning. I have a memo from 
c e r t i f i c a t e  from A l b e r t o  Babani.  

t o  you s i n c e  I got  Jackie's 

10:18 AM 

CCA/Brown t o  CCA/Flynn w i t h  
J a c k i e ,  can I open a docket  

o u t  of o f f i c e  r e p l y .  

a t t a c h e d  r e q u e s t  t o  
w i t h  David ' s  m e m o ?  
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c a n c e l  

David, I d o n ' t  r e a d  any mention of r e c e i v e d  RAFs f o r  2003 r e c o r d e d  anywhere i n  t h i s  
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' document. Jackie ,  I will f a x  you the memo f o r  your advice and review. 

Thanks I 

Ruth 
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