Ruth Nettleg **********x* Official Filing

1/8/2004 3:56 PM
Ruth Nettles
From:

040020 TS, 0400 | =T
Paula Isler ’
Sent:

Thursday, January 08, 2004 3:50 PM
To: Ruth Nettles; Jackie Gilchrist
Subject:

RE: 00329-04 O R l G | N AL

I have not had any previous correspondence with this company.
2003 with this payment,

They are paid up through
so it is OK to open a docket with an effective date of 12/31/03.
Jackie what do you think?

Original Message
From: Ruth Nettles
Sent: Thursday, 2004 2:34 PM
To: Jackie Gilchrist

Cc: Paula Isler

Subject: 00329-04

January 08,

Good afternoon. Jackie and Paula,

I have entered the payment record for RAFs from HTG
Services in 040000, I wasn't sure if this request for cancellation from company had been
addressed before? I can fax you a copy of the letter, to me it seems that they have asked
for cancellation prior to this letter. In addition, they mention "notice of cancellation"
but I don't see anything else attached to this letter. Thanks.
Ruth
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