REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(Please Type)

Date: 11/15/2004 Docket No.:.

1. Division Name/Staff Name': Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/Isler

2. OPR: | Division Of Competitive' Markets & Enforcement

3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counsel

4. Suggested Docket Title: Aéknowledgment of cancellation of IXC Registration No. Ti431 by Telco Billing, in

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatuves to companies.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any):

6. Check one:

X Documentation is attached.

E Documentation will be provided with recommendation.
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 11/15/2004 at 09:04:47 by PJI

Complete Name: Telco Billing, Inc.

Mailing Name: Telco Billing, Inc.
Company Code: TI431 FEID Number: 54-1723172

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2004 THROUGH 12/31/2004

Reg. Date: 06/14/199¢6 Inactive Date:
Service: IXC - Interexchange Telephone
Received: Actual RAF Form
Status: Satisfied
Amended: No Extension: No
Frozen: No Comments: No
Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date
Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00
RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00
Assessment Due Paid Owe
RAF $50.00 . $50.00 $0.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Interest . $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $50.00 $50.00 $0.00
Period covered: 01/01/2004 through 12/31/2004 RAF rate: 0.0015
Operating rev: $0.00 Interstate rev: $0.0C
Documente: Actual RAF form received on 10/25/2004
Postmarked Trans Date Date Posted-By Dep # Check # Check Amount
10/25/2004 10/25/2004 10/29/2004-VPM KD502 3528442 $50.00

RAF paid KD502 $50.00



Paula isler

From: Paula Isler
Sent: Tuesday, October 19, 2004 10:00 AM
To: 'CWedding@vartec.net'
Subject: RAF Form
r-a |
RAF-TI431-04-

0-R.pdf (23 KB)
This e-mail was sent from The Florida Public Service Commission's Regulatory
Assessment Fee (RAF) System.

Attached document type: Adobe Portable Document Format (PDF)

bt



Paula Isler

From: Dorothy Menasco

Sent: Tuesday, October 19, 2004 9:45 AM
To: Paula isler

Subject: RE: Ti431

Document No. 11163-04 might help you more. :)

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, Octcbexr 19, 2004 8:20 AM
To: Dorothy Menasco

Subject: RE: TI431

Hey Dorothy. I was out yesterday. No don't open a docket yet. I have to contact them if
they did not state when the 2004 RAF would be paid (they either have to pay it or provide
a date certain it will be paid). I need the document number. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Dorothy Menasco

Sent: Monday, October 18, 2004 2:32 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TI431

I have a letter from Telco Billing, Inc. notifying us that they have no subscriber base or
binding contractual agreements and cancellation of its certificate does not adversely
impact any parties. This didn't come with any kind of payment. No currently open
dockets. Please advise re opening a docket to cancel the cert. Thank you!



Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, October 19, 2004 8:27 AM

To: '‘Courtney Weddington'

Cc: Dorothy Menasco .

Subject: RE: Request to Cancel Certificate of Authority for Telco Billing, Inc.

Dear Ms. Weddington:

I was out Friday and Monday, which is why I did not respond to you earlier. Yes, you are
correct, the 2004 Regulatory Assessment Fee needs to be paid prior to staff recommending a
voluntary cancellation. I will e-mail you the 2004 RAF return. As soon as the RAF return
and payment are received, I will establish a docket to grant the voluntary cancellation.
Thanks.

----- Original Message-----

From: Courtney Weddington [mailto:CWedding@vartec.net]

Sent: Friday, October 15, 2004 11:41 AM

To: Paula Isler '

Subject: Request to Cancel Certificate of Authority for Telco Billing, Inc.

Ms. Isler:

Earlier today, I filed a request to cancel the certificate of authority for one of VarTec
Telecom, Inc's subsidiaries, Telco Billing, Inc. (TBI). TBI was granted authority to act
as an operator service provider and billing agent in the State of Florida pursuant to
Certificate No. 3537. The Company has no subscriber base or binding contractual
agreements; therefore the cancellation of its certificate does not adversely impact any
parties.

I understand through a gimilar request made on behalf of Long Distance Wholegale Club,
that a 2004 RAF Return and assessment will need to be filed for TBI. I am hoping you can
forward a copy of the RAF form to my attention, so that I can begin working on this phase
of the process.

The Company is seeking expedited treatment of this cancellation request, so any insight or
assistance you could provide in this regard would be greatly appreciated.

Thanks,

Courtney Weddington
Regulatory Analyst II
VarTec Telecom, Inc.
Voice: (214) 424-1776
Fax: (214) 424-1510

[eny



Telco Billing, Inc.

October 15, 2004

VIA OVERNIGIIT DELIVERY

Blanca S. Bayo, Director
Division of the Commission Clerk and Administrative %ervxceb
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, I'L 32399-0850
. . OO0 O
Re:  Request to Cancel Certificate of Authority
Telco Billing, Inc. {Company Code T1431)

Dear Ms. Bayo:

Telco Billing, Inc. respectfully submits an original and five (5) copies of this letter to
request approval from the Florida Public Service Commission (“Comntission™) to cancel the
Company’s Certificate of Authority.

' By way of background, Telco Billing, Inc was granted authority to act as an operator
service provider and billing agent in the Statc of Flonda pursuant to Certificate Number
3537.

Please note that the Company has no subscriber base or binding contractual
agreements; therefore, the cancellation of its certificate does not adversely impact any parties.
Furthermore, the Company believes that it is in good standing with the Commission having
no delinquent reports or assessments. Tor reasons stated herein, Telco Billing, Inc.
respectfully requests that the Commission authorize the cancellation of the Compiny's
Certificate of Authority.

Acknowledgment and date of receipt of this transmitial are requested. Please date-
stamp the enclosed extra copy of this correspondence and return said copy to the undersigned
in the enclosed, self-addressed and stamped cnvelope. Please direct any questions or
comments regarding this filing to the undersigned directly at (214) 424-1776 or via email ai
cwedding(@vartec.net,

Reqpeuﬁlily eubmltted

: .’\

,\\ ;LLL.l\L ‘uL((,l ""!/7"

Couifiney Weddingion
Regulatory Analyst [f
75 &o{,ﬂ sler™

Kevin Allen
Manaper, Regilatory Affairg DOCUMENT KUMBIR-DAT:

1600 Viceroy Drive l ! ] 6 3 0CT18 2

Dallas. Texus 75233

FPSC-COMMISSION oLEre



Company Code:
Complete Name:
Mailing Name:
Certificate No(s):
Status:
Regulation Date:
Bankruptcy: .

Company Liaison #1:

Title:
Mailing Address:

Physical Location:
Phone:

Fax:

Related Dockets:
951051-TI

971336-T1

001242-T1

MCD Company Information for TI431

Printed on 10/19/2004 at 11:49:07 by PJI

v TI431 |
. Telco Billing, Inc.

Telco Billing, Inc.

3537

Active
06/14/1996

)

Kevin Allen _
Mana%qr, Regulatory Affairs
1600 Viceroy Drive

Dallas, TX 75235-2306

1600 Viceroy Drive

Dallas, TX 75234-2306
214) 424-1000
214) 424-1510

Application for approvhl of assignment of Interexchange

. Telecommunications Certificate No. 3537 from Telco Development

Group, Inc. to Telco Development Group of Delaware, Inc.

Request for approval of name change on Interexchange Certificate
No. 3537 from Telco Development Group of Delaware, Inc. to Telco

. Billing, Inc.

Cancellation by Florida Public Service Commission of
Interexchange Telecommunications Certificate No. 3537 issued to
Telco Billing, Inc. for violation of Rule 25-4.0161, F.A.C.,
Regulatory Assessment Fees; Telecomniunications Companies.



