
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Dorothy Menasco 
Friday, January 14,2005 2:11 PM 
Paula lsler 
RE: TG026 - Robert D. Egozi 

Thanks Paula, Records has in fact received notification of that payment. I'll use your message below to open a 
new docket. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Friday, January 14,2005 11:23 AM 
To: Dorothy Menasco 
Subject: TG026 - Robert D. Egozi 

Fiscal provided me (and notes indicate Records got a copy) of a letter requesting cancellation of PATS 
certificate and included the 2004 RAF return and payment. If you got it, it is OK to open a docket with an 
effective date of 12/3 1/04. Let me know if you got a copy. Thanks. 
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