
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula tsler 
Tuesday, February 22,2005 355 PM 
Dorothy Menasco 
RE: TC606 - Hillsboro Club, Inc. 

It is OK to open a docket with an effective date of today. Thanks. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Dorothy Menasco 
Sent: Tuesday, February 22,2005 354 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: RE: TC606 - Hillsboro Club, Inc. 

Looks like they sent $1 03 total. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Tuesday, February 22,2005 3:42 PM 
To: Dorothy Menasco 
Subject: RE: TC606 - Hillsboro Club, Inc. 

How much is their payment? 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Dorothy Menasco 
Sent: Tuesday, February 22,2005 3:27 PM 
To: Paula Mer 
Subject: TC606 - Hillsboro Club, Inc. 

Hi Paula, 

I have received a payment record for the above referenced company. The letter indicates they are payng 
2004/2005 assessment fee. They are also requesting we cancel their PATS cert, effective immediately. How 
shall I proceed? 


