
STATUS: 

LINEi 
NO, ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION AMUUNT 

1. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) f 

2. 
3. 

Gross Intrastate Revenue 
LESS: Amounts Paid to M e r  Telecommunications Companies* 
(see "2. Fees" on back) 

q-- TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessm ent Fee Calculation 
:MP 

CTR %--- Regula 2, ry Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) 

m___ 

H.% B.-. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

7-- Interest for Late Payment (see "3 Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

(Lime less Line 3) 

8.- TOTAL AMOUNT DUE OPC 
MMS 

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 36436 FLORIDA STATUTE& THIl MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE I$ S50 

RcA -THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED 

SCR 
SEC 9. \ Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered 

by this Return 8TH 



L 

. ., 

DAIQUIRI DEN SIESTA KEY, FL 

February 24,2005 

RE? TG770-04-0-R 

To Whom It May Concern: 

On November 18,2003, we sold the business, Siesta Key Oyster Bar that this telephone 
is in fiont of. Unknowing that we needed to cancel the pay telephone RAF fees, a check 
for the amount of $56 has been enclosed. 

Please cancel this RAF fee beginning this year. You may contact the Siesta Key Oyster 
Bar at 5238 Ocean Blvd., Sarasota, FL 34242, to see if they wish to continue this. 
Thank you for your help in this matter. 

Sincerely, 

b- 

Siesta Key Bar & Grill, Inc. 
5250 Ocean Blvd, 

Sarasota, FL 34207 
Office: 941-346-1664 Fax: 941-346-3170 



From: Paula Isler 
Sent: 
To: 

Thursday, March 03,2005 4:28 PM 
Dorothy Menasco - \ .  

1 .  Subject: RE: TG770 - Siesta Bar/Grill, Inc. ..> I 

->, 

c:a 
c 1 m  

z- 
No, don’t open a docket at this time. I need to contact them about the 2005 RAF. Thanks.?:, w I 

-7J 

-----Original Message----- XE 

Sent: Thursday, March 03,2005 4:23 PM 

L7 From: Dorothy Menasco 

To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG770 - Siesta BadGrill, Inc. 

b> 
4 

We have received a $56 payment record for the above-referenced company. The attached copy of letter 
indicates the business has been sold and requests cancellation of PATS Cert 7699. Please advise if I should 
open a new docket. 

1 


