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Raquel Tully
R TUARRTT A ST

From: Ray Kennedy

Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2005 3:54 PM
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COMMISSION

To: Raquel Tully CLERK
Cc: Dale Buys; Rick Moses
Subject: RE:

Sorry for the delay. All are settlement payments that go to the General Revenue Fund as defined in PAA Order
PSC-05-0103-PAA-TI, issued in Docket No. 040062-T1.

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Wednesday, March 16, 2005 2:16 PM
To: Ray Kennedy

Subject:

Per our conversation, | received to checks from THLG Carrier. One is for $15,150.00 and the other is $5000.00.
Please let me know the break down or if all the money goes to fines.
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