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Dorothy Menasco

From: Paula Isler
Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2005 9:53 AM
To: Dorothy Menasco B
Subject: RE: THOO7 - Milton J. Keifer 2:3; 5
. ENRS
: : I
Yes, open a docket to cancel effective the date you received payment. Thanks. D= — s
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————— Original Message----- =0 =
From: Dorothy Menasco g — *
Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2005 12:10 PM o o
¥e) ]

To: Paula Isler
Subject: THO07 - Milton J. Keifer

We have received a RAF return form ($106) from Milton J. Keifer. The attached letter requests cancellation of
Cert 8491. Please advise if we should open a new docket. Thank you.



