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ORIGINAL 
RaquelTully 

( ; MAR 29 AM g: 52 
From: Paula Isler 


Sent: Monday, March 28, 2005 3:25 PM GOi1rllSSION 

To: Raquel Tully CLERK 

Cc: Ray Kennedy 


Subject: RE: Talk and Pay - Docket No. 041419-TX (TX696) 


Yes, it can be deposited. All $100 goes to PSC Trust Fund for collection costs. Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, March 28, 2005 2:07 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

I received a check for $100.00 from, Talk and Pay Wanting to resolve there docket. Can I deposit this an d if so 
how do you want it broken up 
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Talk And Pay Inc. 
7647 Doubleton Drive 
Del ray Beach. Florida 33446 
561-541-8572 

"This is in response to Order No. PSC-05-0290-PAA-TX issued on March 17, 2005, in 

Docket No. 0414l9-TX. Please consider this a protest and/or an offer of settlement 

to resolve this docket. 


"I was granted CLEC Certificate No. 8248 on December 20, 2002. Although I have had 

the CLEC certificate, I have never provided telecommunications service. Through an 

oversight, the 2002 and 2003 fees were not paid. 


"The company's 2002, 2003, aDd 2004 Regulatory Assessment Fees, including statutory 
late payment charges £or all three years are enclosed. To resolve this docket, the 
'company respectfully requests that the COJIIIIlission accept its proposal to pay future 
Regulatory Assessment Fees by the due date of January 30th of every year and proposes 
a settlement in the amount of $100 in lieu of the $500 fine' imposed. 

"If you need further information, plea'Se do not hesitate to contact me." 

7003 3110 0001 9491 3103 
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