
Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 
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Sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 

Monday, August 07,2006 9:46 AM 

Subject: RE: 
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e 

2. I need more information on the $500 check for Docket No. 060466-Ti (either a company code or company name). 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, August 07,2006 9:19 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

I left these out 
TJ623 $538.27 
Docket 060466 for $500.00 
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