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Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Bob Oliver [bob.oliver@oltronics.net] 
Friday, December 15,2006 4:19 PM 
Paula lsler 
Re: Oltronics, Inc. (TX225) 

1 will complete forms and return along with check for fees due as soon as I receive forms 
from you. 

Thanks 
Bob Oliver 

- - - -  Original Message - - - - -  
From: tlPaula Isler" cPIsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US> 
To: <bob.oliver@oltronics.net> 
Sent: Friday, December 15, 2006 12:28 PM 
Subject: Oltronics, Inc. (TX225) 

> Dear Mr. Oliver: 

> I received your letter requesting cancellation of your CLEC certificate. 
> Before I can recommend a voluntary cancellation, the company needs to 
> pay outstanding Regulatory Assessment Fees. In this case, the company 
> owes $9 in late payment charges ($3 for late payment of the 2001 fee, $3 
> for late payment of the 2002 fee, and $3 for late payment of the 2003 
> fee) plus the 2006 fee. 

> The 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return forms are being mailed today, 
> December 15, 2006, and will become due January 30, 2007. If the company 
> owes the minimum $50 fee, as you've paid in the past, then all you need 
> to do is complete the 2006 return form and return it with your payment 

> 

> 

> of $59. 
> 
> Please let me know when the Commission can expect payment and if you 
> have any questions. Thanks. 
> 
Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 

> Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
> (850) 413-6502-Phone 
> (850) 413-6503-Fax 
> PIsler@psc.state.fl.us 
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Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Friday, December 15,2006 12:28 PM 
'bob.oliver@oltronics.net' 
Oltronics, Inc. (TX225) 

Dear Mr. Oliver: 

I received your letter requesting cancellation of your CLEC certificate. Before I can 
recommend a voluntary cancellation, the company needs to pay outstanding Regulatory 
Assessment Fees. In this case, the company owes $9 in late payment charges ($3 for late 
payment of the 2001 fee, $3 for late payment of the 2002 fee, and $3 for late payment of 
the 2003 fee) plus the 2006 fee. 

The 2006 Regulatory Assessment Fee return forms are being mailed today, December 15, 2006, 
and will become due January 30, 2007. If the company owes the minimum $50 fee, as you've 
paid in the past, then all you need to do is complete the 2006 return form and return it 
with your payment of $59. 

Please let me know when the Commission can expect payment and if you have any questions. 
Thanks. 

Paula Isler 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
(850) 413-6502-Phone 

PIsler@psc.state.fl.us 
(850) 413-6503-Fax 
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Paula lsler 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

NET SatisFAXtion [postmaster] 
Thursday, December 14,2006 125.5 PM 
Paula lsler 
11 page(s) 

Attachments: FAX.TIF 

You have received a new fax. This fax was received by NET SatisFAXtion. The fax is attached to the message. Open 
the attachment to view your fax. 

Received Fax Details _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ - _ _ _ _ _ - - - - - - - - - - _ - - - - - - - _ - - -  
Received On: 12/14/2006 x2:53 PM 
Number of Pages: 1 
From (CSID) : 
From (ANI) : 
Sent to DID: 6503 

Duration of Fax: 0 : 0 0 : 4 6  
Transfer Speed: 14400 

Received Sta tus :  Success 
Number of Errors: 0 
Port Received On: RockForceOCTO+ Port 7 #2  

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

FAX.TIF (11 KB: 
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DCc 14 06 12:49p 

VIA FACSIMILE 
(850) 413-6503 

December 13,2006 

Ms. Paula Isler 
Regulatory Analyst 
Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 

Re: Terminate CLEC Certification TX225 

Ms. Mer: 

Please accept this letter as our official request to terminate our CLEC Certification 
TX225, effective immediately. 

Please contact me with any questions, or if you should require any additional 
Information, I can be reached at (407) 999-0040, e-mail bob.oliver@oltronics.net 

.- , 
Bob Oliver 
President 



MCD Company Information for TX225 

Printed on 12/18/2006 at 10:34:33 by PJI 

Company Code: 
Complete Name: 
Mailing Name: 
Certificate No(s): 
Status : 
Regulation Date: 

Company ahptcr iaison #1: 
Title: 
Mailing Address: 

Physical Location: 

TX225 
Oltronics, Inc. 
Oltronics, Inc. 
5721 
Active 
11/03/1998 
No 
Robert Oliver 
President, Treasurer and Director 
4307 Vineland Road, Suite H-11 

Orlando, FL 3281 1-7374 
4307 Vineland Road, Suite H-1 1 

Orlando, FL 328 1 1-7374 
Phone: 
Fax: 

Related Dockets: 

Application for certificate to rovide a!temative local exchange 
telecommunications service y Oltronics, Inc. 

Request by BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. for approval of 
amendment to interconnection, unbundling, and resale agreement 
with Oltronics, Inc. 

Request by BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. for approval of 
renegotiated interconnection, unbundling, resale, and collocation 
agreement with Oltromcs, Inc. 

Compliance investigation of Oltronics, Inc. for a parent 
violation of Section 364.183(1), F.S., Access to 8ompany Records. 

Re uest for approval of interconnection, unbundling, resale, and 
col 4 ocation agreement between BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. 
and Oltronics, Inc. 

Request for ap roval of amendment to interconnection, unbundling, 
resale, and co ocation agreement between BellSouth 
Telecommunications, Inc. and Oltronics, Inc. 

Request for ap roval of amendment to interconnection, unbundling, 
resale, and co ocation agreement between BellSouth 
Telecommunications, Inc. and Oltronics, Inc. 

Request for ap roval of amendment to interconnection, unbundling, 
resale, and co ocation agreement betyeen BellSouth 
Telecommunications, Inc. and Oltronics, Inc. 

Request for ap roval of amendment to interconnection, unbundling, 
resale, and co ocation agreement between BellSouth 
Telecommunications, Inc. and Oltronics, Inc. 

Request for a roval of amendment to interconnection, unbundling 
resale, and co ocation agreement between BellSouth 
Telecommunications, Inc. and Oltronics, Inc. 

Request for approval of interconnection, unbundling, resale, and 
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000525-TP 

01 1504-TX 

0203 12-TP 
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MCD Company Information for TX225 

Printed on 12/18/2006 at 10:34:33 by PJI 

collocation agreement between BellSouth Telecommunications, Inc. 
and Oltronics, Inc. 
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