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State of Florida 
L 

DATE: March 7,2007 

TO: Blanca S. Bayo, Commission Clerk and Administrative Services Director 

FROM: Paula Mer, Research Assistant, Division of Competitive Markets & Enforcement p,f’  
RE: Docket No. 070144-TC - Request for cancellation of PATS Certificate No. 4956 by 

Michael J. Cooper, effective December 3 1,2006. 

On March 3, 2006, the Commission received a letter dated February 27, 2006, from Mr. 
Cooper requesting cancellation of his pay telephone certificate, along with his payment of the 
2005 Regulatory Assessment Fee. The Division of Competitive Markets & Enforcement was not 
provided a copy of this letter until February 26, 2007. Please document the February 27, 2006, 
letter from Mr. Cooper,. the company’s 2005 Regulatory Assessment Fee return form, and a copy 
of an e-mail between Commission staff (Isler and Brown) be documented in Case Management 
System in Docket No. 070144-TC. Thanks. 

cc: 
Attachment 

Office of the General Counsel (McKay) 
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Paula Mer  

From: David Brown 

Sent: 

To : Paula lsler 

- - - ~  l_l---~-_lll_*lll-"--~-~--~ ---- ~ I_.̂IcIII_ _ _ _ . _ * I ~ ~ - I ~ - _ c  x" , , , , --___ 

Monday, February 26,2007 10:02 AM 

Subject: FW: TF855-06-0-D 

Attachments: tf855-05-0-r-0.pdf 

Paula his telephone number IS 786 256 8709 and his email address IS cooper-m@bellsouth.net 

- ., , , , , , , , -- 
From: David Brown 
Sent: Monday, February 26, 2007 1O:OO AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TF855-06-0-D 

Paula,  I received a telephone call from this gentlemen (Michael Cooper) this morning inquiring about the 
delinquent letter he received. He advised me tha t  he sent in a letter along with the 2005 raf payment 
requesting cancellation of his payphone certificate. I pulled up 2005 and he did send in a letter with the 
payment in February 2006. I advised him tha t  he needed to pay 2006 raf along with p&i and  I sent him a 
2006 raf form. It looks like you did not receive a copy of this cancellation request? I advised him tha t  
someone would contact him concerning the cancellation. Thanks.  

2/26/2007 



TO AVOID PEIMLTY AND NTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2006 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

Florida Public Service Commission 
(See FiLne Instructions on Back of Form) 

TF85 5-05-0-R 
Michael J. Cooper 
4922 S.W. 148th Place 
Miami, FL 33185-4103 

k - v m  

STATUS: 
Actual Retum 
Estimated Retum 
Amended Retum 

- 
- 
- 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 

Check # j ( P 2  0 

$ 2.50 P 

$ .5a 1 

$ 5 i n  . O B  06-03-00 1 
003001 

06-03-001 
00401 1 PERIOD COVERED: 

01/01/2005 TO 12/31/2005 

Initials ofpreparer 
Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed 

(Name of Company) (Address) (CityIState) (Zip) 

LINE 
NO. 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5 .  

6. 

7. 

8. 

9. 

10. 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) 

Gross Intrastate Revenue 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies ( I )  

(see "2. Feesii on back) 
TOTAL, REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0020) 

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (MINIMUM $50.00) 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered by 
this Return 

( I )  These amounts must be intrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back). 
(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a company, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $50 shall be imposed as provided in 

Section 364.336, Florida Statutes. 

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above 
ent I am aware that pursuant to Section 837 06, Flonda Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in  wnting with 
the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree 

!/2</~6, 
(Title) (Date) 

c. 

TelephoneNumber ( ) FaxNumber ( ) 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 

F E I  No 

PSUCMP 026 (Rev 01/05) 



Miami. 2/27/2006 

Florida Public service commission 

My name is Michael Cooper with certificate +# TF855-05-0-R and the rcason is that I sold 
the pay phones to my  brother David Cooper. 


