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Dorothy Menasco 

From: Raquel Tully 

Sent: 
To: Dorothy Menas.cn 

cc: Paula lsler 

Subject: 
Attachments: Effectel E-mail.pdf 

Friday, February 22,2008 8:08 AM 

FW: Repayment of retumed check 

Good Morning, 
I thought you had this 

From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Tuesday, February 19,2008 3:03 PM 
To: Raquel Tully 
Cc: Toni McCoy; Kiwanis Curry; Ray Kennedy 
Subject: RE: Repayment of returned check 

This is the check that was recently returned - the company is just repaying it. I've attached a copy of our original e-mail so that 
you will have the full picture. All $3,500 to the General Revenue Fund. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, February 19,2008 2:40 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: 

Effectek Corp, sent in a check for $3500.00. Please let me know how you would like me to deposit this 

Thanks 

DOCUMENTNO. DATE 

2/22/2008 



From: 
Sent: 
To: 
cc: 
Subject: 

Raquel Tully 
Monday, February 11,2008 1:14 PM 
Paula Mer 
Toni McCoy: Kiwanis Curry 
RE: Payment received 

Paula, 

I just received notice this check was returned . The bank said it was due to insufficient Funds. 

F": Paula Isler 
sent: 
To: Raquel Tully 
cc  Ton1 McCoy; fflwanls Curry 
Ulbject Payment received 

Good afternoon. This is a follow up to our telephone conversation concerning the $3,500 payment you received 
from EFFECTEL CORP (TX832). Please deposit the entire amount in the General Revenue Fund and provide the 
Clerk's office with proof of payment f o r  documenting in Docket No. 060623-TX. Thanks. 

Wednesday, lanuary 16,2008 1:48 PM 
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Dorothy Menasco 

From: Paula lsler 
Sent: Friday, February 22,2008 8:07 AM 

To: Dorothy Menasco 
Cc: Raquel Tully; Marguerite Lockard; Ruth Nettles 

Subject: RE: Payment record for Effectel; ON 01367-08 

Good morning. We originally received a $3,500 check from the company on January 16th. I advised Raquel to deposit the entire 
amount in the General Revenue Fund and proof of payment was provided to CLK for documenting in Docket No. 060623-TX. 
Then on Februaty 1 lth. the $3,500 check was returned. Staff contacted Effectel and the company was advised to repay it. That 
is what this latest check is for - repayment. Please document in CMS in Docket No. 060623-TX. Thanks Dorothy. 

~ 

From: Dorothy Menasco 
Sent: Thursday, February 21, 2008 6:16 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Cc: Raquel Tully; Marguerite Lockard; Ruth Nettles 
Subject Payment record for Effectel; DN 01367-08 

Hi Paula, 

I have received the $3,500 payment record for Effectel. There is no  mention of a docket number or company code on 
it. Please advise if you would l ike this document placed in undocketed matters, or if there is a docket open for this. 

Thank you! 

Dorothy 

DOCUMENTNO. DATE 
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0 Case Assianment and Schedulina Record e 
Section 1 - Bureau o f  Records ComDletes 

Recomnended assignments f o r  hearing 
and/or deciding t h i s  case: 

F u l l  Comnission - Comnission Panel - 
Hearing Examiner - Staf f  - 
Date f i l e d  wi th  CCA: 

I n i t i a l s  OPR 
S t a f f  Counsel 
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24. 
25. 
26. 
27. 
28. 
29. 
30. 
31. 
32. 
33. 
34. 
35.  
36. 
37. 
38. 
39. 

Docket No.060623-TX Date Docketed: 09/14/2006 T i t l e :  Compliance inves t iga t ion  o f  EFFECTEL CORP f o r  apparent 
v i o l a t i o n  o f  Section 364.183(1), F.S., Access t o  Company 
Records. 

Company: EFFECTEL CORP 

Conmissioners 

ALL ED DS AR CT TW 

O f f i c i a l  F i l i n g  Date: 
Last Day t o  Suspend: 

Hrg S t a f f  
Exam 

Expirat ion:  

S t a f f  ~ ~ ~ i ~ ~ ~ ~ t ~  IFOR UPDATES CONTACT THE RECORDS SECTION: (850) 413-6770 

OPR S t a f f  -0 0 Current CASR rev is ion  l e v e l  
Due Dates 

Previous Current 

I I 

I I 3 .  
4. 
5. 
6. 
7. 

S t a f f  Counsel 8. 

18. 
19. 

I I 

I I 

I I 
I I 

I I 

I I 
I I I 

~~ 

I I I 

I I 

I I 

140. I 

Section 3 - Chairman Comletes Assignments are as fo l lows: 

t he  i d e n t i c a l  panel decides the  case. 
Where one Conmissioner, a Hearing Examiner o r  a S t a f f  Member i s  
assigned the  f u l l  Comnission decides the  case. 

PSC/CCA015-C (Rev. 01/03) * COMPLETED EVENTS 

Approved : 
Date: 

FPSC-CGHMISSIOH CLERK 
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("()" ind ica tes  OPR) 

Section 1 - Bureau o f  Records Comulet 

1 x 1  1 x 1  I I 

Docket No.060623-TX Date Docketed: 09/14/2006 T i t l e :  Compliance inves t i ga t i on  o f  EFFECTEL CORP f o r  apparent 
v i o l a t i o n  o f  Section 364.183(1), F.S., Access t o  Company 
Records. 

Company: EFFECTEL CORP 

I - S t a f f  Recomnendation 
Agenda 
PAA Order 
C o n s u m t i n g  Order i f  No Pro tes t  
Close Docket o r  Revise CASR 

NONE 10/12/2006 
NONE 10/24/2006 
NONE 11/13/2006 
NONE 12/07/2006 
NONE 02/28/2007 

OPR S t a f f  

S t a f f  Counsel V McKay, L Tan 
7.  
8. 

I :: 

Recomnended assignments f o r  hear ing 
and/or deciding t h i s  case: 

1 3 .  
14. 
1 5 .  
16. 
17. 
18. 
19. 
20. 
21. 
22. 
23. 
24. 
25. 
26. 
27. 
28. 
29. 
30. 
31. 
32. 

ALL 

X 

F u l l  Commission X Commission Panel- 33. 
Hearing Examiner S t a f f  34. 

35. 
Date f i l e d  w i t h  36. 

37. 
38. 

S t a f f  Counsel 39. 
I n i t i a l s  OPR 

ED DS AR CT TW 

I I 

ED 

I I 
I I 

DS AR I CT TW 

X 

~~ ~ 

I I 
I I 

I I I 

- Hearing Of f i cer (s )  
Commissioners I Hrg I S t a f f  I 

Prehearing O f f i c e r  
Commi ssioners I ADM 

1 Exam I I - I 
Where panels a re  assigned t h e  senior Commissioner i s  Panel Chairman: 
t h e  i d e n t i c a l  panel decides t h e  case. Approved : /m 
Where one Commissioner, a Hearing Examiner o r  a S t a f f  Member i s  
assigned the  f u l l  Commission decides t h e  case. 

Date: 09/19/2006 
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