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Raquel Tully 

From: Ray Kennedy 

Sent: 

To : Raquel Tully 

cc: Paula Mer 

Subject: RE: 

Tuesday, October 16,2007 7:38 AM 

$200 to the PSC Trust Fund and $300 to the General Revenue Fund Please provide the Clerk's Office with proof of payment for 
documenting in Docket No 070477-Ti 

The company has already paid the 2006 RAF 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, October 15, 2007 2:28 PM 
To: Ray Kennedy 
Subject: 

I received a check for $500.00, from US Telesis. Please tell me how to deposit this 

m- 

10/16/2007 



US Telesis 

October 11, 2007 

Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 

RE: To settle past due payment on Docket No. 070477-TI 
For: US Telesis, Inc. IXC certification 
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