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RECENEDFPSC 7

From: Paula isler

Sent: Friday, May 29, 2009 T:WY 29 PM 2¢ Sk

To: Raquel Tully ST S SETE BT IR

Subject: RE: Payment received COI‘S}C&%‘%UN 938 JUN 91 2009

Good afternoon:
Concerning MET Communications, inc. - TX104 - Deposit $200 in the Public Service Commission Regulatory Trust Fund for

collection costs and the bafance of $800 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide the Clerk's Office with proof of payment so
that it can be documented in Docket No. 090191-TX. Thanks.

From: Raquel Tull Q/V\ %
Senrg Fridc:;f M:y’;_g, 2009 12:56 PM _‘#f \ \ O \

To: Paula Isler & T Fond
Subject: QCI) i

- Nne
| received a check for Met Communications, for $1000.00. Please let me know the breakdown. gOO :F
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