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Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Wednesday, April 09, 2008 12:16 PM
To: ‘telvend@aol.com’

Subject: TG740 - TeleVend, Inc.

Attachments: RAF-TG740-07-0-R.pdf; RAF-TG740-08-0-R.pdf

TO: Cliff Wilson, President

Dear Mr. Wilson:

The Commission received your note requesting cancellation of your pay telephone certificate because you stated you have not
installed any payphones. Before the Commission can voluntarily cancel a certificate, any past due and the current year's
Regulatory Assessment Fees must be paid.

As information, the Regulatory Assessment Fee is applicable if a certificate is active for any day during a calendar year even
if a company had no revenues or ever started operations. This means that in addition to the past due 2007 fee and late

payment charges, the 2008 fee is also applicable.

There are two types of cancellation. One is voluntary, which is when a certificate holder writes us and requests cancellation
and pays all Regulatory Assessment Fees. The other is involuntary, and is when a certificate is cancelled on the Commission's
own motion for violation of a rule, order, or statute. If a certificate is cancelled on the Commission's own motion, any unpaid

fees are turned over to collections.

The 2007 and 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fee return forms are attached. Please complete the forms and return them to us
with full payment of $218, which is comprised of the $100 fee for 2007, $15 penalty for 2007, $3 interest for 2007, and
$100 fee for 2008. Please respond by April 24, 2008. Let me know if you have any questions.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax
PIsler@psc.state.fl.us

4/9/2008



Paula Isler

From: Ray Kennedy

Sent: Wednesday, March 05, 2008 1:11 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: FW: New filing in undocketed matter

————— Original Message-----
From: Rick Moses
Sent: Wednesday, March 05, 2008 8:41 AM

To: Ray Kennedy
Subject: FW: New filing in undocketed matter

From: MLOCKARD@psc.state.fl.us[SMTP:MLOCKARD@PSC.STATE.FL.US]

Sent: Wednesday, March 05, 2008 8:40:31 AM
To: Lisa Harvey; Beth Salak; Rick Moses; Sally Simmons; Carolyn Craig; Theresa Walsh
Subject: New filing in undocketed matter Auto forwarded by a Rule

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = TeleVend, Inc. [TeleVend] - MCD update form for Company Code TG740;
handwritten note requests certificate be cancelled since no payphones have been put up.

DOCUMENT PATH =
file://L:\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\08\01625-08

Document ID = 01625-08
Document Filed 03/04/08

The filing described above is now available in PDF format, and may also be available in
WordPerfect or other formats.

To access it, click on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows Explorer window.
You will see the PDF (Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also see other versions if they
exist. Double-click on the preferred version and the document will cpen.

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later when the
reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips on the How To menu.)

You can also go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUMBER, typing ctrl-
C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste the docket number into the query line in CMS.

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary.
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TeleVend, Inc.

Company Code: TG740 ‘ Certificate No(s):

C
C’Jy. %/“%

Physical Location:

PRINT CHANGES BELOW:

% Andre Remy

1440 Atlanta Drive

Holly Hills, FL 32117-1304 ”\\

Mailing Address:

377 Wilbur Avenue, Suite 178 — .

"7 | Swansea, MA' 02777-2426

Liaison Officer(s):

1. Cliff Wilson, President, (508) 675-5474

2. Name, Title, Phone number

>

Fax No(s): (508) 676-6538, Fax 2

E-mail Address: telvend @aol.com

Website Address: http://telvend.com

Federal Employee ID No.: 04-3268439

5
\
)\

\

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The following sectjon is applicable ONLY to companies with “‘d/b/a \s part of their official company name:

Official correspondencc is addressed to the “Mailing Name" of regulate§ companies, which is the last “d/b/a”"
of the company’s official name. Our records reflect the mailing name shown below for your company. If
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oncofipany name.

Mailing Name:
TeleVend. Inc.
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Paula Isler

From: Paula Isler

Sent:  Monday, February 25, 2008 12:03 PM
To: telvend@aol.com’

Subject: TeleVend, Inc. (TG740)

TO: Cliff Wilson, President

Dear Mr. Wilson:

The Regulatory Assessment Fee is applicable if a certificate is active for any day during a calendar year whether a
certificate holder had any revenues or ever started operations. The fee must be postmarked by January 30th to avoid late
payment charges. Our records show the 2007 fee, including late payment charges, has not been received. The fee is .0020
of a certificate holder's intrastate revenues, or the minimum $100, whichever is greater.

If you owe the minimum and if payment is postmarked by February 29, the amount due is $106 ($100 minimum fee, $5
penalty, $1 interest). If you owe the minimum and if payment is postmarked between March 1 and March 30, the amount due
is $112 ($100 minimum fee, $10 penalty, $2 interest). As information, the late payment charges continue to accrue until the

fee is paid.

Delinquent notices have now been mailed and if a certificate holder does not comply with the notice within 15 days,
certificate holders will automatically be fined $500 for a first offense, $1,000 for a second offense, and $2,000 for a third
offense. If TeleVend, Inc. does not comply, it would be automatically fined $500 since this will be its first of fense of the
same Regulatory Assessment Fee rule violation.

If you wish to cancel your pay telephone certificate, please write the Commission a letter requesting cancellation. If you
want a voluntary cancellation, please include payment of the 2007 and 2008 Regulatory Assessment Fees, including any
applicable late payment charges. If full payment is not included, the Commission would still cancel the certificate, it would
just be cancelled on the Commission’s own motion and any unpaid fees would be turned over to collections.

Please let me know if you have any questions or need a copy of the 2007 (and/or 2008) Regulatory Assessment Fee return
form(s). Thanks.

Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850
(850) 413-6502-Phone

(850) 413-6503-Fax
PIsler@psc.state.flus

4/9/2008



