
From: Hal Morrison <halmorrison@hotmail.com>
To: Chris Johnson

Date: 12/8/2017 12:05:11 PM
Subject: Re: Vehicle Purchase (Used : 2011 F450)

Hi Chris,

I emailed Clint at Grundy and his comment follows:

"Okay. Shipper should have cargo insurance and liability insurance naming KWRU as an additional insured."

Can you confirm with the shipping company that they can do this while the vehicle is in their care, custody and control?  When is the truck going to be shipped?  We can add to K.W.'s coverage when you request us to do so.

Regards,

Lou Morrison
C&C Consultants

P.O. Box 701340
St. Cloud, FL 34770-1340
Phone: 888-494-9844
Fax:  407-809-5283

From: Chris Johnson <chris@kwru.com>
Sent: Friday, December 8, 2017 11:31 AM
To: Hal Morrison
Cc: chris@kwru.com
Subject: Vehicle Purchase (Used : 2011 F450)
 
Lou, 
 
KWRU would like to buy this truck in Houston and shipping is included to Key West.   So we are looking at an asset that KWRU pays for and takes ownership of in Houston and it is then shipped to Key West by others.   If I am 
going to own the truck in Houston then I need to know that the truck is insured.   Please advise with regard to this given our current fleet vehicle insurance policy.  
 
Thank you -Chris 
 

 

From: Greg Wright [mailto:greg@kwru.com] 
Sent: Thursday, December 07, 2017 4:27 PM
To: Chris Johnson <chris@kwru.com>
Subject: FW: 2011 F450
 
 
 

From: Sean Babaahmadi [mailto:kksautosale@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Thursday, December 07, 2017 3:22 PM
To: Greg Wright < greg@kwru.com>
Cc: robert@kwru.com
Subject: Re: 2011 F450
 
Please Sign All the Paperwork and Send it to us
Thank you so Much
 
On Thursday, December 7, 2017, 1:53:13 PM CST, Greg Wright < greg@kwru.com> wrote: 
 
 
Shaw,
 
I am contacting you regarding the 2011 F450 that you have been discussing with Rob Derryberry.  We would like to move forward with the purchase of the truck for the discussed purchase price of $39,900 with the shipping 
included.  The name on the title should be the company name (KW Resort Utilities Corp.) and the address and phone number can all be found below in my signature.  Let me know if you need anything else.
 
This is the truck.
https://www.commercialtrucktrader.com/listing/-5000088198/?FLUSH ?
 
 
Thanks,
 
Greg Wright
Vice President

KW Resort Utilities Corp.
6630 Front Street
Key West, FL  33040
(305)295-3301 - Office
www.kwru.com
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