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750214
VIA FEDERAL EXPRESS

Ms. Blanca Bayo, Director

Department of Records & Reporting

Florida Public Service Commission

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard

Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 Py

Re: Application for Rate Increase in Duval, St. Johns and Nasalz
Counties by United Water Florida Inc., Docket No. 980214‘WS
(“Application”™)

m
-3
==

Dear Ms. Bayo:

—t

AN ’fi“?"
\ T

In connection with the above-referenced Application, enclosed are an original"énd
five (5) copies of United Water Florida Inc.’'s Response to Florida Public Service -
Commission Data Request Dated November 16, 1998 (“Response”).

As approved by Bobbie Reyes yesterday, the Response is being sent to you today

- via federal express, together with copies of the summary schedules transmitted via

K facsimile to Ms. Reyes. | would appreciate your distributing the enclosed copies of the
FA Response in accordance with your established procedures.

\PP e United Water Florida has complied with Staff's request fo provide an expedited

sAF e Response. Because of the need to expedite the Response, the Response does not contain
MU = SUpporting documents for a few minor charges. If the Staff needs such documents or any

other additional information or documents, please inform me so that United Water Florida
:TR et
EAG can provide such additional support.
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Ms. Blanca Bayo, Director
November 24, 1998
Page 2

If you have any questions or need additional information concerning this matter,
please do not hesitate to call me.

Sincerely yours,

:!:J e /’ y
“Scott G. Schildberg

SGS/dws
Enclosures

cc:  Mr. Walton F. Hill
Mr. Jack Schreyer (2 sets)
Mr. Gary R. Moseley (2 sets)
Mr. Munipalli Sambamurthi
Mr. Harold MclLean (2 sets)
Ms. Bobbie L. Reyes (via facsimile)

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, R A.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 3220l
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. BEFORE THE FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

In re: Application of United Water
Florida Inc. for Increased Water
and Wastewater Rates in Duval,
Nassau and St. Johns Counties

DOCKET NO. 980214-WS

Date Submitted for
Filing: November 24, 1998

UNITED WATER FLORIDA INC.’S RESPONSE
TO FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
DATA REQUEST DATED NOVEMBER 16, 1998

United Water Florida Inc.’'s response to the November 16, 1998,

data request is set forth on the following pages.

. DOCUMTNT H1MBFR-DATE
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Docket No. 980214-WS ;

SUMMARY OF
RATE CASE EXPENSE
INCURRED THROUGH OCTOBER, 1998
AND PROJECTED THROUGH COMPLETION OF PAA CASE

Actual Projected Total
to 10-31-98 from 11-1-98'
United Water 2 $194,779.98 $36,456.00 $231,235.98
Management
Services, Inc.
(See Schedule 1)
. Guastella $ 15,568.50 N/A $ 15,568.50
Associates, Inc.2
(See Schedule 2)
Martin, Ade, $ 96,007.50 $ 28,992.50 $ 125,000.00
Birchfield &
Mickler, P.A.2
(See Schedule 3) _
Miscellaneous $ 48,137.85 $ 10,000.00 $58,137.85
Fees and Costs? ' '
(See Schedule 4) _
Total $354,493.83 $75,448.50 $429,942.33

For PAA rate case. Does not include cost of hearings or full rate case.

As recorded in the books and records of United Water Florida as of October
31, 1998.

Includes invoices for legal fees through Octo‘ber 31, 1998, but not yet
recorded in United Water Florida books and records.
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Schedule 1

’

UNITED WATER MANAGEMENT & SERVICES, INC.

SUMMARY SHEET*

January 1998

February 1998

March 1998

April 19958

May 1598

June 1998

July 1998

August 1998

September 1998

October 1958

Adjustment?

Month Hours Amount
General 95.00 $ 993.30
General 167.00 $ 9,041.00
General 287.50 $ 15,843.50
McGuire 105.00 $ 6,295.80
General 254.00 $ 16,121.00
McGuire 156.00 $ 9,353.76
General 263.00 $ 17,126.00
McGuire 200.00 $ 11,992.00
General 467.50 $ 27,896.50
McGuire 80.00 $ 4,796.80
Sharpe 33.00 S £76.50
General 60.50Q $ 4,242.00
McGuire 160.00 $ 5,593.60
Sharpe 36.00 $ 738.00
General 67.00 $ 4,987.00
McGuire 200.00 $ 11,992.00
General 220.50 $ 11,365.50
McGuire 152.00 $ 9,113.92
General 235.00 $ 13,601.00
McGuire 80.00 $ 4,7%6.80
General 52.00 $ 2,236.00
General 46.00 $ 1,978.00
TOTAL 3,318.00 $194,779.98

Attached is a schedule of activity codes, copies of reports by
month identifying hours worked by individual by activity and
the applicable charge, and copies of monthly summaries by
individual. Each individual’s rate can be determined by
dividing the amounts by time (e.g., $172.00 + 4.00 =
$43.00/hour) .

Also attached are schedules for F. McGuire and P. Sharpe and
related invoices.

Charges for certain hours for M. Egan-Long were originally
classified to expense.

- 0003



ACTIVITY CODES

RATE DEPARTMENT ACTIVITY CODES
BROAD ACTIVITY DESCRIPTIONS

DESCRIPTION

Detemmine financial position of operating units
& prioritize rate filings

Strategic planning meetings for rate ' case
filings-team selection, determine & prepare
needed studies, set time table

Gather  financial & operations data for
operating unit, develop pro forma income &
balance sheet adjustments

Prepare testimony and exhibits for rate case
filings

s -
g:os Time Reporting Codes:
FINANCIAL POSITION ANALYSIS
Mg00 - . Financial Analysis:
RATE CASE PREPARATION & FILING
M2e10 Studies & Prep:
Ma12 Pro Forma Adjustments:
Mo14 Testimony Prep:
M916 Consultant Supervision:

REGULATORY PROCESS
M930 Hearings
Mo32 Data Requests:
M933 Review of Other Testimony:
Ma34 Settlement ineetings:
Me36 Rebuttal Testimony:
Me38 Briefs:
Ma39 Case Resolution:
Mo40 Decision Implementation:

h:wpdata\procedur\TlMENTRY.DOC

Work associated with the preparation of
studies by outside consultants (COS, ROR,

depreciation, etc.), including: data gathering,
oversight & review of reports.

Prep for & attend public & evidentiary hearings
for rate case matters

Respond to data requests and interrogatories

Review testimony & exhibits and prepare data

requests & responses from Commission staff &
intervenors.

Prep for & attend settlement meetings

Prep of rebuttal testimony and exhibits for rate
case filings

Prep of initial & reply briefs for rate case filings

Post hearing issue discussion and analysis
(intemal & external)

Implementation of tariffs and write-up rate case

summary; rate case follow-up, including
phased rate filings

0004
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A941

Mo42

Motions & als:

Consultant Management:

Drafting & of motions & appeals, and
associated fees

Work associated with the oversight and '
management of outside rate case consultants

OTHER REGULATORY & DEPARTMENT MATTERS

Me50

Mes2
Mgs4

Mo56
1958

Mose

Mg80
Mg80

Planning & budgeting:

Record Management:

Tariffs:

Requlatory Relations:

Attend Meetings:

General:

Not Worked:

Intemal planning & budgeting. Internal staff
meetings

Rate related special projects

Filing, organization and management of

records .

Preparation and maintenance of tariffs

Communication & liaison with regulatory
agencies, intervenors & other parties

Internal planning & project/task force meetings;
extenal meetings with regulators and others.

General and other rate related matters

Holiday, vacation, sick and other time not in
office
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Bus Unit  |0S52 Dec-97

Empiid  [(Al

Actlv All

Alloc Fact {(All

Project ID |T052081

Sum of Amount Level Chamged

Oept Name Q52|Grand Total
i 610|Hlll,Walten F 993.3 993.3

810 Total 993.3 993.3

Qrand Tetal 983.3 $93.3

0006



Name Dept} Activity| ProjectID]| Amount [Level Charged [Alloc Factor | Time
Hill, Walten £ 810 | M910 TQ52081 $93.30 052 4.0000] 5.00
Tatal $ 99330 5,00
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(Bus Unit {052
mplid (All)
‘!&my (Al
Alloc Fact [{(All)
Project ID | 7052981
Sum of Amount Level Charged
Dept Name 052|Grand Total
800iEgan-Long,Mary L 3,354.00 3,354.00
laculio,Robert J 396.00 396.00
Roupp,Gregory A 462.00 462.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A 341.00 341.00
Schreyer,Jack 4,4838.00 4,488.00
800 Total 9,041.00 9,041.00
Grand Total 9,041.00 9,041.00

Ferauany, 193¢
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FeBRUALY, 1998

[ Name Dept| Activity| Project ID| Amount |Level Charged [Alloc Factor | Time
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | MSQ0 | T052981 172.00 52 1 4.00
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800} MS10 | T052881 172.00 52 1 4.00
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | M912 | T052981 3010.00 52 1| 70.00

laculio,Robert J 800 | M910 | T052981 396.00 52 1 3.00
Roupp,Gregory A | 800 | M850 | T052981 462.00 52 1 7.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M910 | T052981 310.00 52 1] 10.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M954 | T052981 31.00 52 1 1.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M900 | T052981 792.00 52 1] 12.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 { MS10 | T052981 1584.00 52 1] 24.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M912 | T052981 2112.00 52 11 32.00
Total $9,041.00 167.00

0009



MAcH | 1998

IBus Unit |052
‘mplid (AlD
ctivity  {(AlD
Project ID | T052981
Alloc Fact [(All)
Sum of Amount Level Charged
Dept Name 052{Grand Total
610|Hill,Walton F 834 834
610 Total 834 834
800{Egan-Long,Mary L 5246 52486
Gradilone,Frank 858 858
lacullo,Robert J 396 396
Roberts,Kenneth E 1452 1452
Schlissel,Jennifer A 325.5 325.5
Schreyer,Jack 6732 6732
800 Total 15009.5 15009.5
Grand Total 15843.5 15843.5

00010



MACH, 1998

b Name Dept| Activity|Project ID | Amount |Level Charged |Alloc Factor | Time
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | MS00 |T052981 1634.00 52 1] 38.00
QEgan-Long,MaryL 800 | M910 {T052981 172.00 52 11 4.00
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | M912 |T052981 3440.00 52 1] 80.00
Gradilone,Frank | 800 | M$10 |T052981 858.00 52 1} 13.00
Hill,Walton F 610 | M810 [T052981 834.00 52 1] 6.00
facullo,Robert J | 800 | M910 {T052981 396.00 52 11 3.00
Roberts,Kenneth E | 800 | M810 [T052981 1452.00 52 1] 22.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M310 [T052981 31.00 52 1 1.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M940 T052981 139.50 52 1| 4.50
Schiissel,Jennifer A| 800 | MS54 (T052981 155.00 52 1] 5.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | MS00 |T052981 528.00 52 1| 8.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M910 [T052981 1188.00 52 1] 18.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M912 [T052981 5016.00 52 1f 76.00
Total $15,843.50 278.50

00011



pivot table

{Bus Unit

052

‘mplid

(All)

ctivity

(Al

Alloc Fact [(All)

Project ID 17052981

Sum of Amount

Level Charged

Dept Name 052 Grand Total
610(Hill,Walton F 695 695

610 Total 695 685
800|Egan-Long,Mary L 2494 2494
Gradilone,Frank 3498 3498
lacullo,Robert J 792 792

Roberts Kenneth E 2838 2838
Schlissel,Jennifer A 62 62
Schreyer,Jack 5742 5742

800 Total 15426 15426
Grand Total 16121 16121

Page 1

AL, 1998
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APRIL, 1998

®

v Name Dept| Activity| ProjectID| Amount | Level Charged | Alloc Factor| Time
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | M912 | T052981 2494.00 52 1] 58.00
Gradilone,Frank | 800 | M912 | T052981 3498.00 52 1] 53.00
Hill,Walton F 610 | M910 | T052981 417.00 52 1] 3.00
Hill,Walton F 610 | MS10 | T052981 278.00 52 1] 2.00
lacullo,RobertJ | 800 | M910 | T052981 792.00 52 1| 6.00
Roberts,Kenneth E | 800 | M910 | T052981 2838.00 52 1l 43.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M810 | T052981 31.00 52 1] 1.00
Schlissel, Jennifer A| 800 | M954 | T052981 31.00 52 1] 1.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M800 | T052981 594.00 52 1 9.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M910 | T052981 1716.00 52 1] 26.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M912 | TO052981 2244 .00 52 11 34.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M914 | T052981 1188.00 52 1] 18.00
Total $16,121.00 254.00
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[Shl)

lays Unit |052

plid (Al

ivity (A}

Alloc Fact [(AlD

Project ID | 7052981

Sum of Amount

Level Charged

Dept Name 052|Grand Total
610|Hill;Walton F 695.00 695.00

610 Total 695.00 695.00
800|Candelmo,Albert 528.00 528.00
Egan-Long,Mary L 1,290.00 1,290.00
Gradilone,Frank 5,676.00 5,676.00
jacullo,Robert J 396.00 396.00
Roberts,Kenneth E 2,772.00 2,772.00
Schiisse!,Jennifer A 93.00 93.00
Schreyer,Jack 5,676.00 5,676.00

800 Total 16,431.00 | 16,431.00
Grand Total 17,126.00 | 17,126.00

MAT, 1998
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MAT. 1998

| Name Dept| Activity| Project ID| Amount | Level Charged | Alloc Factor| Time
Candelmo,Albert | 800 | M914 | T052981 132.00 52} 1] 2.00
. Candelmo,Albert | 800 | MS60 | T052981 396.00 52 1} 6.00
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | MS14 | T052981 1290.00 52 1| 30.00
Gradilone,Frank | 800 | M912 | T052981 5676.00 52 1] 86.00
Hiill, Walton F 610 | MS10 | T052981 695.00 52 1] 5.00
lacullo,Robert J 800 | M910 | T052981 396.00 52 1 3.00
Roberts,Kenneth £ | 800 | M910 | T052981 2772.00 52 1] 42.00
Schiissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M910 | T052981 93.00 52 1 3.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | MS00 | T052981 792.00 52 1] 12.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M910 | T052981 1188.00 52 1l 18.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 { M912 | T052981 1452.00 52 1] 22.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | MS14 | T052981 224400 52 1l 34.00
Total $17,126.00 263.00

00015




JUNE | 1998

[Bus Unit |052
=mplid (All)
Activity  [(Al)

Alloc Fact |(All)

Project 1D |T052881

Sum of Amount Level Charged
Dept Name 052|Grand Total
610|Grossman,Cari H 417.00 417.00
Hill, Walton F 556.00 556.00
610 Total 973.00 973.00
800|Egan-Long,Mary L 3,182.00 3,182.00
Gennari,Mark A 792.00 792.00
Gradilone,Frank 6,204.00 6,204.00
Roberts,Kenneth E 1,188.00 1,188.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A 1,565.50 1,565.50
Schreyer,Jack 6,336.00 ; 6,336.00
Stryker,Alfred E 7,656.00 7,656.00
800 Total 26,923.50 | 26,923.50
Grand Total 27,896.50 | 27,896.50

00016



JuNe, |

178

| Name Dept| Activity| Project ID| Amount |Level Charged |Alloc Factor | Time
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | M914 | T052981 3182.00 52 1} 74.00
Gennari,Mark A | 800 | M912 | T052981 792.00 52 11 12.00
Gradilone,Frank | 800 | M914 | T052981 6204.00 52 1] 94.00
Grossman,CarlH | 610 | M910 [ T052981 139.00 52 11 1.00
Grossman,CartH | 610 | M952 | 7052981 278.00 52 1} 2.00
Hill, Walton F 610 { MS30 | T052981 556.00 52 11 4.00
Roberts,Kenneth E | 800 | M910 | T052981 1188.00 52 11 18.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M910 | T052981 914.50 52 1| 29.50
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M814 | T052981 341.00 52 11 11.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 [ M954 | T052981 62.00 52 1 2.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A} 800 | M3956 | T052981 248.00 52 1 8.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | MS14 | T052981 5676.00 52 1| 86.00

Schreyer,Jack 800 | M@g16 | T052981 660.00 52 1] 10.00 '
Stryker Alfred E | 800 | M814 | T052981 7656.00 52 11116.00
Total $ 27,896.50 467.50

00017



[Bus Unit 052

aplid

(AID

(Al

QMY
oc Fact {(AlD

{Project ID [T052981

Juey 1998

Sum of Amount Level Charged
Dept Name 052|Grand Total
610|Hill, Walton F 1,071.00 1,071.00
610 Total 1,071.00 1,071.00
800|Egan-Long,Mary L 940.00 940.00
Gradilone,Frank 292.00 292.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A 187.00 187.00
Schreyer,Jack 1,752.00 1,752.00
800 Total 3,171.00 3,171.00
Grand Total 4.242.00] 4,242.00

00018



e
JuLy, 1998

Name Dept| Activity [Project ID | Amount |Level Charged [Alloc Factor | Time
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | M954 | T052981 940.00 52] | 1] 20.00
Gradilone,Frank | 800 | M914 | T052981 292.00 52 1] 4.00
Hill,Walton F 610 | M910 | T052981 1071.00 52 1] 7.00
.Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M914 | T052981 153.00 52 11 4.50
Schiissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M932 | T052981 17.00 52 1] 0.50
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M956 | T052981 17.00 52 1] 0.50

. Schreyer,Jack 800 | M914 | T052981 1752.00 52 1] 24.00
Total $4,242.00 60.50

@ | 00019



Bus Unit  |052

Emplid (Al

Activity (AlD

Alloc Fadt [(AID

Project 1D [T052981

Sum of Amount Level Charged
Dept Name 052|{Grand Tolal
€10|Hill, walton F 1,377.00 1,377.00
610 Total 1,377.00 1,377.00
800|Schlissel, Jennifer A 544.00 544.00
Schreyer.Jack 3,066.00 3,066.00
800 Total 3,610.00 3,610.00
Grand Total 4,887.00 4,987.00

/Avguﬁ’ }QQ”

August M&S Bi
July Time
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AUGUST, 1998

| Name Dept| Activity | Project ID| Amount |Level Charged |Alloc Factor | Time
_  Hill,walton F 610 | M910 | T052981 765.00 52 1] 5.00
Hill,walton F 610 | M938 | T0S52881 612.00 52 1| 4.00
chlissel, Jennifer A| 800 | M914 | T052981 442.00 52 1113.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M952 | T052981 68.00 52 1} 2.00
Schiissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M954 | T052981 34.00 52 1} 1.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | MS10 | T052981 292.00 52 1| 4.00
Schreyer,Jack | 800 [ MS14 | T052981 1022.00 52 1114.00
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M932 | T052981 1752.00 52 1)24.00
Total $4,987.00 67.00
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SEPTEMBER,, 1798

[Bus Unit |052
‘S mplid (All)
‘lme (Al
lloc Fact [(All)
Project ID {T052981
Sum of Amount Level Charged
Dept Name 052{Grand Total
6101{Hill,Walton F 278.00 278.00
610 Total 278.00 278.00
800(Egan-Long,Mary L 4,902.00 4,902.00
Gennari,Mark A 264.00 264.00
Gradilone,Frank 264.00 264.00
Hill, Walton F 278.00 278.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A 759.50 758.50
Schreyer,Jack 4,620.00 4,620.00
800 Total 11,087.50 | 11,087.50
Grand Total 11,385.50 | 11,365.50
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JEPTENBER, 1998

| Name Dept|Activity|Project ID | Amount |Level Charged |Alloc Factor | Time
gan-Long,Mary L | 800 | MS32 |T052981 4902.00 52 11114.00
,EGennan‘,MarkA 800 | M932 |T052981 264.00 52 11 4.00
Gradilone,Frank | 800 | M932 |T052981 264.00 52 11 4.00
Hill, Walton F 610 | M930 |T052981 278.00 52 11 2.00
Hill,Walton F 800 | M9S59 [T052981 278.00 52 11 2.00
Schiissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M932 |T052981 713.00 52 1} 23.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A} 800 | M954 |T052981 46.50 52 1 1.50
Schreyer,Jack | 800 | M932 |T052981 4620.00 52 1] 70.00
Total $11,365.50 220.50
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Bus Unit

052

Emplid

(AlD)

ivity

(AlD

loc Fact

(All)

Project ID

T052981

OCToBeR, 1978

Sum of Amount Level Charged
Dept Name 052|Grand Total
800|Egan-Long,Mary L 2,752.00 | 2,752.00
Gennari,Mark A 2,310.00 2,310.00
Gradilone,Frank 3,234.00 3,234.00
Hill, Walton F 834.00 834.00
Schlissel,Jennifer A 775.00 775.00
Schreyer,Jack 3,696.00 3,696.00
800 Total 13,601.00 | 13,601.00
Grand Total 13,601.00 | 13,601.00
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OCTOBER,, 1998

°

Name Dept| Activity| Project ID| Amount |Level Charged |Alloc Factor | Time
Egan-Long,Mary L | 800 | MS32 | T052981 2752.00 52 1] 64.00
Gennari,Mark A | 800 [ M932 | T052981 2178.00 52 11 33.00
Gennari,Mark A | 800 [ M958 | T052981 132.00 52 11 2.00
Gradilone,Frank | 800 | MS32 | T052981 3234.00 52 11 48.00
Hill, Waiton F 800 | M958 | T052981 278.00 52 11 2.00
Hill, Walton F 800 | M960 | T052981 556.00 52 11 4.00
Schiissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M932 | T052981 728.50 52 1] 23.50
Schlissel,Jennifer A| 800 | M854 | T052981 46.50 52 1 1.50
Schreyer,Jack 800 | M932 | T052981 3696.00 52 1] 56.00
Total $13,601.00 235.00
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Report 1D: . ~' CT801 PeopleS~" “nancials Page No--. 1
JOURNAL lY DETAIL RunD +Nav.1908
Run T 11:32:18 AM

Unit: 052 Ledger: ACTUALS Foreign Cumancy: USD
JoumaliD: MSBILLAD) Sourcs; JES Rete Typa:

Data: 30.Apr. 1898 Reversal: None Effoctive Date; 30.Apr. 1906
Opr ld: FERRYB Reversal Date: Exchange Rate: 1.000000
Descripion:  To defar MLS fees relaled 1o raie cane thet wese previously sxpensed.

13

......

2,236.00 USD 2,236,00 USD
Description: RA-Deferred Rate Case
2 923010 o059 099 1.000000 -805.00 USD -805.00 USD
Description: 0/5-M2S Fees
3 923015 0999 099 " 1.000000 -1,431.00 USD -1,431,00 USD
Description: 0/S-MAS Fees-Waslewater
o
o
o
N
N
Totasls for Joumal; MSBILLADS Total Lines: 3 Tolal Base Debits: 2,236.00 Total Base Credits: 2,238.00

End of Report



Report 1D, 7801 People ‘anclals Page 1
. JOURNAL. .Y DETAIL Run .Nov.1889
Run T 11:40:40 AM

Unit: 082 Ledger: ACTUALS Foreign Currency:  USD

. JournalID: MSBILOSA Source; JES Rate Type:
i Date: 18.Jun. 1998 Reversa!: None Effective Date: 16.Jun,1998
i Opri: HARRISR Reversal Dale;

Desciiption:  To cotrect May chgs 36% Water 64%

e

’

1 186400 T052981( 9993 099 1.000000 1,978.00 USD \/ 1,878.00 USD
Description: RA-Defetred Rate Case
2 923010 9999 099 1.000000 -712.08 USD -712.08 USD
Description: 0/S-MAS Feaes
/'
t 3 923015 8999 099 1.000000 -1,265.92 USD -1,265.82 USD
Description: 0/S-M&S Fees-Waslewaler
g
- '
=
o
o
o
N
~J
" ~otals for Journal: MSBILASA TotalLlnes: 3 Total Base Debits: 1,878.00 Total Base Credits: 1,978.00

End of Report



F. MCGUIRE SUMMARY'

. Time_ Period Hours Amount
February 1998
N/A
March 1998
3-15 25.00 $ 1,499.00
3-22 40.00 2,398.40
3-29 40.00 2,398.40
105.00 $ 6,295.80
April 1998
4-5 40.00 $ 2,398.40
4-12 36.00 2,158.56
4-19 40.00 2,398.40
4-26 40.00 2,398.40
156.00 $ 9,353.76
May 1998
5-3 40.00 $ 2,398.40
5-10 40.00 2,398.40
5-17 40.00 2,398.40
5-24 40.00 2,398.40
5-31 40.00 2,398.40
200.00 $11,992.00
June 1998
6-21 - 40.00 $ 2,398.40
6-28 40.00 2,398.40
80.00 $ 4,796.80
July 1998
. 7-5 40.00 $ 2,398.40
7-12 40.00 2,398.40
7-19 40.00 2,398.40
7-26 40.00 2,398.4¢0
160.00 $ 9,593.60
August 1998
8-2 40.00 $ 2,398.40
8-9 40.00 2,398.40
8-16 40.00 2,398.40
8-23 40.00 2,398.40
8-30 40.00 2,398.40
160.00 $11,992.00
September 1998
9-6 40.00 $ 2,398.40
9-13 32.00 1,918.72
S-20 40.00 2,398.40
9-27 40.00 2,398.40
152.00 $ 9,113.92
October 1998
10-4 40.00 $ 2,398.40
10-11 40.00 2,398.40
80.00 $ 4,796.80
TOTAL 1133.00 $67,934.68
. : Done on a weekly basis. Summary includes all time for a week

in the month which contains the week ending date.

00028



United Water Management & Servica Co., In¢.

Week
Employes: Frank McGuire Ending
Charge 15-Mar-98 »/
UWMgmnt&Sve M &S Code to
Financial Analysis MS00 305 15
Rate Case Prep
M910
Pro Forma Adj.  M912 (Wl-FuoiDr) T052931 25
Testimony Ma14
Supv of Consitnt M916
Regq. Process
Hearings/Meetings MS30
Data Requests MS32
Review testimony  MS33
Settlement Mtgs Ma34 -
Rebut. Testimony  M936 T002971
Briefs M938 T002971
implement Decis.  MS40 T002971
Consuit Mgmnt Mg42
_ iy '
< Other
. - N Plan. & Budgeting  MS50
“\ \\ Special Projects M52
/\'\&/ 5 Record Mgmnt M954
\ (\/ Tariff Admin. Ma56
J \\ Reg. Relations M9s8
\ General Ms80 -
Vacation mS80
Holiday Ma80
Sick Mg8o
Total Hours
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Employee ~ Frank McGuire
Company " United Water Management & Services In

Activity Week Ending Week Ending
3/22/98 Y 3Bygs /
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‘mployee:  Frank McGuire
.mpany: United Water Management & Services Inc

Activity Week Endin
4/5/98 '
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C\MYDOCU 1\EXCEL\[TIMESHT XLS]Sheet1
Employee Frank McGui

‘npy UltthM agement & Services Inc

Activity Week Ending
: 4/12/98 v
Mg10

Rate Case Number
T052981  (Florida) 36 @ §9.9 =" _2.158.5¢6

TQ84971 (Indiana) 4

T052981
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. C:\MYDOCU~1\EXCEL\[TIMESHT.XLS]Sheet1
Employee: - Frank McGuire

Company: United Water Management & Services Inc

Activity Week Ending
. 4/19/98 vV
MS10
Rate Case Number
T052981 (Florida) - 40

TO94971  (Indiana)

T052981
Total 40
@ 599
3239840
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. C:\MYDOCU~1\EXCEL(TIMESHT.XLS]Sheet1
Employee:  Frank McGuire

Company:  United Water Management & Services Inc

Activity Week Ending
: 4/26/98
Me10
Rate Case Number
T052981 (Florida) 40

TO94971 (Indiana)

T052981

Total 40
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Employee: Frank McGuire

Company: United Water Management & Services Inc

Week Ending
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Employee: Frank McGuire
Company: United Water Ma

hagement & Services Inc

Activity Rate Case  Company Week Ending
Charge No. 6/21/98
© 'M910
T052981 __ (Florida) 40 @ S99 = 239840
TO94971  (Indiana) L
T027981 (Delaware)
Tot CHARGE CODES 40
BUSINESS UNIT OS&
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COSTTYPE 020
FUNCTION / g
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Employee: Frank McGuire
Company: United Water Management & Services Inc
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Week Ending
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Employee: Frank McGuire
Company: United Water Management & Services Inc

Activity Rate Case  Company Week Ending
Charge No. 715198
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Enited Water Management & Services Inc
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United Water Management & Service Co.
Regulatory Business Department
Employee: Frank McGuire
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United Water Management & Service Co,
Regulatory Business Department
Employee: Frank McGuire

Time Sheet

" Week
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United Water Management & Service Co.
Regulatory Business Department
Employee: Frank McGuire
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P. SHARPE SUMMARY'

‘ Time Period Hours Amount
February 1998
N/A
March 19598
N/A
April 1998
N/A
May 1998
5-3 10 $ 205.00
5-10 20 410.090
5-24 3 61.50
33 S 676.50
June 1998 ‘
6-7 20 $ 410.00
6-19 16 328.00
36 S 738.00
July 1998
N/A
August 1998
N/A .
September 1998
®
October 1998
N/A
TOTAL 69 $_1,414.50
' t Done on a weekly basis. Summary includes all time for a week

in the month which contains the week ending date.
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Qe PLEASE FAX. MAIL OR
QELIVER YOUR TIME

Mmmso IT ARAIVES BY
201-599-0548 » FAX; 201-599-2423 AY MORM
A L.AVE A COPYW‘TH YOUR SUPERVISO&

WEEX £} ENDING r
SUNBAY
AY YR, ' -
EMPLOYEE NAME /L j 67 il -
4
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agren o pay Brya,{c Sla.‘fng a ccnvorsm fee.
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1. Wae cenify the hours indicaled are correct.

2. Bryant will Inveica for laber of above sarson which wa agree o 2ay
upon receipl, i 1his aceount s referred (s an atterray fer collectes,
we 3gree lo pay all ceassnatle lagal costs and alicrreys 18935, a3
well 23 a firarce charge of 1 1/2% per mentn{13% por yoar).

-3 Autnerized cvertma will be hilled al ima and one half.
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SCHEDULE 2

GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, INC.
FEES AND COSTS

Fees and Costs
incurred through October 31, 1998

End of Billing Period

01-31-98
02-28-98
03-31-98

04-30-98
05-31-98

TOTAL

Amount

$ 774.00

5,651.50

740.00

954.00

7.549.00

$15,668.50

00062
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GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES e, |

‘ UTILITY MANAGEMENT @ VALUATION © RATE CONSULTANTS

D E c E ' v E 210 WINTER STREET, SUTTE 101

WEYMOUTH, MA 22183

- TEL (617
JUN 11 1008 0 Frxiam oy

Robert J. lacullo , June 3, 1998
United Water Management and Services R.J. IACULLO Rate Case
200 Old Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640 Period Ended: 5/31/98

Work in progress on used and useful study. Prepare report and
schedules, discus,sion with company and attomey. 82 <y

Do ST

: Hourly
Staff Charges Rate Hours Amount
. Principal | $200 33.00 $6,600.00
: Associate 165 0.00 0.00
Principal Il 145 0.00 0.00
Engineer 110 5.00 550.00
Financial/Acctng 110 0.00 0.00
Technician 65 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38 10.50 399.00
Subtotal 4850 $7,549.00 —
Expenses:
Telephone
Travel RECEIVED
Room & Board
Reproduction JUN 18 1998
Federal Express / UPS
Other PROCUPEMENT DEPT.
\
U )
. Amount Due . $7,549.00

00063
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GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, wc

UW#—W@ |

UTILITY MANAGEMENT * VALUATION ¢ RATE CON

Robert J. lacullo

United Water Management and Services

200 Old Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640

E @ E ﬂ v E P.O. BOX 371, 83 MAIN STREET
e ey
MAR 05 1998 U PAX: (908) 234-2787
R.J. IACULLO March 3, 1998

Rate Case

Period Ended: 2/28/98

- .~

and useful study and related

Preliminary work on u testxmony
. = \\ \\ Ao \ 5 ‘
AR FL
v Vooa= il W (el
-.‘.o\ ’_// ( rLLA'a :,.’,,
. -~ P L
/ A
c Nz Hourly
Staff Charges Rate Hours Amount
® Principal | $200  20.00 $4,000.00
Associate 165 0.00 0.00
Principal Il 145 0.0 0.00
Engineer 110 8.25 907.50
Financial/Acctng 110 1.50 165.00
Technician 65 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38 3.00 114.00
Subtotal 32.75 $5,186.50
Expenses:
Telephone
Travel 100.50
Room & Board 249.00
Reproduction
Federal Express / UPS 15.50
Other
2 2095 3
Lo 085 Amount Due $5,551.50 f/
L P
- 196 %00 A U @
L 2o, TOS2 9
\/(l:‘:g 33y 5T T 00064

MASSACHUSETTS OFFICE: 210 WINTER STREEL SUTTE 101. WEYMOUTH. MA 02128 TEL. (A1 7 3357228 BAY: (A1 T\ 327.114¢



GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, nc.
. UTILTY MANAGEMENT » VALUATION » RATE cousufmﬂ o

PO POX 171, 38 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEX JEASEY §7477

QoD IRITL?
Robert J. lacullo April 2, 1998
United Water Management and Service®s— Rate Case
200 Old Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07840 Period Ended: 3/31/98
Work in progress on used and useful study.
‘ Hourly’
Staff Charges _ ____ Rate Hours Amotint
Principal | $200 0.00 $0.00
. Associale . 165 0.00 0.00
Principal |} 148 0.00 0.00
Engineer : 110 5.00 §50.00
Financial/Acctng 110 0.00 0.00
Techniclan 65 0.0 ~ 0.00
Administrative 38 5.00 190.00
Subtotal _ 10.00  $740.00
Expenses.
Telephone
Travel
Room & Board
Reproduction
Federal Express / UPS ,
Other j
Amount Due o $740.00

® W 00065
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GUASTELLA ASSOCIATE

* UTILITY MANAGEMENT * VALUATION ¢ RATE CONSULTANTS

Raobert J. lacullo

United Water Management and Services
200 Old Hook Road

Harrington Park, NJ 07640

18 WINTER STREET, SUITE 104
WEYMOUTH, Ma 32113
TEL ($12) 135241
FAX: (817) 332-5138
May 7, 1988
Rate Case

ided: 4/30/88

-

Work in progress on used and useful study.

' Hourly
Staff Charges ORI .- S
Principal | $200
Associate 165
@ Principal Il 145
Engineer 110
Financial/Acetng 110
Technician 65
Administrative 38

- - *omane

Subtotal

Expenses:
Telephone
Travel
Room & Board
Reproduction
Federal Express / UPS
Other

Previous Balance

Ges i er gt 4 @4 bs spe Mrm ®s B Besais mm e MIMUGms s i mrage GAE Bt @

Amount Due

T NS NP A e s o b gy

Hours - _Amount
2.00 $400.00
0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00
4.00 440,00
0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00
3.00 114.00
9.00  $954.00

740,00
$1,694.00
00066

NEW JTRSEY OFFICE: .0, BOX 37011 MAIN STREEY, PEAPACK, NEW JERSEY 7977 TEL: (201) 1061717 DAX: (J01) 134.276)
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GUASTELLA ASSOCIATES, we
INECETVEN

J\{ FEB 09 1998

‘ UTILITY MANAGEMENT ¢ VALUATION e RATE CONSULTANTS

£.0. BOX 171, 88 MAIN STREET
PEAPACK, NEW [ERSEY Jivie

(204 IR-1717
Robert J. lacullo February 5, 1998
United Water Management and Services R.J. IACULLO Rate Case
200 Old Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640 Period Ended: 1/31/98
Qo= d 3\
Preliminary work on used and useful study.
. Hourly
Staff Charges Rate Hours Amount
® Principal | 5200 350 $700.00
Associate 165 0.00 0.00
Principal Il 145 0.00 0.00
Engineer 110 0.00 0.00
Financial/Acctng 110 0.50 55.00
Technician 85 0.00 0.00
Administrative 38 0.50 19.00
Subtotal 450 §774.00
Expenses:
Telephone —
Travel : ST
Room & Board . o
Reproduction . TE8 181998 |
Federal Express / UPS o —,
Other T I
Amount Due $774.00
o PAID
bus.Lurt £33
fowernd (8 00067
pcczunT (§le w00 -

Jof TV To0329% 1



SCHEDULE 3
MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P.A. FEES

Actual - to October 31, 1998

Billing Period Bill Date Amount
01-01-98 - 01-31-98 03-16-98 $ 3,960.00
02-01-98 - 02-28-98 03-31-98 $ 2,950.00
03-01-98 - 03-31-98 04-30-98 $ 5,455.00
04-01-98 - 04-30-98 05-27-98 $ 7,687.50
05-01-98 - 05—3;—98 06-17-98 $19,702.50
06-01-98 - 06-30-98 07-24-98 $ 7,825.00
07-01-98 - 07-31-98 08-27-98 $ 4,035.00
08-01-98 - 08-31-98 09-30-98 $11,102.50
09-01-98 - Q9—30-98 10-30-98 $10,487.50
10-01-98 - 10-31-98 11-23-98 $22,792.50

Total - Actual to
October 31, 1998 $96,007.50

Projected from November 1, 1998

Projected Period Amount
Estimated from November 1,
1998 through completion of PAA
case ‘ $ 28,992.50

Total $125,000.00

* See attached bills for details as to work, hours, rates,
and amount.

00068
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AW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A.
‘ 3000 (NDEPENDENT SCUARE
POST CFFICE BOX 59 TELEPHGONE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 3220 1SC<) 354-2080
FESERAL TAX 1D #%9-2350277

March 16, 1998

United Water Florida Inc.
Post Office Box 8004
Jacksonville, Florida 32239

Attention: Mr. Munipalli Sambamurthi

’

To fee for professional services rendered £from
January 1, 1998, through January 31, 1898, as
follcws:

Application for Rate Adjustment

In connection with Application for Rate Adjustment
. (“Application”) filed before the Florida Public
Service Commission (“Commission”), including:

Preliminarvy Matters Regarding
Preparation and Filina of Rate Case

entification cf potential issues which may arise
ate case for the development of positions and
tegy, - prefiled testimeny and witnesses'’
ignments, minimum filing reguirements, and
ehearing statement; research and comparison of

the advantages and disadvantages of the use o
propcsed agency action Droceeq11g versus a stand

rate case proceeding and preparation of wri

analysis cf same; preparation for and attendance
January 13 and 16, i9¢s8, meetings W
reprasentatives of client to discuss potenti
issues; and telephone conversations
correspondence with representatives of
concerning the scope of the rate case
Gefiniticn of issues and respcnsibilities
connection with said matter.
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United Water Florida Inc.
March 16, 1998

Page 2

Attornev Hourlyv Rate Hours Fees
James L. Ade $250.00 7.50 $1,875.00
Scott G. Schildberg $180.00 9.50 $1,710.00

Determination and Request
for Approval of Test Year

Receipt from ©representative of United Water
Resources Inc. Rate Department and review of a
preliminary draft of a proposed letter to the
Commission requesting approval of a test vyear;
review Commission’s order on zreturn on common
equity leverage formula; and telephone
conversations and correspondence with
representatives of client in connection with said
matter.

Attornev Hourlyvy Rate Hours Fees
James L. Ade $250.00 1.50 $375.00

Total Rate Case Matters

Attornev Hourlyv Rate Hours
James L. Ade $250.00 9.00
Scott G. Schildberg $180.00 .50

Total Rate Case Matters

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA.
JACKSONVILLE. FLORIDA 232201

$ 3,960.00

Y
(0
(D
'l

.00
.00

wr -
=N
N N
- wm
e Ne)

S 3,960.00
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LAW CFFICES

MARTIN. ADE., BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.

. 00O INDEPENDENT SQUARE

POST OFFICE BOX %9 TELEPHONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 1904} 354-2C50

) FESERAL TAX 10 #%5-2380277
Marca 31, 1988

United Water Florida Inc.
Post Office Box 8004
Jacksonville, Florida 3223¢°

Attention: Mr. Munipalli Sambamurthi

To fee for professional sexrvices renderad from
February 1, 1998, through February 28, 1898, as
follows:

Application for Rate Adjustment

In connection wich Application for Rate Adjustment
(*Application”) to e filed before the Florida

‘ Public Service Commission {*Commission”),
including:

Preliminary Mattexrs Regarding
Preparation and Filing of Rate Case

Identificaticn of the advantages cf client’'s use cf
a proposed agency action (“PAAY) proceeding versus
a standard rate case proceeding, including research
of lssues of law and procedure regarding PAA
Droc dlng, standard rate case proceeding and
lnte rate vrelief; preparation of analysis
con talnwnc () an outline of the procedurs foxr a
standard rats case proceeding; (2) an outline of
the Droc dure for a PAA procesding (3) estimated
time hedulss comparing a =tanda rate case
oroceading, a PAA proceeding withou; a protast, and
= PAA procesding with a protest, (4) & discussion
cf the implementation of orocos=d rates in the
svent a third party prcotests a PAA order, (3) an
sexplanation cf the regquirements for estazliishing
crima facie entitliement £for incerim rate ralief,
i5) a discussicn of facter o considexr in
Gsrermining whecher tc raguest interim rats relief,

00071



United Water Florida Inc.
March 31, 1998
Page 2

(7) a discussion of the opportunity to narrow
issues for hearing in a PAR proceeding, (8) an
analysis of the PAA process regarding the quantity
and cost of testimony required to be filed because
(a) testimony is not filed with the application in
a PAA proceeding and (b) even if a PAA Order is
protested, the amount of testimony should be
reduced because of the narrowing of issues to be
resolved at a hearing, (9) a discussion of the
impact of a PAA proceeding on the development and
presentation of client’s evidence and positions,
(10) a response to client’s inquiry as to whether
the election to utilize a PAA proceeding must be
made in the request for test year, and (11) a
discussion regarding the possible use of customer
surveys; and telephone conversations and
correspondence with representatives of client in
connection with said matter.

Attorney Hourlv Rate Hours Fees
James L. Ade $250.00 2.75 $§ 687.50
Scott G. Schildberg $180.00 8.25 $1,485.00

Determination and Request
for Approval of Test Year

Consultation with representative of client
regarding = anticipated estimated pro forma
adjustments to be incorporated in a letter to the
Commission requesting approval of a test year;
preparation and filing of letter to the Commission
requesting approval of an historical test vyear
ended December 31, 1997, an intermediate test year
ended December 31, 1998, and a projected test year
ending December 31, 1999; telephone conversation
with a member of the Staff of the Commission
regarding the approval of a test year and the
requirement for monthly plant account information;
and telephore conversations with representatives of
client in connection with said matter.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. RPA.
JACKSONVILLE. FLORIDA 3220}

$ 2,172.50

S 777.50
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United Water Florida Inc.

March 31, 1998

Page 3

Attorney Hourly Rate Hours
James L. Ade $250.00 2.75
Scott G. Schildberg $180.00 .50

Total Rate Case Matters

Attornev Hourlv Rate
James L. Ade $250.00
$180.00

Scott G. Schildberg

*

Total Rate Case Matters

Hours

5.50
8.75

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. PA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORICA 222CI

$ 2,950.
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s 2,950.00
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LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.
3000 INDEPENDENT SQUARE

POST OFFICE BOX 59 TELEPHONE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 1904} 354-2080
FEDERAL Tax (0 #59-2380277
April 30, 1998
Billed through 03/31/98
Bill number 600-00701-008 JLA
United Water Florida Inc.
200 0Old Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attn: Mr. Walton F. Hill
1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT

Preliminary Matters Regarding Preparation and Filing of Rate
Case

03/09/98 JLA Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
preparation of presentation of case and use of
expenses for base year. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 62.50

Request for Test Year

03/05/98 JLA Receipt and review of letter from FPSC approving
requested test year; letter to W. Hill. .25 hrs

03/06/98 SGS Consideration of impact of conditions in test
year letter on rate case filing. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 107.50

Preparation and Consultation Regarding Prefiled Direct Testimony
- Munipalli Sambamurthi

00074



United Water Florida Inc.

Bill number

03/05/98 SGS

03/06/98 JLA

03/06/98 SGS

03/09/98 SGS

Advise, Consultation and Assistance regarding Quality of

600-00701-008 JLA

Prepare draft of M. Sambamurthi’s direct
testimony; review P. Heil’s, M. Sambamurthi’s,
T. Cleveland’s and F. Guastella’s direct
testimony from 1996 rate case and exhibits re:
the used and useful analysis; analysis of issues
to address in M. Sambamurthi’s direct testimony.

Conference with M. Sambamurthi and S. Schildberg
re: preparation and revising of M. Sambamurthi’s
direct testimony.

Prepare draft of M. Sambamurthi's direct
testimony; conference with J. Ade and M.
Sambamurthi re: direct testimony; review draft of
F. Guastélla’s direct testimony;

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
wastewater treatment plants, his direct
testimony, and preparation of H schedules; revise
M. Sambamurthi’s direct testimony and send draft
to M. Sambamurthi.

Total fees for this matter

Engineering Issues

03/02/98 SGS

03/09/98 SGS

03/09/98 JLA

Letter to FPSC re: corrosion control; telephone
conversation with T. Mackey; send letter to T.
Mackey.

Consultation regarding corrosion control report.
Review of update on effectiveness of corrosion
control and hydrogen sulfide treatment program

required in 1996 rate case; review of items
required of UWF by Order in 1996 rate case.

Total fees for this matter

Advise, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Cost of Capital

Issues

00075

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
JMACKSONVILLE. FLORIDA 3220)

Service

PAGE 2
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. United Water Florida Inc. ' PAGE 3
Bill number 600-00701-008 JLA

03/12/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
leverage formula; obtain leverage formula order
and transmit to J. Schreyer; telephone
conversation with T. Vaccaro (FPSC) and call to
records and reporting office (FPSC) re: status of
current docket for leverage formula. 1.50 hrs

03/13/98 JLA Consideration and analysis of FPSC order re:
reestablishment of authorized range of returns on
common equity and calculation of UWF’s midpoint
for return on equity and error in order;
telephone conversation with J. Schreyer. 1.25 hrs

03/13/98 SGS Review and analysis of leverage formula order,
including errors, etc., in order and determine
effect on UWF; telephone conversation with T.

Vacarro (FPSC) re: order. 2.25 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 987.30
Advise, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Capital
. Improvement Projects

03/27/98 JLA Schedule of capital construction projects;
conference with M. Sambamurthi. 1.00 hrs

Total fees for this matter 3 250.00

Advise, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Amortization of
Prior Rate Case Expenses

03/17/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
requirements for amortization of rate case
expense; review order establishing current rates
and statutes re: amortization of rate case
expense and reduction of rates; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer and send fax. .50 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 90.00

Advise, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Interim Rate
Request 00076

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
JACKSONVILLE. FLORIDA 3220



hrs

hrs

00

United Water Florida Inc. PAGE
Bill number 600-00701-008 JLA
03/09/98 JLA Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

procedure for calculation of interim rate

increases. .25
03/30/98 JLA Telephone conversations with P. Merchant (FPSC)

and J. Schreyer re: calculation of interim

and final rate requirements and consideration of

return on equity and return on rate base for

interim rate calculations. 1.25

Total fees for this matter $ 375.
BILLING SUMMARY ,

JAMES L. ADE 8.50 hrs 250 /hr 2,125.

SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 18.50 hrs 180 /hr 3,330.

TOTAL FEES ‘ 27.00 hrs $ 5,455
TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT $ 5,455,

00077
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LAwN QFFICES

MARTIN, ADE. BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A,
3000 INDEPENOENT SOQUARE
POST OFFICE B8OXx S9 TELEPHONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 (904) 3sa-2080

FEoERAL Tax 10 #55-2380277
May 27, 1998
Billed through 04/30/98
Bill number 600-00701-015 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 0ld Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attn: Mr. Walton F. Hill

1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT

Preliminary Matters Regarding Preparation and Filing of Rate
Case

04/07/98 JLA Conference with W. Hill, J. Schreyer and F.
McGuire re: strategy for use of Proposed Agency
Action ("PAA") procedure or standard rate case
procedure and request for interim rates. 1.00 hrs

C4/17/98 SGS Legal research re: issues relating to PAA,
including level of participation by third parties
such as Office of Public Counsel ("OPC)"; obtain
and review PSC publications on rate case
procedures for water and wastewater utilities. 2.00 hrs

04/17/98 JLA Review of Florida Public Service Commission
("FPSC") Statutes and Rules re: response to W.
Hill’s questions re: PAA Procedure and OPC’s
rights in PAA proceeding; telephone conversation
with H. McLean (OPC); telephone conversation with
W. Hill. 1.25 hrs

04/20/98 SGS Receipt of voice mail regarding PAA and interim

rates from W. Hill, telephone conversation with
M. Sambamurthi. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 967.50

00078



United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number

600-00701-015 JLA

Preparation of Application

04/15/98
04/16/98

04/17/98

04/17/98
04/21/98

04/22/98

04/23/98
04/23/98

04/28/98

04/29/98

04/30/98

Advise, consultation and assistance regarding

SGS

SGS

SGS

JLA

SGS

SGS

JLA

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

Preparation of Application.
Review other applications for rate adjustments.

Prepare Application and transmit draft to W.
Hill.

Review of draft of Application.

Prepafd Applicatiomn.

Prepare a new draft of Application to incorporate

additional information.
Preparation of Application.
Preparation of Application.

Legal research regarding issues related to
uniform rate structures.

Prepare Application;
Application.

review changes to

Draft letter to W. Hill and prepare Application.

Total fees for this matter

used and useful

issue in rate case

04/23/98

04/27/98

SGS

SGS

Research issues of law re: used
including recent case involving
Water Company.

and useful,
Florida Cities

Analysis of FPSC’s position on used and useful;

preparation of letter to client regarding Florida

Cities used and useful case and proposed rule.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. RA,
JACKSONVILLE. FLORIDA 32201

$

PAGE

1.25

1.25
.25

.25

.25

.25

.25

1.00

1.00

1.00

1,430.

3.50

00079
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United Water
Bill number

04/28/98 JLA

04/28/98 SGS

04/29/98 JLA

04/30/98 JLA

04/30/98 SGS

- —

Florida Inc.
600-00701-015 JLA

Review and revise letter to client re: Florida
Cities Water Company case decision re: Used and
Useful and FPSC Rule proposal and FPSC Order on
Remand.

Analysis of court’s review of FPSC’s
determination of used and useful in Florida
Cities Water Company and FPSC’s response in order
on remand; draft letter.

Telephone conversation with W. Hill re: change in
FPSC procedure for determining used and useful
percentages of plant and additional information
to be included in Application.

Preparation of letter to W. Hill re: FPSC change
in procedure for determining used and useful
wastewater treatment plants to be included in
rate base.

Prepare letter re: used and useful to W. Hill.

Total fees for this matter

PAGE

.50

.50

$ 1,842,

Advise, consultation and assistance regarding reuse rate request

in rate case

04/24/98 JLA

04/24/98 SGS

04/27/98 SCS
04/29/98 SGS

04/29/98 JLA

Conversation with J. Schreyer and M. Sambamurthi
re: schedule for reuse rates request as part of
rate case.

Telephone conference with J. Schreyer regarding
alternative procedure for requesting reuse rates,
review reuse feasibility study, consultation
regarding rate schedule for reuse rate request as
a part of rate case.

Letter to J. Schreyer regarding options on
reuse.

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer; revise
and transmit reuse letter.

Review and revise letter to J. Schreyer re:

alternative procedure available to client in
order to obtain rates for new reuse service.

Total fees for this matter

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
JACKSONVILLE. FLORIDA 3220

.50

1.75

2.50

.75

.25

3.
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$ 1,087.50

00080



United Water Florida Inc. PAGE 4
Bill number 600-00701-015 JLA

Advise, consultation and assistance regarding preliminary
matters relating to Minimum Filing Requirements ("MFRs")

04/20/98 JLA Telephone conversation with J. Scheyer re: date
for filing of Application and forwarding of
schedules for review. .25 hrs

04/24/98 JLA Calls to M. Sambamurthi, D. deNagy and J.
Schreyer re: preparation and distribution of
Application and Schedules. .50 hrs

04/24/98 SGS Determine number of copies needed of Application
and various Schedules; telephone conversations
with M. Sambamurthi; preparation of chart for the
distribution of Application and Schedules;
telephone conversations with M. Sambamurthi,
D. deNagy and J. Schreyer. 1.75 hrs

04/30/98 JLA Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
narrative explanations to be included in MFRs and
status of schedules for MFRs. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter 3 565.00

Review of MFR Schedules B-1 through B-15 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

04/27/98 JLA Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re: rate
of return for use on Schedules B-1 and B-2;
telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
strategy for presentation on Schedules B-1 and
B-2. .50 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 125.00

Review of MFR Schedules D-1 through D-7 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

04/27/98 JLA Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

strategy for presentation on Schedule D-1. .50 hrs
Total fees for this matter 3 125.00
MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA. 0 0 0 8 1

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201



United Water Florida Inc. PAGE

Bill number

600~-00701-015 JLA

Review of MFR Schedules F-1 through F-10 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

04/24/98 SGS

04/24/98 JLA

04/29/98 SGS

04/30/98 JLaA

04/30/98 SGS

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer and M.
Sambamurthi; review used and useful schedules;

update information for F Schedules in part

because of Sunray facilities; consideration of

the use of narrative in F Schedules; review J.
Guastella’s draft of exhibits. 1.00

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer and M.
Sambamurthi re: schedules for used and useful
update information and Sunray facilities. .50

Receipt and review of spreadsheet re: used and

useful information from T. Mackey providing

comparison of information with previous rate

case; analysis regarding possible change in used

and useful procedures by FPSC. 3.75

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
status of review of H Schedules and preparation
of F Schedules re: used and useful information. .25

Telephone conversation with T. Mackey re:
revising F schedules. .50

Total fees for this matter $ 1,132,

Review of MFR Schedules H-1 through H-12 to Determine
Compliance with Statutory and Rule Requirements

04/15/98 SGS

04/27/98 JLA

04/27/98 SGS

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi
regarding H Schedules; letter to M. Sambamurthi

regarding compliance with Rule 25-30.440, FAC. 1.00
Consideration of strategy for review of Schedules

H-1 through H-12. .25
Telephone conference with D. deNagy re: rate

schedules; review rule requirements. .25
Total fees for this matter $ 287.

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

50

00082

MARTIN. ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. PA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 3220!1



United Water Florida Inc. B . PAGE 6

‘

Bill number 600-00701-015 JLA

Preparation of Notices - General Matters

04/23/98 SGS Telephone conversation with D. deNagy re: PAA
procedures and noticing; transmit copies of
letters to libraries in previous rate case to

D. deNagy. .50 hrs
04/27/98 SGS Telephone conversation with D. deNagy re:

noticing, etc., in a PAA proceeding. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 135.00

BILLING SUMMARY

JAMES L. ADE 7.75 hrs 250 /hr 1,937.50

SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 32.00 hrs 180 /hr 5,760.00

TOTAL FEES 39.75 hrs $ 7,697.50

TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT $ 7,897.50
00083

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
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LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A.
3000 INDEPENDOENT SQUARE
POST OFFICE BOX =9 TELEPMONE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 1804) 384-2050

FEDERAL TAX 10 #39-2350277

June 17, 1998
Billed through 05/31/98

Bill number 600-00701-019 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 0ld Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attn: Mr. Walton F. 'Hill

UWF/1968 Rate Case

Preparation of Application

05/01/98 JLA Preparation of Application. .50 hrs

05/01/98 SGS Review of the test year application and response
letter from the Florida Public Service Commission
("FPSC"); preparation of a letter to W. Hill
and a draft of the Application. 1.25 hrs

05/08/98 JLA Consideration of revisions to Application
suggested by J. Schreyer. .25 hrs

05/08/98 SGS Revise Application to include changes proposed by
United Waterworks Inc. .25 hrs

05/13/98 SGS Incorporate a Capital Improvements paragraph into
the Application; preparation of a letter to W.
Hill. .50 hrs

05/14/98 SGS Preparation of revisions to the Application to
incorporate revenue, expenses, returns, and other
information anticipated to be in the final MFRs;
preparation of a letter to W. Hill; telephone
conversations with J. Schreyer re: revisions and
filing of the Application. 1.50 hrs

05/15/98 JLA Review revisions to the Application and assure
coordination with MFR Schedules. 1.75 hrs

00084



t

United Water Florida Inc.

Bill number

. 05/15/98 SGS

600-00701-019 JLA

Review revisions to the Application suggested by
client; telephone conversation with M.
Sambamurthi; preparation of revisions to the
Application.

Total fees for this matter

Advise, consultation and assistance regarding used and useful
issue in rate case

05/11/98 sGs

05/11/98 JLA

05/12/98 SGS

05/12/98 JLA

05/13/98 SGS

Review J. Guastella’s report and F Schedules and
compare with prior FPSC orders; preparation of a
memoratdum to J. Schreyer; preparation for
conference call,

Receipt and review of J. Guastella’s used and
useful study and analysis and comparison with
recent District Court of Appeal and Commission
decisions re: used and useful calculations and
Commission’s Proposed Rule Development Order;
review and analysis of F Schedules; telephone
conversation with M. Sambarurthi re: arranging a
conference call.

Review J. Guastella’s revised report;
prepararation and participation in a conference
call with J. Schreyer, M. Sambamurthi, T. Mackey,
J. Guastella and J. Ade re: used and useful
narrative; receipt and review of a revised
report.

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
arrangements for conference call; conference call
with M. Sambamurthi, T. Mackey, J. Guastella, J.
Schreyer and S. Schildberg re: review of F
Schedule information, J. Guastella’s narrative,
strategy to address issues raised in recent cases
and Proposed Rule Development; telephone
conversation with M. Sambamurthi re: used and
useful issues with Black Ford wastewater
treatment plant.

Receipt and review of J. Guastella’s updated
exhibit; telephone conversation with M.
Sambamurthi re: changes; telephone conversation
with J. Guastella.

Total fees for this matter

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA.

PAGE 2

.50 hrs

$§ 1,345.00

.50 hrs

2.00 hrs

2.50 hrs

.50 hrs

$ 1,890.00

00085



United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number 600-00701-019 JLA

- Advise, consultation and assistance regarding reuse rate request

in rate

case

05/04/98 SGS Receipt of a fax from F. Gradilone re: reuse

rates.

 05/06/98 SGS Review FPSC Staff Recommendation for May 12, 1998

Advise,
matters

05/01/98

05/02/98
05/07/98

05/07/98

05/07/98

05/08/98

05/08/98

Agenda in another docket which relates to using a
zeto rate as a reuse rate and addressing the
impact of Secticn 367.0817, Florida Statutes, as
to overall rate adjustments.

‘e

Total fees for this matter

consultation and assistance regarding preliminary
relating to Minimum Filing Requirements ("MFRs")

SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schissel re:
preparation of MFRs.

SGS Obtain and review MFR draft package.
SGS Review of draft MFRs.

JLA Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer and F.
Gradilone re: format and location of tariff
sheets in the Application and MFRs; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer re: organization of
MFRs.

JLA Telephone conversation with M. Willis (FPSC) re:
extra copies of MFRs and Application.

JLA Determination of number of copies of MFR
Schedules and other documents required for
filing; telephone conversation with J. Schreyer
re: necessary revisions to drafts of MFR's;
preparation of a letter to J. Schreyer.

SGS Preparation of a 1list for distribution of copies
of Billing Analysis and other MFRs including
copies to libraries, Office of Public Counsel
("0PC"), etc.; telephone conversations with J.
Schreyer and F. Gradilone re: same.

Total fees for this matter

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA,

Al i it s el e mimm a4 e

PAGE 3
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United Water Florida Inc. . PAGE 4
Bill number 600-00701-019 JLA ’

Review of MFR Schedules A-1 through A-19 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

05/03/98 SGS Review A Schedules. 2.25 hrs

'05/07/98 SGS Review A Schedules. .75 hrs
05/08/98 SGS Review A Schedules; telephone conversation with

J. Schreyer re: same. 2.50 hrs

05/10/98 SGS Rewview A Schedules. ; 1.75 hrs

05/11/98 SGS Review of MFRs and comparison with form
requirements of rule; comparison with MFRs,
deficiency letter and orders in last rate case;
preparation and transmittal of a memorandum re: A
Schedules to J. Schreyer. 1.75 hrs

Tbtal fees for this matter ) 1,620.00

Review of MFR Schedules B-1 through B-15 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

05/08/98 SGS Review B Schedules. .50 hrs

05/11/98 SGS Review B Schedules and comparison with prior rate
case; preparation and transmittal of a memorandum

re: B Schedules to J. Schreyer. 2.50 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 540.00
Review of MFR Schedules C-1 through C-19 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements
05/11/98 SGS Review C Schedules and comparison of MFRs and
orders with prior rate case; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer; preparation and
transmittal of a memorandum re: T Schedules to J.
Schreyer. 1.50 hrs

00087
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United Water Florida Inc. PAGE 5

Bill number

05/13/98 JLA

05/13/98 SGS

600-00701-019 JLA

Review of C Schedules and consideration of

information relating to absence of debt of United

Water Resources Inc. in capital structure of

United Waterworks or United Water Florida; review

of Commission Rule re: Parent-Debt Adjustment. 1.50 hrs

Consideration of Parent-Debt Adjustment; review

Rule re: Parent-Debt Adjustment and MFRs

requirements; preparation of an insert for C

Schedules re: Parent-Debt Adjustment; telephone

conversation with J. Schreyer. 3.00 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 1,185.00

Review of MFR Schedulés D-1 through D-7 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

05/11/98 SGS

05/12/98 SGS

Review D Schedules and comparison of MFRs and
orders with prior rate case; preparation
of a memorandum re: D Schedules to J. Schreyer. 1.75 hrs

Review D Schedules; preparation and transmittal
of a memorandum re: D Schedules to J. Schreyer. .50 hrs

Total fees for this matter 3 405.00

Review of MFR Schedules E-1 through E-14 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

05/11/98 SGS

05/12/98 SGS

Review E Schedules and comparison with current
tariffs; preparation of a memorandum re: E

Schedules to J. -Schreyer. 1.50 hrs
Review E Schedules; preparation and transmittal

of a memorandum re: E Schedules to J. Schreyer. .50 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 360.00

Review of MFR Schedules F-1 through F-10 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

00088
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United Water
Bill number

05/01/98 JLA

05/01/98 SGS

05/11/98 SGS

05/12/98 SGS

Florida Inc. PAGE 6
600-00701-019 JLA

Review of alternative plant capacities to be

considered in determining used and useful plant

for rate base purposes and inclusion of F

Schedules. .75 hrs

Reseérch used and useful issues and review
capacity checklist. 1.25 hrs

Review F Schedules; preparation of a memorandum

re: F Schedules to J. Schreyer. 1.50 hrs
Review F Schedules; pfeparation and transmittal

of a memorandum re: F Schedules to J. Schreyer. .50 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 772.50

Review of MFR Schedules G-1 through G-45 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requirements

05/08/98 SGS

05/12/98 SGS

05/13/98 sSGS

Review of tariff sheets re: G Schedules;

telephone conversations with J. Schreyer re:

same; telephone conversation with F. Gradilone

re: reuse sheets and tariff sheets. .75 hrs

Review G Schedules and comparison with prior rate

case; telephone conversations with F. Gradilone

and J. Schreyer; preparation of a memorandum re:

G Schedules to J. Schreyer, 5.25 hrs

Preparation and transmittal of a memorandum re: G
Shedules to J. Scheyer; telephone conversation
with J. Schreyer re: same. 1.25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 1,305.00

Review of MFR Schedules H-1 through H-12 to Determine
Compliance with Statutory and Rule Requirements

05/01/98 SGS

Review H Schedules prepared by client; telephone
conversation with T. Mackey re: missing
treatment plant reports. 3.00 hrs

00089
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United Water
Bill number

05/05/98 SGS

05/06/98 SGS

information needed. 1.00
05/08/98 SGS Voicemails with T. Maékey re: status of H

Schedules. .25
05/13/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

status; telephone conversations with D. deNagy

and T. Mackey re: updates for H Schedules; office

conference with D. deNagy. .50
05/14/98 SGS Review updates to H Schedules; preparation of a

letter to M. Sambamurthi re: revisions still

needed; telephone conversation with D. deNagy re:

H Schedules, etc.; telephone conversation with T.

Mackey re: Monthly Operating Reports and permits; 5.75

Total fees for this matter $ 2,655,
Preparation and Consultation regarding MFR Schedule I for
inclusion with Application for Rate Adjustment
05/09/98 SGS Preparation of Schedule I; review case law and

Commission decisions re: uniform rates. 3.25
05/11/98 SGS Preparation of Schedule I and a letter to M.

Sambamurthi for review. .50
05/12/98 JLA Preparation of Schedule I. .50
05/12/98 SGS Receipt and review of R. Iacculo’s revisions;

telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:

capacity information. .75
05/13/98 SGS Revisions to I Schedules; preparation of a letter

to M. Sambamurthi. 1.50

Florida Inc. PAGE
600-00701-019 JLA

Telephone conversation with T. Mackey and D.

deNagy; review chemical dosage information, sewer
monthly operating reports, permits, inspection

and survey reports, chemical analysis,

information from DEP, field employee and vehicle

listing, and customer complaints. 4.25

Review customer complaints; telephone
conversation with T. Mackey re: corrections and
additional information needed; telephone
conversation with D. deNagy re: additional

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

00

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs
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United Water Florida Inc. : PAGE 8
Bill number 600~00701-01% JLA

05/14/98 SGS Telephone conversation to J. Schreyer re:
revisions; preparation of revisions to Schedule I
and transmittal via federal express to J.
Schissel. .75 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 1,340.00

Preparation of Notices -~ General Matters

05/05/98 SGS Preparation of a memorandum re: notice for case;
preparation and transmittal of a letter to J.
Schreyer; telephone conversation with D. deNagy;
preparation and transmittal of a letter to B.
Messer (FPSC) re: notification list. 2.00 hrs

05/06/98 SGS Preparation of a memorandum re: noticing;
preparation of a letter to J. Schreyer. _ 2.75 hrs

05/08/98 SGS Preparation of a noticing memorandum.. 1.00 hrs

05/09/98 SGS Preparation of a memorandum re: noticing;
preparation of a letter to J. Schreyer. 1.50 hrs

05/11/98 SGS Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
noticing procedures and the use of United
Waterwork’s personnel in the mailing of notices. .25 hrs

05/14/98 SGS Voicemails with the offices of B. Messer (FPSC)

and J, Williams (FPSC) re: noticing list, .25 hrs
05/18/98 SGS Telephone conversation with Shannon Smith re:

mailing notices to county/city contacts. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 1,440.00

Advise and Consultation Regarding Press Release by Client

05/15/98 JLA Conference with M. Sambamurthi; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer re: preparation of
Press Release; receipt and review of a draft of
the Press Release; telephone conversation with D.
deNagy. 1.50 hrs

00091
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United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number

_05/15/98 SGS

600-00701-019 JLA

Office conference with M. Sambamurthi; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer re: press releases;
obtain and fax copy of previous press release to
J. Schreyer; obtain and review proposed press
release; telephone conversations with D. deNagy.

Total fees for this matter

Review of Final MFR Schedules and Assist in Preparation of
Filing Rate Case Documentation

05/11/98

05/13/98

05/13/98

05/14/98

05/15/98

05/15/¢98

05/17/98

05/18/98

SGS

JLA

SGS

JLA

JLA

SGS

SGS

SGS

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re: MFR
review and revisions.

Review of draft of MFRs and suggestions for
corrections and improvements.

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re: the
filing of the Application and schedules;

preparation of the Application; office conference

with D. deNagy; telephone conversation with J.
Schreyer re: delivery of MFRs.

Review of MFR Schedules.

Conference with M. Sambamurthi; review of final
Application and MFR Schedules for filing.

Telephone conversations with D. deNagy re:
delivery of MFRs, directions and numbers of
copies of H-2 Schedules; preparation of the
filing letter; telephone conversation with M.
Sambamurthi re: procedure to execute Application;
copy and forward package to D. deNagy; telephone
conversation with D. deNagy re: preparation of
filing packages.’

Preparation for filing; office conference with D.
deNagy; telephone conversations with various
delivery services; telephone conversation with J.
Schreyer; organize package for filing; telephone
conversations with D. deNagy and the delivery
service personnel.

Telephone conversation with D. deNagy re: status
of billing analysis and filing; telephone
conversation with M. Willis (FPSC) re: status;
telephone conversation with Shannon Smith re:
filing; and telephone conversation with J.
Schreyer re: filing and next steps in case.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA.
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1.25

600.

.25

1.25

.50

.50

1.50

2.75

1.75

hrs

00

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

2.25 hrs
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United Water Florida Inec. . PAGE 10
Bill number 600-00701-019 JLA '
05/19/98 SGS Telephone conversation with T. Mackey re: filing

and delivery of copies. .25 hrs
05/21/98 SGS Receipt of filing letter; telephone conversation

with D. deNagy re: status of copies of MFRs. .25 hrs
05/28/98 SGS Telephone conversation with D. deNagy re:

delivery of MABM’s sets of schedules. .25 hrs
05/28/98 SGS Analysis of B-10 and G-25 Schedules. .50 hrs
05/29/98 SGS Telephone conversation with D. deNagy re:

preparation of a list of service applicants and

consolidating MFRs including H Schedules from

prior rate case; preparation of pleading file;

consolidate information, schedules, and discovery

from prior rate case. 1.00 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 2,567.50
BILLING SUMNARY

JAMES L. ADE 17.25 hrs 250 /[/hr 4,312.50

SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 85.50 hrs 180 /hr 15,390.00

TOTAL FEES 102.75 hrs $19,702.50
TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT $19,702.50

00093
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LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A,
3000 INDEPENDENT SQUARE
POST OFFICE BOX %9 TELEPHONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 3220! 1904) 354-2050

FEDERAL TAX 10 #59-2380277
July 24, 1998
Billed through 06/30/98

Bill number 600-00701-024 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 01d Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attn: Mr. Walton F.'Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case

Advise, consultation and assistance regarding used and useful
issue in rate case

06/13/98 SGS

Obtain, review and analyze used and useful

components of the June 10, 1998, First District

Court of Appeal case overturning Citrus County v.

Southern States Utilities; compare with other

recent used and useful case. 1.50 nors

Total fees for this matter S 270.00

Review of MFR Schedules G-1 through G-45 to Determine Compliance
with Statutory and Rule Requiraments .

06/10/98 SGS Telephone conversation with D. deNagy re: nesad

for 2 tariff page for sale of service to
Jacksonville Electric Authority ("JEA"). .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 45.00

00094



United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number 600-00701-024 JLA

Preparation and Consultation regarding MFR Schedule I for
inclusion with Application for Rate Adjustment

06/12/98 SGS Obtain, review and analyze the First District
Court of Appeal case overturning Citrus County v.
Southern States Utilities re: requirement of
single system for uniform rates.

Total fees for this matter $
Initial Notice of Application to-Cities and Counties

’

06/09/98 SGS Investigate possible use of central location of
H-2 System Maps; determine whether to charge a
city requesting a copy of MFR’s the costs of
reproducing the MFRs or to include the cost in
the rate case expense.

06/22/98 SGS Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
FPSC Staff’s position on whether to charge City
of St. Augustine for copies of MFRs and status of
deficiency letter.

06/24/98 SGS Telephone conversation with D. deNagy re: status
of availability of libraries for depositories for
MFRs; review and revise M. Sambamurthi’s letter
to City of St. Augustine; telephone conversation

with M. Sambamurthi re: letter to City of St.
Augustine.

Total fees for this matter $

Preparation, Obtaining Approval and Distribution of Synopsis

06/02/98 SGS Prepare Synopsis and Notice.
06/05/98 SGS Prepare Synopsis.

06/08/98 SGS Prepare Synopsis.

PAGE 2

1.25 hrs

225.00

.25 hrs

.25 hrs

.50 hrs

180.00

1.00 hrs

1.00 hrs

.25 hrs

00095
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United Water Florida Inc. ‘ PAGE 3
Bill number 600-00701-024 JLA
06/24/98 SGS Prepare Synopsis and compare with proposed
tariffs and existing tariffs. .25 hrs
06/25/98 SGS Letter to M. Sambamurthi with draft of Synopsis. .25 hrs
06/26/98 JLA Review and revise Synopsis. .25 hrs
06/30/98 SGS Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
. Synopsis revisions. .25 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 602.50

Preparation and Obtaining Approval of Notice of Application for
Adjustment of Rates

06/24/98 SGS Prepare draft of initial Notice of Application
and compare with proposed tariffs and existing

tariffs. ‘ .50 hrs
06/25/98 SGS Prepare draft of Notice of Application. .25 hrs
Total fees for this matter 3 135.00

Advise and Assist in Preparation of Response Deficiency Letter

06/02/98 JLA Receipt and review of a deficiency letter from
the FPSC Staff; review of the Application and the
MFR’s re: alleged deficiencies; telephone
conversations with W. Hill and J. Schreyer re:
alleged deficiencies. .75 hrs

06/02/98 SGS Receipt, review and analysis of the deficiency
letter; consultation with W. Hill and J. Schayer
re: preparation of a response to the deficiency
letter. .75 hrs

06/03/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer; receipt
and review of facsimiles re: National Association
of Regulatory Utility Commissioners’ ("NARUC")
position on Investment Tax Credit ("ITC"); ,
prepare memorandum re: ITC analysis. .75 hrs

00096
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United Water
Bill number

06/04/98

06/04/98

06/05/98

06/08/98

06/08/98

06/09/98

06/09/98

06/10/98

06/10/98

06/11/98

JLA

SGS

SGS

JLA

SGS

JLA

SGS

JLA

SGS

SGS

Florida Inc.
600-00701-024 JLA

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
responses to deficiency letter alleged by the
FPSC Staff for the Application and MFRs.

Telephone conversation with T. Mackey and T.
Cleveland re: engineering deficiency; receipt and
review of draft of the Testimony of Thomas F.
Cleveland; receipt and review of ITC fax from J.
Schreyer re: Answer to Public Counsel
Interrogatory No. 34.

Analysis of engineering deficiency item; review
the draft of the Testimony of Thomas F.
Cleveland; prepare a response; outline issues for
T. Cleveland to cover in response.

Telephéne conversation with J. Schreyer re:
Section 46 election letter.

Telephone conversation with T. Cleveland re:
schedule for methods and basis deficiency;
investigate ITC; receipt of fax from J. Schreyer
re: ITC; telephone conversation with B. Salek
(FPSC) re: status of FPSC Staff’s investigation.

Review of FPSC Rate Orders for United Water
Florida re: ITC normalization; research Internal
Revenue Service requirements for Section 46(f)(2)
election.

Analysis of rate case orders re: ITC; telephone
conversation with B. Salek re: status of FPSC
Staff’s review.

Research re: General Waterworks Inc.’s operations
in Florida and Commission Audit Report from 1981
Rate Case re: Option 2 Election for Accounting
for ITC deferrals; telephone conversation with J.
Schreyer re: ITC election.

Prepare letter to J. Schayer re: FPSC response;
review FPSC response; receipt and review of J.
Shreyer’s facsimile re: proposed response;
telephone conversation with J. Scheyer re: ITC
and T. Cleveland; prepare response to deficiency
letter.

Conference with M. Sambamurthi re: ITC and T.
Cleveland’s exhibit.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
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.50

.25

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs
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United Water Florida Inc. . PAGE 5
Bill number 600~00701-024 JLA

06/12/98 SGS Review 1981 Rate Case pleadings and discovery. 1.75 hrs

06/12/98 SGS Prepare a response to deficiency letter; review
of prior deficiency response. .75 hrs

06/16/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re: ITC
election; prepare response to deficiency letter;
and research prior rate case. 1.25 hrs

06/17/98 JLA Review and revise Response to Deficiency re: Sec.
46(f) Option 2 Election. 1.25 hrs

06/17/98 SGS Prepare response to Deficiency 1; receipt and
review of responses to Deficiencies 2 and 3;
telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
responses; receipt and review of facsimile from
J. Schreyer re: Jacksonville Suburban Utilities
Corporation ("JSUC") interrogatory; fax to J.
Schreyer. 2,00 hrs

06/17/98 JLA Review and revise Responses to Deficiency Letter. .25 hrs

06/18/98 SGS Prepare response to deficiency letter; fax to J.
Schreyer; telephone conversation with J. Schreyer
re: responses to deficiency letter and ITC search
results. 1.50 hrs

06/19/98 SGS Telephone conversations with J. Schissel, J.
Schreyer, and R. Iacullo re: responses to
deficiency letter and preparation of responses,
preparation of Response to Deficiency. 2.75 hrs

06/21/98 SGS Prepare responses to Deficiency Latter. .73 hrs

06/22/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
© filing responses to deficiency letter; receipt of
additional materials; prepare and revise
responses to deficiencies 2 and 3; file response
to deficiency request. ) 3.00 hrs

06/25/98 SGS Determine number of copies by Unitad Water

Florida and United Waterworks; letter to M.
Sambamurthi. .75 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 6,097.50

00098
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United Water Florida Inc. ) PAGE ¢
Bill number 600-00701-024 JLA

Preparation and Obtaining Approval of Notice of Customer
Meetings

06/24/98 SGS Preparation of draft of Notice of Customer
Meeting. .50 hrs

06/25/98 SGS Preparation of draft of Notice of Customer
Meeting. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter 3 135.00

Preparation and Obtaining Approval of Customer Notice of Final
Rate Increase

06/24/98 SGS Preparation of draft of Notice of Final Rates. .50 hrs
06/25/98 5GS Preparation of Notice of Final Rates. .25 hrs
. . Total fees for this matter S 135.00

BILLING SUMMARY

JAMES L. ADE 7.00 hrs 250 /hr 1,750.00
SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 33.75 hrs 180 /hr 6,075.00
TOTAL FEES 40.75 hrs $ 7,825.00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT $ 7,825.00

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.



LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER,
3000 INDEPENDENT SOUARE
POST OFFICE BOX S9
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

August 27, 1998
Billed through 07/31/98

Bill number 600-00701-028 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
700 Kinder Kamack Road
Oradell, NJ 07649

Attn: Mr. Walton F.'Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case

P. A,

TELEPHONE
D04 384-2080
FEDERAL Tax 10 #59-2350277

07/09/98 SGS Receipt and review of letter regarding official

date of filing of Application; letter to J
Schreyer regarding same.

Total fees for this matter

Preparation, Obtaining Approval and Distribution of Synopsis

07/07/98 SGS

07/08/98 JLA

07/08/98 SGS

Conference with G. Moseley re: Synopsis
revisions; revise Synopsis.

Review and revise Synopsis with dates and
information received from Staff of the Flo
Public Service Commission ("FPSC"}).

Telephone conversation with M. Willis (FPSC) re:

critical dates and discuss timing and loca
customer meeting.

.25 hrs
s 45.00
.50 hrs
rida
25 hrs
tion of
.25 hrs
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United Water Florida Inc. . PAGE 2
"Bill number 600-00701-028 JLA

07/09/98 SGS Revise Synopsis; letter to M. Sambamurthi;
' telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

revisions. .50 hrs
07/10/98 SGS Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi. .25 hrs
07/14/98 JLA Review and revise Synopsis. .50 hrs

07/22/98 SGS Review Synopsis; telephone conversation with B.
Reyes (FPSC) and forward letter to her re:
Synopsis. .50 hrs

07/23/98 SGS Voice mail to B. Reyes re: Synopsis; receipt of
comments from B. Reyes; revise Synopsis;
telephone conversations with B. Reyes, G. Mosely,

and ferward Synopsis to B. Reyes; 1.25 hrs
07/24/98 SGS Letter to D. deNagy re: distribution of Synopsis. .25 hrs
Total fees for this matter 3 817.50

Preparation and Obtaining Approval of Notice of Application for
Adjustment of Rates

07/23/98 SGS Voice mail from and telephone conversation with

D. deNagy re: placement of MFRs and Synopsis. .25 hrs
067/24/98 SGS Prepare draft of Notice and letter to G. Moseley

for review of same. _ v 1.00 hrs
07/29/98 SGS Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi. .25 hrs

07/31/98 SGS Telephone conversation with W. Hill; telephone
conversations with B. Reyes; telephcne
conversation with G. Moseley re: sufficiency of
Notice. ) .75 hrs

Total fees for this matter S 405.00

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data
Request No. 1 (July 2, 1998)

07/02/98 SGS Receipt and review of First Data Request; letter
and facsimile forwarded to J. Schreyer and voice
mail to J. Schreyer. .50 hrs

000100
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United Water
Bill number

07/23/98 SGS

07/24/98 SGS

©07/29/98 SGS

07/30/98 SGS

Florida Inc.

600-00701-028 JLA

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
status of Response to First Data Request and to
T. Mackey re: First Data Request; receipt and
review of Response to First Data Request.

Receipt and review of draft of Response to First
Data Request from client.

Review First Data Request.

Review client’s prepared response; telephone
conversations with T. Mackey, W. Hill, P. Radice
re: contents; receipt and review facsimiles

from client on support for responses; prepare
and transmit filing letter and description sheet
to response.

»

Total fees for this matter

Assistance and Analysis Regarding Expenses to be Incurred in
Connection with Rate Case

07/06/98 SGS

Telephone conversation with D. DeNagy re:
preparation of documentation of rate case
expense, noticing, and other rate case matters;
conference with M. Sambamurthi regarding same.

Total fees for this matter

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Tariff Sheets

07/08/98 SGS

07/09/98 SGS

Review rate structure and changes in rates by
class and meter size per discussion with G.
Moseley.

Review rate differences and percent changes
between classes and meter sizes; telephone
conversation with F. Gradilone to discuss this
matter.

Total fees for this matter

Advise and Assistance in Responding to Customer Comments

PAGE 3

.25 hrs

2.25 hrs

1.00 hrs

4.50 hrs

$ 1,530.00

$

.25 hrs

.00

0
w

.75 hrs

.50 hrs

225.00
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United Water Florida Inc. ‘ PAGE
Bill number 600~-00701-028 JLA

07/21/98 SGS Conference with FPSC re: customer meeting and
complaints; review docket file; conference with
M. Sambamurthi re: obtaining remainder of
complaints. .50

07/22/98 SGS Review complaints; letter to M. Sambamurthi with
copies of complaints. .50

07/23/98 SGS Telephone conversation re: customer complaints. .25

[ &5
T
>

07/31/98 Receive and review complaint from Beth Perry;
telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
Response to Complaint; telephone conversation

with M. Sambamurthi re: inquiries from Ms.

Perry:, .50
07/31/98 SGS Receipt and review of customer complaint from

Ms. Perry. .25

Total fees for this matter $ 395.

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request
No. 2 (July 24, 1998)"

07/27/98 JLA Receive, review and analyze Commission Staff’s
Second Request for additional data. .50

07/27/98 SGS Review request; letter to W. Hill re: request. .50

07/30/98 JLA Telephone conversation with M. Gennari re:
' procedure for response to requests and discussion
of reuse issues raised. .50

07/31/98 JLA Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
responses to reuse issues in Staff’s Second
Request for Data. .25

Total fees for this matter $ 402,

Advise, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Staff Audit
Document/Racord Requests

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

00

hrs

hrs

50
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United Water Florida Inc. . PAGE 5
Bill number 600-00701-028 JLA

07/29/98 JLA Receive and review audit document/record
requests. .50 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 125.00

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request
No. 3 (August 7, 1998)

07/23/98 SGS Telephone conversation with B. Reyes re: Third
Data Request re: consumption and weather factors
and procedures for obtaining information;
telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
direct contact with F. Gradilone. : .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter . ' $ 45,00

BILLING SUMMARY

JAMES L. ADE 3.00 hrs 250 /hr 750.00
SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 18.25 hrs 180 /hr 3,285.00
TOTAL FEES 21.25 hrs $ 4,035.00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1958 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT $ 4,035.00

000103
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LAW OFFICES

MARTIN., ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A,
3000 INDEPENDENT SQUARE
POST OFFICE BOX =9

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

September 30, 1698
Billed through 08/31/98

Bill number 600-00701-032 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 01d Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attn: Mr. Walton F. Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case

Consultation and Advise Concerning Preparation and Filing of
Rate Case Expense Exhibit

08/28/98 JLA Designing and formating of schedule for
preparation of Rate Case Expense Exhibit for
filing with the Florida Public Service Commission
("FPSC").

Total fees for this matter

Preparation and Obtaining Approval of Notice of Application for
Adjustment of Rates

08/03/98 SGS Telephone conversation with B. Reyes (FPSC) re:
notice’s provision concerning monthly billing;
review application and MFRs re: monthly billing
issue; voice mail to J. Schreyer.

TELEPHONE
(904) 354-2080

FEDERAL TAX 1D #59-23%50277

1.50 hrs

375.00

.75 hrs

000104



Uﬁited Water
Bill number

08/04/98

08/07/98

08/11/98

08/29/98

08/30/98

08/31/98

08/31/98

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

JLA

Florida Inc. PAGE
600-00701-032 JLA

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

monthly billing issue, potential restarting of

statutory clock for rate case, conversion of

notice, and customer surveys; receipt of customer

meeting information; revise notice for quarterly
residential bills and staff revisions; telephone
conference with M. Sambamurthi re: same. 1.00

Telephone conversation with B. Reyes to confirm

Staff’'s approval; telephone conversation with M.
Sambamurthi re: copies, etc.; discussion with

Ikon representatives re: copies; receipt and

review of final Notice. .75

Letter to M. Sambamurthi re: printing bill. .25

Draft letters and affidavits to G. Moseley and A.
Alexander (Alexander’s Direct Mailing). .25

Draft affidavits of G. Moseley, A. Alexander and
letters. .25

Revise letters for G. Moseley, A. Alexander and
affidavits; transmit affidavits to A. Alexander;
telephone conversation with A. Alexander re: post

office imprint; confirm that notice was provided

within time schedule rules. .50

Telephone conversation with M. Willis (FPSC) re:

date of Notice to Customers; review of file;

telephone conversation with M, Willis re: Date of

Notice to Customers. .25

Total fees for this matter 3 737.

Preparation and Obtaining Approval of Notice of Customer

Meetings

08/04/98

08/05/98

08/06/98

SGS

SGS

SGS

Draft Notice of Customer Meeting and incorporate
meeting times and locationms. .25

Telephone conversations with S. Smith and W. Hill
re: Notice; voice mail to B. Reyes. .25

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
customer list and mailing instructions; telephone
conversation with B. Reyes re: notice changes. .25

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

50

hrs

hrs

hrs

000105
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United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number

08/06/98

08/11/98

08/14/98

08/17/98

08/18/98

08/19/98

08/23/98

08/24/98

08/25/98

08/26/98

08/29/98

08/30/98

08/31/98

SGS

SGS

5GS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

600-00701-032 JLA

Letter to M. Sambamurthi with draft of Notice of
Customer Meetings.

Revise letter to B. Reyes re: same.

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
notice, copying and mailing; revise customer
notice.

Revise Customer Notice; telephone conversation
with J. Schreyer re: Notices.

Conference with R. Gervasi (FPSC), M. Willis, B.
Davis (FPSC), G. Moseley and M. Sambamurthi re:
notice and customer meeting procedures; provide
draft of notice.

Telephone conversations with M. Sambamurthi and
B. Reyes; revise notice; telephone conversation
with M. Sambamurthi; telephone conversation and
meeting with IKON re: copies.
Letter to M. Sambamurthi re: bill for
reproduction costs.

Voice mail from B. Reyes; telephone conversation
with M. Sambamurthi re: status of notice; fax of
customer notice.

Telephone conversation with T. Mackey; review
notice from M. Sambamurthi; telephone
conversation with a representative of Alexander

Direct Mailing; voice mail to B. Reyes re: status

of notice; telephone conversation with M.
Sambamurthi; telephone conversation with T.
Mackey.

Voice mail from M. Sambamurthi re: affidavits;
letter to B. Reyes re: copies of notices.

Draft letter to G. Moseley and A. Alexander and
affidavits of same.

Draft affidavits of G. Moseley, A. Alexander and
letters.

Revise letters to and affidavits of G. Moseley
and A. Alexander; transmit affidavits and letter
to A. Alexander; telephone conversation with A.
Alexander re: U.S. Post Office Imprints; confirm
that notice was provided within time schedule in
rule.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P A.

PAGE 3

.25 hrs

.50 hrs

1.00 hrs

.75 hrs

1.00 hrs

.50 hrs

.25 hrs

.50 hrs

1.00 hrs

.50 hrs

.25 hrs

.25 hrs

.50 hrs

000106



United Water Florida Inc. ’ PAGE
Bill number

600-00701~-032 JLA

Total fees for this matter $ 1,440.

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data
Request No.

'08/04/98

08/07/98

08/10/98

08/11/98

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

1 (July 2, 1998)

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
supplement to Data Request No. 1; prepare list
for T. Mackey; .25

Prepare memorandum re: supplemental response;
telephone conversation 'with J. Schreyer. 2.50

Review.data request and prepare letter re:
supplemental response. 2.00

Revise letter to J. Schreyer re: supplemental
response; review data response. 1.75

Tétal fees for this matter $ 1,170.

Advise and Assistance in Responding to Customer Comments

08/05/98

08/10/98

08/11/98

08/11/98

08/12/98

08/14/98

SGS

SGS

JLA

SGS

SGS

JLA

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
his draft of response. <25

Telephone conversation with T. Mackey re: San
Jose Packed Tower Aerator; prepare response to
complaint from Mrs. Perry. 1.00

Review and revise Response to Commission Staff
re: customer complaint from Mrs. Perry. .25

Revise response_and letter to M. Sambamurthi;
revise response per suggestions from G. Moseley. .75

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi;

review customer complaint response; conference

with T. Mackey, G. Moseley and M. Sambamurthi;

transmit response. .50

Receive and review South Ponte Vedra Association,

Inc., objection re: absence of fire hydrants;

review of water tariff and Commission Rules re:

fire hydrants; telephone conversation with T.

Mackey. .75

0001

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
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00

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

00

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs
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United Water Florida Inc. PAGE 5
. Bill number 600-~-00701-032 JLA

08/17/98 JLA Receive and review customer comments. .25 hrs

08/17/98 SGS Letter to B. Reyes re: complaints; review South
Ponte Vedra Corporation, Inc.’s complaint. .75 hrs

08/31/98 SGS Review customer complaints; preparation of letter

to send copies to G. Moseley. .50 hrs
68/31/98 JLA Receive and review customer comments. .25 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 1,050.00

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request
No. 2 (July 24, 1998):

14

08/12/98 SGS Conference with representative of United Water
Florida Inc. ("UWF") and United Waterworks Inc.
("UWW") re: preparation of responses to reuse
questions; review M. Sambamurthi’s draft of
. answers to certain requests. 1.00 hrs

08/14/98 SGS Review M. Sambamurthi’s response to certain
requests for information. .75 hrs

08/19/98 SGS Conversation with J. Schreyer re: preparation of
data requests; receipt and review of proposed
responses from G. Grimes; review and revise
response from M., Sambamurthi; research rules of
St. Johns Water Management District ("District”)
re: reuse and watering restrictions; telephone
conversation with a representative of the
District re: watering restrictions; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer re: preparation of
response. 2.50 hrs

08/20/98 SGS Receipt and review of responses from UWW; review
Reuse Plan; receipt and review T. Mackey's
reponses for request nos. 10-37 {except request
nos. 12, 25, 26, 35 and 36); review memorandum of
understanding and water use plan; draft responses

for request nos. 25, 26, 35 and 36. 3.75 hrs
08/21/98 JLA Receive and review Responses to Staff’s Data
Request No. 2. .50 hrs
08/21/98 SGS Review UWW responses to request nos. 1-8; review
. UWF responses; prepare and send to M. Sambamurthi

drafts of responses to request nos. 25, 26, 35

and 36; telephone conversations with M.

Sambamurthi and T. Mackey; revise responses to

request nos. 25, 26, 35 and 36; fax revisions to 000108
MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.



United Water
Bill number

08/22/98

08/23/98

08/24/98

08/25/98

08/26/98

08/28/98

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

JLA

Florida Inc.

600-00701-032 JLA

responses to request nos. 10-37 to T. Mackey with
letter; obtain proposed final responses and
copies of reports.

Review and revise responses to request nos. 1-8;
review and make proposed revisions to responses
to request nos. 9-37.

Prepare letter to B. Bayo; review responses;
transmit proposed revisions to T. Mackey.

Telephone conversation with T. Mackey and refax
comments on data requests; telephone
conversations with T. Mackey re: responses;
revise responses to request nos. 25, 26, 35 and
36; letter to T. Mackey re: final draft of
responses.

Telephone conversations with S. Smith re:
refaxing responses; telephone conversation with
J. Schlissel re: faxing responses; letter to B.
Bayo; telephone conversations with T. Mackey, M.
Sambamurthi and W. Hill.

Review of responses to Staff’s Data Request No.
2.

Review and consider Response to Staff’s Requests
for Data Nos. 1 and 2.

Total fees for this matter

Advise, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Staff Audit
Document /Record Requests

08/04/98

08/10/98

08/10/98
08/17/98

08/21/98

SGS

JLA

SGS

JLA

JLA

Review audit requests and responses.

Receive and review Staff audit and document
requests.

Review audit requests.
Receipt and review responses to Audit Requests.

Receive and review Responses to Staff Audit
Requests.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA.

PAGE

.50

.50

$ 5,055.

.50

.25

.73

.25

.50

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

00

hrs

hrs
hrs

hrs

hrs
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United Water Florida Inc.

Bill number

08/21/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

600-00701-032 JLA

status of audit; review audit requests.

08/24/98 SGS Rewview Audit Requests.

08/26/98 JLA Receive and review Audit Requests.

08/26/98 SGS Review additional audit requests.

08/31/98 JLA Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
progress of audit by Commission Staff in New

Jersey.

Total fees for this matter

+

.PAGE

.50

.25

.25

.25

[N
wn

$ 780.

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request

No. 3 (August 7,

08/07/98 SGS Telephone conversations with F. Gradilone, B.

1998)

Reyes re: diskettes containing response, service

list and voice mail

with M. Egan Long re: data

requests; telephone conversation with J. Schreyer

re:

procedure.

Total fees for this matter

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request

No. 4

08/06/98 SGS Telephone conversation with B. Reyes re: errors
in E-1 and E-2 Schedules and forthcoming data

tequest; telephone conversation with F. Gradilone

re:

08/32/98 SGS Draft letter to J. Schreyer and review Fourth

revised sheets needed.

Data Request.

08/31/98 SGS Letter to J. Schreyer re: Fourth Data Request.

Total fees for this matter

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P A.

.50

.50

.25

$ 225.

000110
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United Water Florida Inc. PAGE 8
Bill number 600-00701-032 JLA

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Rasponse to Data Request
No. 5

08/31/98 SGS Telephone conversation with B. Reyes; letter to
J. Schreyer; review data request. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter S 45.00

BILLING SUMMARY

’

JAMES L. ADE 6.25 hrs 250 /hr 1,562.50

SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 53.00 hrs 180 /hr 9,540.00

TOTAL FEES 59.25 hrs $11,102.50

TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT $11,102.50
000111
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LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A.
3000 INDEPENDENT SQUARE
POST OFFICE BOX 59

JACKSONVILLE. FLORIDA 32201

October 30, 1998
Billed through 09/30/98

Bill number 600-00701-033 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 0ld Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799 °

Attn: Mr. Walton F. Hill

14

UWF/1968 Rate Case

Advise and Assistance in Responding to Customer Comments

09/02/98 SGS

09/03/98 SGS

09/04/98 SGS

09/08/98 JLA

Letter to G. Moseley re: customer comments.

Receive and review letter from R. LaBelle (a
customer); update Customer Comments outline for
September 10, 1998 meeting; letter to B. Bayo re:
check for copies of complaints; letter to G.
Moseley re: R. LaBelle letter and outline;
telephone call with T. Mackey re: South Ponte
Vedra Association letter.

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi;
telephone conversation with T. Mackey re: South
Ponte Vedra Association, Inc.; review additional
customer comments; telephone conversation with G.
Moseley re: W. Tucker’s (a customer) letter, R.
LaBelle letter and attendance at meeting; review
T. Mackey’s response to South Ponte Vedra
Association, Inc.; telephone conversation with T.
Mackey.

Receive and review customer comments; receive and
review responses to C. Hill (Florida Public
Service Commission ["FPSC"]) re: a customer
comment regarding fire hydrants in South Ponte
Vedra area.

TELEPRONE
(904) 3854-2080
FEDERAL TAX 10 #59-2380277

.25 hrs

2.50 hrs

.75 hrs

000112



United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number

09/08/98

09/09/98
109/10/98
09/10/98
09/11/98

09/14/98

09/15/98

09/16/98

09/17/98

09/17/98

09/18/98

09/21/98

SGS

JLA

JLA

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

JLA

SGS

SGS

SGS

600-00701-033 JLA

Receive and review customers comments; review
various drafts of responses by T. Mackey;
telephone conversation with T. Mackey and G.
Moseley.

Receive and review customer comments; letter to
G. Moseley.

Receive from FPSC and review customer comments
and FPSC’s responses; letter to G. Moseley.

Review customer comments from public records
request; conference with G. Moseley.

Review notes and‘“prepare response to customer
comments.

Receive facsimile from G. Moseley re: South Ponte
Vedra Association, Inc.; conversation with G.
Moseley re: same and Proposed Agency Action
("PAA"); telephone conversation with J. Schreyer
re: response to customer complaints.

Receive and review letter from G. Moseley re:
customer responses.

Receive and review additional customer comments.
Receive from M. Willis (FPSC) and review
documents presented to FPSC Staff during customer
service meetings.

Review customer comments; draft response.
Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re: audit
report and customer comments; receipt of response

to customer calculations.

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:
service areas represented.

Total fees for this matter

Advise, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Staff Audit
Document/Record Requests

09/02/98 SGS Review Audit Response No. 43.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 3220t

PAGE

2.00

.50

1.00

.75

1.50

1.00

.25

.25

.25

4.00

.50

.25

$ 3,325,

.25

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

nrs

hrs

hrs

00

hrs
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United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number

09/03/98
09/04/98
09/08/98
09/10/98

09/11/98

09/29/98

09/30/98

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request

JLA

SGS

JLA

JLA

SGS

JLA

SGS

600-00701-033 JLA

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
status of audit by FPSC auditors in New Jersey.

Telephone conversation with M. Egan-Long; review
City of Jacksonville Municipal Code re: water and
sewer rates.

Review of responses to audit requests.

Receive and review responses to audit requests.

Review requests and responses.

Receive and review Respénses to Audit Requests
DV~1 and DV-2.

Receive and review audit response.

Total fees for this matter

No. 3 (August 7, 1998)

09/03/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request

No. &

09/01/98

09/02/98

SGS

5GS

09/03/98 SGS

filing response and address to send rate
department information.

Total fees for this matter

Conference with B. Reyes (FPSC) re: status of
Data Request No. 4; conference with R. Iacullo
re: Data Request No. 4.

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re: need
to expedite response time on data request.

Telephone conversation with F. Gradilone re:

discovery for Data Request No. 4 and timing of
response; voice mail to B. Reyes.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P A,

$

PAGE 3
«25 hrs
.25 hrs
.50 hrs

.25 hrs

.75 hrs

.25 hrs

.25 hrs

582.50

.25 hrs

45.00

.25 hrs

.25 hrs

.25 hrs

000114



United Water Florida Inc. ' PAGE 4
Bill number 600-00701~-033 JLA

09/04/98 SGS Receive and review facsimiles from F. Gradilone
: and M. Egan-Long; telephone conversation with F.
Gradilone. .25 hrs

09/08/98 SGS Telephone conversation with F. Gradilone; review
Data Requests prepared by United Water Florida
Inc. ("UWF"); telephone conversation with B.
Reyes re: status. .75 hrs

'09/09/98 JLA Review of drafts of Response to Data Request No.
4, .50 hrs

09/09/98 SGS Review Response to Data Request No. 4 and
telephone conversation with F. Gradilone re:
changes. g 1.00 hrs

09/10/98 SGS Conferenge with B. Reyes re: status; review
Responses to Data Requests Nos. 3 and 4;
telephone conversation with F. Gradilone re:
issues; telephone conversation with J. Schreyer
re: status. 1.25 hrs

09/11/98 SGS Preparation and submittal to the FPSC of the
Response to Data Request No. 4. .75 hrs

Total fees for this matter L3 980.00

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request
No. 5

09/03/98 SGS Telephone conversation with F. Gradilone re:
. discovery for Data Request No. 5 and timing of
response; voice mail to B. Reyes. .25 hrs

09/04/98 SGS Telephone conversation with F. Gradilone; receive
revised Response to Data Request No., 5. .50 hrs

09/08/98 SGS Telephone conversation with F. Gradilone; review
Response to Data Request No. 5 prepared by UWF;
telephone conversation with B. Reyes re: status. 2.75 hrs

09/09/98 JLA Review of drafts of Response to Data Request No,
3. .50 hrs

09/09/98 SGS Review Response to Data Request No. 5 and
telephone conversation with F. Gradilone re:
changes. 2.00 hrs

000115
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United Water
Bill number

09/10/98 SGS

09/11/98 SGS

09/15/98 SGS

Florida Inc.
600-00701-033 JLA

Review Response to Data Request No. 5; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer; telephone
conversation with F. Gradilone re: changes and
issues; facsimile changes to F. Gradilone.

Telephone conversation with F. Gradilone;
preparation and submittal to the FPSC of the
Response to Data Request No. 5.

Telephone conversation with B. Reyes re: FPSC

receipt of Responses to Data Request Nos. 4 and
5.

Total fees for this matter

¢
’

Advice, Consultation and Assistance in Customer Hearings

09/04/98 SGS

09/08/98 JLA

09/08/98 SGS

09/09/98 JLA

09/10/98 JLA

09/10/98 SGS

09/11/98 JLA

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
attendance at customer meetings; telephone
conversation with M. Sambamurthi re: attendance
at customer meetings.

Preparation for customer meetings; telephone
conversation with G. Moseley.

Preparation for customer meetings; telephone
conversation with B. Reyes re: attendance at
homeowners meeting; preparation for customer
meetings.

Telephone conversation with M. Sambamurthi re:

. arrangements for customer meetings.

Attendance at customer meetings held in the
morning and in the evening.

Preparation for and attendance at customer
meetings held in the morning; preparation for and
attendance at customer meeting held in the
evening; conference with FPSC members re: case.

Consideration of strategy for responses to
customer comments at customer meetings; telephone
conversation with D. deNagy; telephone
conversation with G. Moseley.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA,
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

PAGE

.25

$ 1,790.

.25

1.00

.25

3.75

7.00

hrs

hrs

hrs

00

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs

hrs
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United Water Florida Inc.
Bill number 600-00701-033 JLA

09/11/98 SGS Attendance at meetings with customers and FPSC
: Staff members; conference with M. Willis and T.
Randall (FPSC); telephone conversation with J.
Schreyer re: results of the customer meetings.

Total fees for this matter

" Additional Conferences, Telephone Conversations and

Correspondence with Representatives of Client; Commission Staff

and Public Counsel

09/10/98 JLA Receive and review Order Suspending Proposed
Rates; preparation of a letter to G. Moseley.

09/17/98 JLA Telephone conversation with a reporter from the

Times Union re: information regarding rate

increase requested.

Total fees for this matter

Advise and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request

No. 6

09/29/98 SGS Review Data Reguest No. 6; telephone conversation

with J. Schreyer re: same.
09/30/98 SGS Telephone conversaton with R. Corbin re:

Municipal Service District and additional
customers of Nassau County.

Total fees for this matter

BILLING SUMMARY

JAMES L. ADE 12.25 hrs
SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 41.25 hrs
TOTAL FEES 53.50 hrs

TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

250 /hr
180 /hr

PAGE 6

1.50 hrs

$ 3,503.00

.25 hrs

.25 hrs

$ 125.00

.50 hrs

.25 hrs

$ 135.00

3,062.50
7,425.00

$10,487.50

000117



LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A,
3000 INDERPENDENT SQUARE
POST OFFICE BOX 59 TELEPHONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 1904) 3542080
November 23, 1998

FEDERAL TAx 10 #s595-2350277
Billed 10/01/98-10/31/98
Bill number 600-00701-035 JLA
United Water Florida Inc.
200 0ld Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attn: Mr. Walton F. Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case ’

Advice and Assistance in Responding to Customer Comments

10/02/98 SGS Letter to Florida Public Service Commission
("FPSC") requesting rate case transcripts of
customer meetings held on September 10, 1998. .25 hrs

10/08/98 SGS Response to Question No. 13 and transmit to T.
Mackey re: letter to South Ponte Vedra
Association. .25 hrs

10/09/98 JLA Letter to G. Moseley enclosing customer
complaints, FPSC responses to customer complaints

and documents presented at customer meetings. .25 hrs
10/09/98 SGS Review customer comments. .25 hrs
10/27/98 SGS Prepare exhibit responding to customer comments. 1.00 hrs
10/28/98 SGS Prepare responses to customer comments. 2.00 hrs

10/29/98 SGS Prepare response to customer comments; review

customer testimony. 4,00 hrs
10/30/98 SGS Prepare response to customer comments. 6.00 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 2,537.50
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United Water Florida Inc. . PAGE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

2
Bill number 600-00701-035 JLA
Advice, Consultation and Assistance Regarding Staff Audit
Document /Record Requests
10/01/98 SGS Review audit responses; telephone conversation
with J. Schreyer. .25 hrs
110/05/98 SGS Review audit requests. .50 hrs
10/07/98 JLA Review Responses to Audit Requests DV-5 and DV-8;
review of records and file to determine correct
amount of legal fees charged to rate case
expense. . 1.25 hrs
10/07/98 SGS Receipt and review of responses to audit
' requests. ‘ .75 hrs
10/10/98 JLA Review of responses to audit requests from D.
Vandiver (FPSC). .75 hrs
10/13/98 SGS Receive and review responses to audit requests. .50 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 860.00
Additional Conferences, Telephone Conversations and
Correspondence with Representatives of Client; Commission Staff
and Public Counsel
10/05/98 JLA Telephone conversation with M. Willis (FPSC) and
W. Hill re: waiver of statutory five-month time
limit for FPSC action re: rate relief. .50 hrs
10/06/98 JLA Telephone conversations with W. Hill and M.
Willis re: extension of five-month requirement
for FPSC action on rate adjustment; letter to B.
Bayo. .75 hrs
10/07/98 JLA Letter to M. Willis re: waiver of five-month
statutory requirement for FPSC vote on
Application. .25 hrs
10/26/98 SGS Telephone conversation with W. Hill re: an
additional two week extension requested by Staff;
letter to B. Bayo re: same; telephone with G.
Moseley re: same. .50 hrs
Total fees for this matter $ 465.00
MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P A. O 0 0 1 1 9
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United Water Florida Inc. -
Bill number

600-00701-035 JLA

PAGE 3

Advice and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request

No. 6

10/01/98

10/02/98

10/04/98

10/05/98

10/06/98

10/07/98

10/07/98

10/08/98

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

SGS

JLA

5GS

JLA

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
preparation of Response to Data Request No. 6.

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:
Question No. 3; receive facsimile frem J.
Schreyer; telephone conversation with B. Reyes
(FPSC) re: delay in responding to Data Request
No. 6.

Obtain and review proposed responses.

Review groposed Response to Data Request No. 6;
telephone conversation with T. Mackey; review
letters and response to South Ponte Vedra
Association; telephone conversations with J.
Schreyer, T. Mackey, and F. McGuire re: Florida
Department of Transportation ("DOT")
Contributions-In-Aid-of-Construction ("CIAC");

.25 hrs

.50 hrs

.50 hrs

receive and review facsimile re: DOT CIAC; revise

responses; review annual report with T. Mackey;
prepare draft of letter to B. Bayo; review audit
responses re: issues in Data Request No. 6.

6.00 hrs

Letter to J. Schreyer re: Question Nos. 4, 5, 12,

and 13; receive, review, and revise Response to
Question No. 3,

Receipt and review of Responses to Staff Data
Request No. 6.

Telephone conversation with T. Mackey re: Ponte
Vedra wastewater treatment plant; prepare
revisions to Data Request No. 6; telephone
conversaton with B. Reyes re: extension for
reply.

Review of Responses to Staff Data Request No. 6.

Total fees for this matter

3.00 hrs

.50 hrs

1.25 hrs

.25 hrs

$ 2,257.50

Advice and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request

No. 7

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 3220
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United Water Florida Inc. ' PAGE

4

Bill number 600-00701-035 JLA
10/08/98 SGS Telephone conversation with T. Mackey re:

preparation of Response to Data Request No. 7;

letter to B. Bayo. .50 hrs
10/09/98 SGS Receipt, review, and analysis of proposed

Response to Data Request No. 7 re: Black Fords

Creek and Lofton Creek. 1.00 hrs
10/19/98 JLA Review Response to Data Request No. 7. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 332.50
Advice and Assistance ;in Preparation of Response to Data Request
No. 8
10/12/98 SGS Telephone conversations to F. McGuire re: subject

area of FPSC Staff questions; telephone

conversation with B. Reyes, D. Draper (FPSC), and

P. Lester (FPSC) re: capital structure. 1.00 hrs
10/13/98 SGS Receive and review facsimile from F. McGuire re:

response to conference call. .50 hrs
10/14/98 SGS Review Data Request No. 8; telephone conversation

with F. McGuire; receive facsimile from F.

McGuire. .50 hrs
10/15/98 SGS Prepare to file Response to Data Request No. 8;

telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

facsimile of a copy of the letter. .25 hrs
10/16/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

facsimile of letter from F. McGuire. .25 hrs
10/19/98 SGS Prepare letter to B. Bayo and file Response to

Data Request No. 8. .50 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 540.00
Advice and Assistance in Preparation of Audit Report
10/13/98 JLA Review and analysis of FPSC Audit Report

and obtaining exhibits attached to Audit Report. 2.00 hrs

000121
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United Water Florida Inc. PAGE 5

Bill number

10/13/98 SGS

10/14/98 JLA

10/14/98 SGS

10/15/98 SGS

10/16/98 JLA

10/16/98 SGS

10/18/98 SGS

10/19/98 JLA

600-00701-035 JLA

Receive and review of facsimile of Audit Report;

receive memorandum from J. Schreyer re:

assignment of duties; telephone conversation with

R. Hicks (FPSC) re: exhibits to Audit Report. 2.00 hrs

Conference with W. Hill; telephone conference

call with W. Hill, M. Gennari, F. McGuire, B.

Becker, J. Schreyer, and S. Schildberg re:

Response to Audit Report; preparation of Response

to Audit Report. 3.75 hrs

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

telephone conference call; telephone conversation

with M. Gennari, Stan (engineer), B. Becker, F.

McGuire, W. Hill, J. Schreyer, and J. Ade re:

Exception Nos. 1-4 and Disclosure Nos. 1-9;

receive-facsimile of exhibits from R. Hicks;

receive facsimile from J. Schreyer. 5.75 hrs

Prepare drafts of company comments tc Audit
Report, General Section; telephone cenversation
with J. Schreyer re: same; review audit responses
re: reconciliations and journal entries;
telephone conversation with J. Schreyer;
telephone conversation with D. deNagy re: Audit
Request No. 4; draft Response to Audit Exception
No. 1; review NARUC USOA; draft response to Audit
Exception No. 2; telephone conversation with J.
Schreyer; draft letter to W. Hill; receive and
review Response to Audit Request No. 4. 8.00 hrs

Review and revise draft of Response to Audit
Report. 1.00 hrs

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer re:

status of responses on Exception Nos. 3 and 4 and

Disclosure Nos. 1-7; update draft to include

information re: NARUC accounting and G Schedules;

telephone conversations with J. Schreyer and W.

Hill; receive and review responses tc Audit

Report; receive and review of B. Becker’s

comments to Audit Report; prepare redline drafts

of responses to Audit Report; telephone

conversatons with J. Schreyer and W. Hill. 6.25 hrs

Prepare responses to Exception Nos. 1-4;
telephone conversation with J. Schreyer. 4.50 hrs

Telephone conference call with J. Schreyer, B.

Becker, F. McGuire, J. Gebbia, T. Cleveland, F.

Hildabrand, and W. Hill re: Response to Audit

Report. 1.50 hrs
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United Water
Bill number

10/19/98

10/20/98

10/20/98

10/21/98

10/21/98

10/22/98

10/23/98

10/23/98

10/26/98

SGS

JLA

SGS

JLA

SGS

SGS

JLA

SGS

SGS

Florida Inc.
600-00701-035 JLA

Prepare drafts of Exception Nos. 1, 2, and 4;
telephone conversation with J. Schreyer, M.
Gennari, B. Becker, T. Cleveland, F. McGuire, F.
Hildabrand re: facsimile re: Exception No. 3;
facsimile from J. Schreyer re: conference with
FPSC sStaff.

Telephone conversation with M. Willis re:
Response to Audit Report.

Facsimile re: Disclosure No. 1; draft responses
to Exception Nos. 1-4; telephone conversations
with D. deNagy, J. Schreyer, W. Hill, and F.
McGuire; draft responses to Exception Nos. 1-4;
receive facsimile from F. McGuire; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer; draft response to
Exception No. 3; facsimile re: $29,000.00
difference; review deposit policy.

Determine status of Response to Audit Report.

Revise respone to Exception No. 3; facsimile from
W. Hill re: Exception Nos. 1, 2, and 4; letter to
M. Willis re: draft; telephone conversations with
D. deNagy, J. Schreyer, W. Hill, F. McGuire re:
draft of responses to Exception Nos. 1-4 and
draft of responses to Disclosure Nos. 1-9, and
schedules; facsimile draft of responses to
Disclosure Nos. 1-9 to W. Hill; receive response
from J. Schreyer.

Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer and W.
Hill; revise responses to disclosures; telephone
conversation with J. Schreyer re: revisions to
responses to Disclosure Nos. 1, 3, 6, 7, 8, and
9; telephone conversation with F. Gradilone, D.
deNagy; J. Schreyer, W. Hill; letters to M.
Willis with drafts of disclosures.

Arrangements for filing Response to Audit Report;
telephone conversation with W. Hill.

Letter to B. Bayo; telephone conversations with
W. Hill re: timing; telephone conversation with a
member of the FPSC Staff of Records and
Reporting; telephone conversation with M.
Sambamurthi re: Audit Report.

Telephone conversation with B. Davis re:
e-mail/diskette of Audit Report; letter to B.
Bayo with diskette; telephone conversation with
W. Hill re: same.

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, BA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

PAGE 6

8.50 hrs

.25 hrs

10.30 hfs

.25 hrs

10.00 hrs

12.00 hrs

.50 hrs

2.50 hrs

.50 hrs
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United Water Florida Inc. PAGE 7
Bill number " 600-00701-035 JLA

10/27/98 JLA Review of Comments to Audit Report. 1.75 hrs

10/29/98 SGS Telephone conversation with J. Schreyer;
telephone conversation with member of the Staff
of FPSC re: missing page; letter to B. Bayo re:
missing page. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $15,485.00

Advice and Assistance in Preparation of Response to Data Request
- Informal Request

10/20/98 SGS Telephone conversation with B. Reyes, D. Drayer,
etc., ré: financial statements; telephone v
conversation with J. Schreyer. .75 hrs

10/26/98 SGS Telephone conversation with B. Reyes re: staff
request for information re: capital structure;
telephone conversation with F. McGuire; telephone
conversation with B. Reyes. .75 hrs

10/27/98 SGS Telephone conversation with F. McGuire re:
information no longer required. .25 hrs

Total fees for this matter $ 315.00

BILLING SUMMARY

JAMES L. ADE 15.75 hrs 250 /hr 3,937.50

SCOTT G. SCHILDBERG 104.75 hrs 180 /hr 18,855.00

TOTAL FEES 120.5C hrs $22,792.50

TOTAL CHARGES FOR 1998 APPLICATION FOR RATE ADJUSTMENT $22,792.50
000124
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Vendor/Payee

Alexander’s
Direct Mailing
Alexander’s
Direct Mailing
Alexander’s
Direct Mailing
Alexander’s
Direct Mailing
Alexander’s
Direct Mailing

American Express
Aon Consulting,

FPSC
FPSC
FPSC
FPSC

Federal Express
Federal Express

Futch Printing
Futch Printing
Futch Printing
Futch Printing

Ikon
Ikon

Kinko’s
Kinko's

Martin,
Martin,
Martin,
Martin,
Martin,
Martin,

Ade
Ade
Ade
Ade
Ade
Ade

RA-Deferred
RA-Deferred
RA-Deferred
RA-Deferred
RA-Deferred

TOTAL

Rate
Rate
Rate
Rate
Rate

Inc.

Case
Case
Case
Case
Case

Schedule 4

MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES SUMMARY

Subject

Mailing Services
Mailing Services
Mailing Services

Mailing Services

Outstanding Credit

Air Fare

" Actuarial Study

Filing Fee

Audit Related Fee
Audit Related Fee
Audit Related Fee

Through 8-17-98
Through 8-1-98

Envelopes
Envelopes
Envelopes
Envelopes

Notice Printing
Notice Printing

Copies for Rate Case
Copies for Rate Case

Expernse
Expense
Expense
Expense
Expense
Expense

Reimbursement
Reimbursement
Reimbursement
Reimbursement

-Reimbursement

Reimbursement

$ 2,257.
$ 2,257
7,750
3,880

(1,049

556.
5,600.

9,000.
1,018.
1,333.

975.

30.
28.

1,064.
11s.
1,031.
946.

2,385.
3,961.

3,194.
800.

.81
.00
.42

.00)

00

$48,137.85
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Jnited Water.

UNITED WATER FLORIDA

200 Oid Hook Road
He

/

‘on Park, New Jersey 07640-1738

MELLON BANK NA, PHILADELPHIA

PAY Two thousand two hundred fifty seven and 81/100 Dollars

ALEXANDER'S OIRECT MAIL SERVICE

4870 Victor St
To the Jacksonville, FL 32256

order of

824731
Mellon Bank (DE) N.A. '
Wilmin gton, DE
Check Number Check Dais
00093316 09/03/38

$2,257.81***

wkssrFILE COPY*#*as

CHECIKK DATE

CHECK NUMBER -
UNITED WATER FLORIDA 50550 RITE
INVOICE
GABER — VOUCHERNUMBER | GROSS AMOUNT DISCOUNT NET AMOUNT
8250 08/26/98 00013321 2,257.81 0.00 2,257.81
-]
[N
=
-
- — (@]
VENDOR NAME VENDOR TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL DISCOUNTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT |©
Alexander's Direct Mail Service 0000009452 $2,257.81 $0.00 $2,257.81




ALEXANDER'S DIRECT MAIL SERVICES, INC.

\70 VICTOR ST.
CKSONVILLE, FL 32256

BILLTO

UNITED WATER
JANNETT DELANEY

1400 MILLCOE RD
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32225

#9452

All materials supplied by customer

Invoice
DATE | INVOICE #ﬁg
8/26/98 8250 |
S0O5018
\( = (D320
oI (G 39

sy |
g\ >\ P.0. NO. TERMS
© Net10
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT -

27.689 DIRECT PRINTING 35.00 969.12
27.689 MACHINE FOLDING 8.00 221.51
‘.689 MACHINE FOLDING 8.00 221.51
.689 MACHINE INSERTING 30.00 830.67
' DELIVERY TO POST OFFICE 15.00 15.00

Reo Tt 1746

s B - et # | §6 400

Q/25 MAILING .

5/\}8— #* To52 45

UNITED WATER '_F_LOR\DA

RECEIVED
AUG 3 1 1909

PROCUREMENT DEPT,

AT

-—"

Total: $2,257.81 |
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ITED WATER FLORIDA / MANAGERS FUND ) f

ALEXANDERS DIRECT MAIL SERVICE INC .8/21/1998
“8 186400 T052881 400 .

i~
o

. .-\ \T\’ \._.
e ! N WA
\\ i s 5 -
y oo :
vy
~=
Chacking Custorner Notice Mailouts-Rate Case Inv #8225 8/14/

000129
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s

’ALEXANDER‘S DIRECT MAIL SERVICES, INC.

Invoice
4870 VICTOR ST.
JACKSONVILLE, FLL 32256 DATE INVOICE #
8/14/98 8225

BILL TO S04978

UNITED WATER

JANNETT DELANEY

1400 MOLCOE RD

JACKSONVILLE, FL. 32225

-

All materials supplied by customer

P.0. NO. TERMS
Net 10
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT
27.689 DIRECT PRINTING 35.00 969.12
27.689 MACHINE FOLDING 8.00 221.51
27.689 MACHINE FOLDING 8.00 221.51
27.689 MACHINE INSERTING 30.00 830.67
DELIVERY TO POST OFFICE 15.00 15.00
6 £ ﬂ—?\‘
R ! i
AUG 21 1888
' 8/12 MAILING ?
Total: $2,257.81 |

—— et
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'UNITED WATER FLORIDA

T BANK,

gamisan 15737
15 MANAGERS PUND. - JACKSONVILLE, FY, 322 S
JACKSONV(LL. FL32239 83-234/630
‘ 8/10r1998
PAYTOTHE Al ExCANDE ' Il QREBUAE '
PAYTOTHE  ALEXANDERS DIRECT MAIL SERVICE INC | $ w7950.00
Seven Thousand Seven Hundred Fifty and 00/100™™ TS S ST T I s e YT T b e ] S SN -,
e
ALEXANDER'S DIRECT MAIL Dol 1 hxa
SERVICE INC. 2 SIGNATURES REQUIRED .
. 6356 PHILLIPS PARKWAY DR N FOR AMGUNTS QVER $2000.00

"JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32255

Memo_ Customer Notice Mallouts-Rate Case

100 S 730 110E3I0023LENOO0?00037678 73w .l'G?SGGD:“
UNITED WATER FLORIDA / MANAGERS FUND 1573
. ALEXANDERS DIRECT MAIL SERVICE INC §/10/1998 -
18 186400 T052981 400 ' 7.7580.00
/. X
1\..‘. ... .
¥ | |
\ . .-".'j',.'
Checking Customer Notice h(éilouts-Rate Case 7.750.00
)
113 {348
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20 States Postal Service
Postage Statement — First-Class Mail — Permit Imprint

g or Prcrity Mail, Use Form 3605-R) Z)d

.All.!ﬁ: Complata all itams by typewritar, pen, or indelidle pencil. If you need a recaipt, prapara Ia duplicate.

3%

PostOmes of Meiling  ~ Maliag Dsze Procesaing Catagory USPS Authorized Mailing 10 Codaels)
Jacksanvills, FL Cg o8 Leztar (DN COS0)
Permiz Ne. Fadoral Agency Coat Code Sawement Sequence No, D Flats (OMM CO50)
842 4978 WAT36017.73 E] Automalion-Compatitie Fiats
Parmit Holder's Tsiapnone Rucsipt No. ({DMM C3820) -
Nampe and Addreas }443-73
{inckida ZIF Code) (304 7384 — ] treguar Parcels (DM COS0) %
g Alexander's Direct Mall Services, Inc. Cantainer Quantitias (Fd in alf that apply) :
= Wiray R z Wiran 1 Hlitme__ T4 ‘ \&
g 4870 Victor St ~x ) «
g | Jacksonville FL. 32207- Tan oS areaNIA JEn _ [Pre DR (Thack ol tat apply)
E Weight of & M 130 (Lakers, flam, parcals)
= S:ngle Pince e e e D034 onas Duﬂq'mpgndabb letters)
'?-f Pun & Bradstrect No. Tl Places . Total Waight [Ous10 (Auromation lattars)
= | cTAS Cust Ret. 10 : 775 26.660 |1 m820 (Autamaton flats)
Name and Address of individual or Organization for Which | Name ang Address of Maiing Agent
Nailing Is Prepared (¥ othar than pormit holdar) (¥ othar than perrnR
United Water Florica Inc. ' Alaxander's Direct Mall Servicas, Inc.
1400 Millcos Rd !
Jacksonviile FL. 32225~ Jacksonville FL 32207-
Oua & BradstveetNe. . _____ Cun & Bradstreet No. -
C 18 Forautamation rata letter~size piaces atherthan cards atcard ratns (DMM CB10), go o Pant A on tha
_._O- tevarse of this form. Part A $ g.000
W Forautemation rats flats (OMM CB20), go to Part B on the feverse af this lorm. Postage .
. g ) (From Part B $ 0.000
2y For noaaulomation rate pieces othat than cards atcard rates (DMM COS0), go to Part € on the raverse
3 Pan C $ 228.525
O raverse of this torm, side)
." B For postl cards and posteards at card rates (DMM E100), go to Part D on e reverse of this form. Part D s 0.000
] —-—
g Dwdiuonal Pastage Payment (Stale reasons) C]Satchl Servica (Specity) No. Pleces %S . oe Per P='= 0.000
a
g Total Postage s 228.625
Tha gignature of a maiar certifies Mat it will ba liable for and agreas o psy, subject to appeals prascribed by pests! laws and ragulations, any
ravenue daficiancies assessed on this malling. (f this form ks signed by an agent, the agent certfies that it is authorized lo sign this statement, that
the certification binds the agen! and the maiter, and that both the mailer and the agant wil be liable for and agree 1o pay any deficlencles.)
The submission of 3 false, fietltious, or fraudulent slatemert may resuk in impdscnment of up o 5 years and a fine of up o $10,063 (18 USC 10Q1). In adden, a civil
penaky of up to $5,000 and an additional assessment 0t twice the amouat fakkely clsimad may be impasad (31 USC 3802).
g [ Por Enciosed Reply Pleces (Automatian rate only) (Effective Janvary 1, 18§7): | certify that any business teply, courtesy reply, er melercd rsply letter:
:.5 size cards or envalopes, endesed in the pleces described above, bear the correct facing identificatlon mark (FIM) and ,
é’ [Tl For Updatad Addresses (Fresarted and automation rates anly) (Effective January 1, 1997}: 1 certify that the addresses appearing en the pieces
T descrbed above have been updated within 8 months of the date of this mailing using a USPS-approved address update tool.
8 ] For ZIP Cades (Prasorted rate only) (Efective October 1, 1995): | certify that the ZIP Cades appearing on the piecas described above have been
verified and corrected whers nccessry within 12 months of the date of this mailing using a USPS-approved methed.
| hereby cartify that all Information furnished on this form Is accurate and truthful, that this majling meets all applicable CASS/MASS
standards for address and Barcoda accuracy, and thatthe matarhilpresented quaillias for the rates of postage ctaimed.
Signaturo of Perntt Hok er or Agant (Bath princioal and ageat are fable lor any g deficioncy lhcurred, Telsphone
[ (804)-443-7384

NP My s (g
gy e

¥in g ..‘ : 4 -5 )
S e

010 04.2 Financizl Decymant ~~ Forward to Finance Cffice



- Form 3600-R — First-Class Mail — Permit Imprint

‘, Postage Computation
gson ! . Presort/
Automation Nat Cournt Automation Net Count
Discounts Rate {Pc3.) Charge Ciscourts Rale (Pes.) Charge
m Automation Rates ~— Letiers (DMM C210) Other Than Cards at B Automstion Rates — Flats (DMM C820) R
Card Rates
Carriar Route x pes.a$ as x pcs. = §, —
5-Digit x pcs.=$ Basic X pcs. = §
8-Digit : x pes.= S, Nonstandard Surcharge
(1 applicable) 05x pes. = $
Basle X pes. = $
Total ~— Part A (Carry to front of form) $___0.000 | Total— Part B (Carry o front of form) $_____0.000
Nonautomation Rates — Other Than Cards at Card Rates » Pogtal Cards and Postcards at Card Rates
Attomatien®
Prascried 0.2985% 775 pes, = §___228.625 Carrier Route 140 x pcs. = 8,
Single-Fiece x pes. = § 5-Digit 143 x pes. =S
Nonstandard Surcharge a-Digit L1589 x pes. =S,
(If applicabls)
Ptescnted L5 x pes.=$ Basic .166 x pcs. = §
Single-Piece a1 x pes. e S Nonautomalian
Presorad 180 x pcs.= S,
Single-Pisce 200 x pes. = $
v * Available enly for avicmation-campatible cards (DMM C810) v
Yotal — Part C (Carry to front of form) S__228625 | Total — Pant D (Canry to front of form) s___ 0000

PS Form 3600-R, July 1998 (Reverse)

Facsimile printed by Mail Manager 2010 01.24



Urited States Postal Service

Postage Statement — First-Class Mail — Permit Imprint
"r Priority Mail, Use Form 3605-A) Yoy
WER: Completa all tems3 by typawritar, pen, arindelible pencil. If you need u racalpt, prepare fn duplicate.
Post Office of Malliag * saalng Dsle Pracessing Category USPS Authorized Maillag 10 Code(:)
Jacksonville, FL #1938 Latars (DMM COS0) %
Permi No. Federal Agency Cast Sode Statemaent Sequance Na. D Flazs (OMM COS0)
342 4STBWAT3EN7.73 | : Q&
Automation-Compatibla Flxts 3\"{'\‘
Perms Hoder's Talephone Raceipt No. (DMM CE20)
N.m._ an;];“us; (904)443-7384 . __ [ imeguinr Parcels (OMM Cosc) % @
£ | Alexander's Direct Mail Services, Inc. - Cenwines Quanutias (Filin 2 that epply) %%
= ivae I H;t‘l'rmi%g Stae____ T 83
"E‘ 4870 Victor St . ;
5 Jacksonville FL 32207- T g _ NESNA N Prepered Under OMM (Chack 8 0t apph)
s Weightota Dmso (Lenrs, lats, parcals)
s Sngle Placa e ¥ e 0.0344 o ynas Duzsa (Uparaaable leners)
==|Oun & Bradstreat No. Total Pieces Tatal Weight - us10 (Axtamanen terers)
()]
= |cTas Cust Rel. 1O — - 26,914 $25.842 | I Ma20 tautomation faey)
Nams and Addreas of Individual or Organizaton for which [ Name and Address of Mailing Agent
Maifiag Is Prapared (if othar than penrsl holder) (H other than pennd
Unlted Water Florida Inc. ‘ Alexander's Direct Mal! Services, Inc.
1400 Milleoe Rd ’
Jacksonville FL 32225- Jacksonville FL 32207.
Oun 8§ Bradstreet No. —_— Oua & Bridsreat Na. —
2] ® Far automailen rate letter=eize piaces othat than cards at card rawds (OMM CB10), go to Part A on the
o reverse of this form. Part A S 6,429.225
B For automation rate flate (DMM C820), 90 to Part B on the reverse of this form. Peslage
g ’ (From Part B 3 0.004
B For nonautomation rate prcses othar than cards at card rams (DMM CO50),go to Part € on the reverse
§ raverse of this form. side) Part C $ 0.000
.9‘ N For postal cards and peateards at card rales (OMA £700), 9o 1o Part D on the reverse of this form. Part D S 0.0600
% DAddiﬁonal Postage Paymant (State reasons) [:] Special Sanice (Spea'}y) No. Pleces xﬁéﬁe‘Fee Per Pe. s 0.000
& Total Pastage P! s 6,429.225

The signaturs of a mailar certifies that it wilf be liable for and agress to pay, subject lo appeals prescribed by postal laws and reguletions, any
revenus deliciencies assessad on this mailing. (If this form Is signed by an agenl, thae agent certifies that i [s authorized to sign this statement, that
the certificalion binds the agent and the mailer, and that both the maller and the agent will be liable for 2nd agree to pay any deficiencles.)

The sudmission of 1 {alse, NeUdous, or fraudulant Statement may result in Mmonsenment of up to S yasrs aad a fine of up to §10,000 (13 USC 1201). In addimon, a el
senatty af up to $5,000 #nd an additional assassmant of twice the amount faisely chimed may bs imposed (31 USC 3802).

Centlification

D For Enclosed Reply Pieces (Automation rate only) (Effective January 1, 1897): 1certily that any busmas reply, countasy reply, or melered reply leder-
size eards or envalopes, enclosed in the pieces described abeve, bear the carrect facing identification mark (FIM) and barcode.

] For Updatad Addresses (Presorred ard automalion rates only) (Effective January 1, 1997); | certify that the addresses appearing on the pleces
described above have been updaled within 6 months of the date of this mafling using a USPS-approved acdress update teol,

{0 For 2@ Codes (Presorted rate anly) (Elfective October 1, 1995): lcerdly that the 1P Codesappeanngon the pleces described atave have been
verified and corrected where necessary within 12 months of the dase of this mailing using a USPS-approved melhod,

1 heraby cartify that all Information tuenished on this form Is zccurate and trutatul, that this mailing meets altapplicable CASS/MASS
standards tor sddress and barcoda accuracy, end that the material presented qualifies tor the ratas of postags claimed.

Signature of Pormi Holder or Agent (Bath principal and agent are Iable Wﬂq ineurred.) Telphone
——-—-"—‘—"_‘-‘

(504)-443-7354
ffﬁ

° conr %u%

e

.AZ' Sy aHeY Y
o ¥ i Q@'?’-*--: 5—’-9-—.
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. Form 3600-R — First-Class Mail — Permit Imprint

‘ Postage Computation
Presant/ Prasort/
Automation - Net Caut Automation Net Count
Discounts Rate (Pecs.) Charge Discounts Rate (Pes.) Charge
!:l Automation Rates — Letters (DMM C810) Other Than Cards at B Automation Rates — Fizts (DMM C820)
Card Rates
Carrigr Route x pes.= $ &5 x pes. = 8,
5-Digh 0.238 x 25648 pes. w §__85.104.224 | Basic X PCS. =
3-Digit 0.25% x T75pcs. = S____156.850 | Nonstandard Surcharge
(it sppikcatis) 08x_______ pcs.=$
Basic 0.261 x 481 pos. = $___128.151
Total — Part A (Carry to front of farm) $_6429225 | Total— Part B (Carry ta frontof form) $____0.000
EfNonautmﬁon Rales — Other Than Cardsg a8t Card Rates » Postal Cands and Posteards st Card Rates
Automation®
Presarted x pes.=$ Carrier Route J40 x pcs.=$
Single-Piece x pes.=$ 5-Digit 143 x pes.=$§
Nonstandard Surcharge 3-Cigh 159 x pes. = §
(If applicable)
Prasorted O5x pcs. =S, Basic ,168 x pes.=$
Single-Plece A1x pcs. = $ Nonautomatlan
Prescrtad .180 x pes. =S
Single-Fiece 200 2 pcs. =35
v * Avajlable enly fer avicmatlon-compatible cards (ODMM C810) '
Total — Part C (Carry to frant of form) $____0.000 | Totsl — Pmt D (Carry to front of form) s____0.800

PS Form 3600-R, July 1996 (Reverse)

Facsimile printed by Mall Manager 2010 01.21
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UNITED WATER FLORIDA’ SUNTAUST BANK, °
waacEnsEND . Sl SRR By 1889, .
P.O. BOX 8004 Vot :
JACKSONVILLE, FL 22239 ST £23-234530

o T Br25ne98

PAYTOTHE  ALEXANDERS DIRECT MAIL'SERVICE INC - 1% w3ga042
Three Thousand Eight Hundred Eighty and 42/100™** > - B aataras s P B revecer DOLLARS
mban
ALEXANDER'S DIRECT MAIL o

* SERVICE INC. 2 SIGNATURES REQUIRED
8956 PHILLIPS PARKWAY DR N . FOR AMOUNTS OVER $2000.90

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32258

MeMo___Custamer Nolice Mallouts-Hearing-Rate Case

000136
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ted States Postal Service :

stage Statement — Standard Mail (A) )
(Other Than Nonprofit) — Permit Imprint $Sol¥

MAILER: Canplete all itmras by lypewriter, pan, orindellbia pancil. {t you naed 8 recoipe, prepare (n dupilcats.

.

Post Olllce of Mailing M3ilag Oare Eeuuhg Catezary VSRS Aviherized Meiling i0 Cade(s)
Jacksonvilie, Fl. L] Leltars (DM €O50)
- ™ - & Do oum cosey
Parmit Ne. Fedari Asancy Cast Sode Satsment Sequeacs No. T Auvamatoa Fuats
842 4273 WAT38028.39 (BN C820)
:::.u:::a:::’“’ Talephcas Roceigt Na. G:g’::““é:':o)“m’n Proptrod Under DMM TRk 2 ot apply)
(ehdo 21P Codo) (904)-448-7384 Dlireguias Porests @M casay] L] #8610 (Lausrs, fess, parcels)
g Alazanders Qirect Mai) Services, Inc. Number ofc‘o‘nmners £ b &t Dt apply) g M&10 (Upgridenie leuats)
= {4870 VICTOR ST ' ::Fnl'r T‘r zﬁ'ﬁn'n ;-w W 9g M620 (Tnhanzed Carrfer Rouls)
g st " Wi = R ‘ @MHO (Automgtion lotises)
S | Jacksenville FL 32207, 1 NA s Pairx Yo Omsz0 (aurmerion ram)
E wegnatol 3 i Sacking, Based On
E Single Puce . 0.0250 YTV D 125 pisces D 1§ povnds Dagm
S g::rg:::smm Toul Piccos Tolat Waeight
S {cTAS Cuse Rel. 1D 26,314 . §72.850
Nams and Addross of !ng:i(d;‘:luu cpgaaaauc:n 197 Whicn ma and Addrves ol Maiing ageat (¥ olher than pertnll
R Msiing is P rad (Mo 1€:7} far) ,
A S Fidnaa The. P = Alsxanders Dirsct Mall Sanicss, Inc.
1400 Miflcoe R4 43TQ VICTOR ST :
Jacksonville FL 32226 Jacksenville FL 32207 o
CuaremMar NO | o v o e e CusiomerNo. e
{Dun & Cradsraan (Gun & Ma_gg.nsq -
¥ For Reqular aulgmalion rale leller-size (OMM C010) ot {tal-alze piecss (2ee DMM Ca20;
waighing 2068 \b. (13087 az) er |£ss, g8 1o Part A on roverse of this form, 3 PatA | $ 3,725.304
s For Regular nanaulomation rste places (OAM C450) woighing 2068 fb. (3.3087 ot.) or les3, g
lo Part B on fovorge of this ferm. - Po;lcao PartB 3 0.000
R For Enhanced Gorrier Reuts rale picaz (DMM C050) weighing 2085 Ta. (18662 02) sc less, o | (o,
to Parl € on revarse af this form, : g sice) Parl C $ 0.609
E % For Enhancad Carrier Routa rals piccos weighing more than 2088 Ib. (13062 az), or Regular
O] s pieces weighing more Lhan 2068 b, (31.3087 o=} bul ol lsas than 1.0 Ib. (180 c2), gots
g| PardDonreveisoof INs torm. PartD $ 0.000
g [JAedmianat Bosssse Payment (SIAl3 radsony No. Places RueFon Per Pc.. $ 0.000
E [ singie-Pioce Ratn g Neacmadars Surshargs [ 8secint Saevics {Spacity) : x$. .1 i
1§ sppllcania bulk per pieco rate alwed W odch plece? (o 3602- PRl required) :
Oves Oxe :Total Postage —— % S 3725364

lon

Ce i

[ For Enclosed Reply Places (Automation rates anly; (Ellective 1/187): ] corlly hat ajl business reply, couresy reply, o¢ metered reply Isliss-sizo evds of
envelepes, encicsed In e plecas doseribod above, boar ths earreet facing Kentlfication mark (FIM) ard barcede under DMM C810.

] For 2iP Cadas (Nenavlomnallon rates only); | certily that Die ZIF Codes appearing en Me pisces descrided above have been verfled and corroctad
whiero necessary within 12 menths of the dala of s mafling using 8 USPS-appmved method.

The signatura of a majlor corifles that it wili ba llabla ter and agroes 10 93y, subject 1o appeals preseribed by postal laws and raguiglions, oy reverne
deficiancies assecsed on (s maling. (I s lorm is slged by an sgent, the agent cartfles that It k2

binds tha agent and the mailer, &nd that boih the maller and the ageal will be liatle for ardd agree (o gay any doliclorcios)

The submissicn of 3 False, fictilidus, of fraudulent siatemant ray result in tmpAsanment of up to § ysars and a fine ot u
addilon, a chvil penally of up to $5,000 and an addifonal Raseszment of twies the amounl falsely clalmad may ba lmpe:ef (

Ihefeby eartity the! 3l Information hurnlzhed on this farm (s aceurate 3ad trethiful, INaTtnls malilng mawts »li 3pplicabla CASSMABS
standgrds fer oddress and barcode 9ccurdey, and that the material Pt*cﬂa’d gqualifles lortha ratas of pastags cislmed,

autharized to sign this slatement, nat the certificalien

1o $10,6000 (18 USC 1001). Ir
31 USC 3302).

Signatere of Pormg Hokior a1 Agant [BOIh principal and sganl arv Eatlo tor an daficlancy i f] Tolophefs ~
: : (804)443.7384

. sy hr t g oo, . ; 3, RSANRD ot ® 5 PoA i B . .
'y ‘_‘Slsilo-ﬂlcz'l:{?\bhlz o R . ‘.,?‘,',u‘{,"‘“.‘,“qg,ud nhm‘-nlﬂn)‘v‘rnﬂgti JA: .g: Yes cORe L r et
4 L0 D P LT LE LI pros ox s urea o i R : e
e TiplPlecad ! Ttalwelght ~"_""--_" T"_‘.-z.’“‘“’ TR T o ¢on T i
o> . 3 . ' ' ¢ \
> 2 . ..
C=> Teldl Postdg. = 3 R r~
4 [ osldgs g . : N .
g 37FS 30 L - - .

check O Sate Meller Nojlried e : 2 S 13’ uiragld
[7] D P[ﬂrzl Vpitlication DA&H varteaton e ;. s Nl ".‘ e‘m““f Y ({aﬂldlg z?”"‘.Ln;:’ (R
B1% Nef$cheauled parlofmacms Schiduied 5 . s *t L‘,’g . o
g IEERTIFY Inaf \hix m hes beon fhipestsd concarniag; m_c'l'l.gl;]!uy Jo'r ;Alﬁégxnn claimad; (2) preper prapargilan (Jn'ff, y —

« pmsnrt wher caqGlnglB: Qe ropsr.ghmelsilen of paatfai ; ment.of 1qqulres 3anw fog. A o

Stgndivre of Welghdr N Yine Y :

. . * o N P




."orin"seoz-a

— Standard Mall (A) (Other Than Nonprofit) — Permit Imprint

Postage Computation
Eplry Presen/ v Enlry - Preson !
Olgraunl Auvtemsiioa Nel Count Discounl | Automation Net Caunt
(i any) Diccouanis Rale (Pes./ibs,} Charga (¥army] ~. Discauals Rate (Pcs,/Lbks.) Chame
Regulat Autsination Rates = Lefters (DM C818) und Flats 3] Ragulsr Honaytomation Rates — Places W \
(DMN €020) Wolghing .2082 Lb, (33007 Oz)er Lass Q—?),, Less °n e € Waighing 2088 Lb. (3.3087
_ None JiStLelter 209z —— P8, =§
Neas 5-Dipit ll:cucr 132 S T L S s za:mm 228 " "Tpea.=
3-Diglt Lelter ATS5x _ e PO 2 S _ Basic Lstier 286 x en.=§
B%r,l; Letter A03x T 4  pes.e§__ BRE5T Sasic Noalotter 306% oo ;::. 33
3/5 Flat .88 x pcs. 2 g DRMC 3/5 Leltar 196 « s s
f - ———— . — 5. =
Basie Flu 2172 pes. ™S e 85 Nan/etrer 212 x :ea. = :
Basic Letter 243 % __ pee.m§___
83sic Nonlauer 293 x pes.= $
IS Ley .
psMe S-Digit Loller Seax___ pes.=3__ L oser glg »':Z.’.?lu., .;:; : —- :::' - :"""—“‘
g-o'n_oilLLflﬂnc S L Pt 23— Basic Lolter 238x _  pes.e§
3si¢ Loller . S -1 M { s ——
i Rt St Y OY I ?B_asb Nonlitar 288 x — _Dcs.®§
8asic Flal 284z pes. s -
Tolal=—"Part B (Carry i front of torm) $___ D000
G8sF S-Diyil Letlor L1373 __ 25848 pes. 5 5 _3.613.776 check [J Regalar Rate Ploces Woighing Mero Than 2068 Lb,
;-oﬁu LoWer aAs7x ____ 778 ge.,_ =s__ 323878 oo {33087 Qz.)put Less Than 1.0 Lb. {160 02
Basio Lonor RYTY Dt pes. = § -- [J Enhancad Carrier Routs Rats Plecos Welghing More
A AT S asany g:)n 2086 LD, (33062 Oz)buttess Than 1,010, (V&2
Bazie Flat 259¢c__ _ ____pes.28______ __
None ;Siruralien ECR C00x __ pes. ™S
-1 €83 x Ibs. = $ _
High Donsity ECR 610 x T pene§__
plus 863 x o lbg. = §
. 80sk ECR Q18 x 0¢8. 5§
.. plus 683 x __ g =%
:3/$ Avlomatien® L49x pos. = §
© plu=m 677 % Llhs. =3
7315 Nenautemallon 085Sz pee. =S ___ ..
S plug 677 x _lns, w8 ____ .
Tatal — Parz A (Carry fo front of farm) $.3,725304 EBa:;ic Automanen® 1372 pes. =§__
n B $17x Idg, = §
Enhanced Carrlar Route Rates = Piecas Walghing A S — - O
2088 Lb. (3.30820z) or Loss ;-B:IXLGSNcnaummsﬂon ;;g : ——————— f::' = :
Nene S3zluration Leuer 4333 ___ pes. e o ; "
Saturation Nealslter A3Tx . _pes.ss_._____ | PBkc -l,s":[‘:,':'“’" Ecr el A §mem—
High Bansity Lollar Ae2x T pes e - . S i
Batic Avlemation Latler 4@ _______ _pes.w S o J'”‘BF Densly ECR R1ox__ pes. ‘: D
Migh Donsity Nenlkelle’ REYE DN U J, = » E"EC Seox s =S
Basic Loftor ASC X e P T S e - ?,f, R -2;5 : —_ - ff." ; i—"——-‘
Daclc Nenletter _ ASSY ___ _  pee S __ 25 Aulemallon’ h4ax T T pet.s s
. . plue 513 x T A
DEMC Sslurslion Loiter 208 P65 S S 35 Nohsulamatian 085 x T pes.m§.
Ssluration Noalutler RIS SN TN L JE T plus 413 x " " ibs. = §_
High Dunsily Lelor A29x . Pes.®S_ Bazle Automalian® 437x “pes.=S$____
Batic Aulsmston Lottar 133 __ __ _ __ pes.=S___ plue 613x “Ibe. =38
Hla_! Deosily Nonlatler 34 pes. xS L 3sie Hensutamation as8x . pes.=S__
Bouie Leller AT _pes.™S___ plus S13x T k., =%
Basic Nuplottar - a2 _______ _pes.SS____ o ' N
pScr :Saturatlen ECR 000 x ____ pes. s S
pseF  Safuralien Loller M5 o pes.sS___ oo pls SYex_________ivs. S
Saturptian Nenleltor MeY L petES_ < High Densily ECR 010x __ __ P35S e —
Righ Densty Latiar a2y " pex.sS___ iy plus SI8x s ¥ e
Bosle Astemation Legar 1283 __ _ _pes.® S5 __ - Basic ECR 018 x SRS 2 ik N
Migh Donsity Nonlellar 129 _____ ___pee.® §_ Loopue . s78x_____bs. 98
Bosic Laltar KEL P Rttt YT S 3/5 Autornaltion D49x __ PSS TS
Batle Noniatter A x o __pes.=S§__ ygh:‘s naul . :gg e B8 = :,_.
: . onaulomation K ¥ pes. 38
. lue 592x bs. =3 :
[-3-1V) EwturalionLollar J10x ——o Pt = ‘P B — =
Saturalion Noaloltur At x ___ _peE.ES _-— : ’B",'ZA“wma”e" 137 x - pes. - :""‘w-
MHigh Density Lottor 1193 ——pou.=S_____ e ’,? N I §92 x 1o =< N
8asie Aufomatian Laitar 123 x pes.» $ — -+ B3¢ic Nonautamailen d88x_ pes. =S . O
High Doaslly NARIOUSr 124 X oo oo pee B S pius £92x s e
Bssic Lellor $27x ____ . pes.s§ ——— i . o
Basia Nanletler 132 x —— P S . oou Sa(:!:dglxon ECR ggg : mm—————— lpbc‘s : i___e___
High Bensity ECR B18x_____ _pe=S__
plue Ss2x____— ___ibs. %S
8azlo ECR 018 x pee. B3 —
plus S52 x SIS Tl
*Avalabia only for aulomalion-compatibla flits (DMM C320)
Total = Part & (CBrry to tront of form) $____9.000 | voeal ==Part® (Carry lo front of farm) § 0888
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* . -
- 2 Requisition
APPROVED
Business Unit: 305 onited wacer mes
ip To: 200 Old Hook Rd Req D Dotz origin -
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799 0000007449 09/22/98 BLK 1
USA Requestor
Q’ Connor,Michael
Requestor Signature
i ine-Schd Item. Description Mfg ID Quantity UOM Price Extended Amt Due Date ]
1-1 invoice 243255-D 052 1.00 EA 5,600.00 5.600.00 03/21/93
Buyer ID:
Vendor: 0000000155 Aon Consulting Ine Vendor Item:
\)U)' FLOﬂ.lDQ Item Total: inveice 243255-D 0S2 S,600.00 /
2-1 invoice 243255-D 027 1.00 EA $,200.00 $,200.00 03/21/98
Buyer ID:
Vendor: 0000000136 Acn Consulting Inc VYendor Item:
Item Total: invoice 243255-D 027 5,200.00
3-1 INVOICE 243255-D 046 1.00 EA 13,45%0.00 13,490.00 03/21/33
Buyer ID:
. Vendor: 0000000196 Acn Consulting Inc Vendor Item:
Item Total: INVOICE 243255-D 046 13.4%0.00
4-1 INVOICE 243255-D 053 1.00 EA 710.00 710.00 03/21/33
Buyer ID:
Vendor: 0000000196 Aon Consulting Inc Vendor Item

AON CONSULTING
INVOICE 243255-D

Item

Total Reguisition Amount:

PUBLIC SERVICE CCMMISSION FILINGS/VALUATIONS?TESTIMONY

$25,000

Tocal:

INVOICE 243255-D 053

.90

25,000,

90

ACIVARIRL STUDY (FolnetLt Areyammed ALD &gxﬁwaz)é?@ww Bty mue3>

r7Approval Signature

D

Approval Signature

Approval Signature

000140




Aoy
10 14

Aon Consulting

\ YoV

SN

June 25, 1998

United Water Resources
200 Old Hook Road

Harrington Park, New Jersey 07640

L Eo 30§
t Number: A10235
Account Nu r 2 Q,ZQ 7“{"1‘01
Involce Number: 243255-D
Invoice Date: March 21, 1998

Professional services rendered for the pericd ending March 21, 1998

Public Service Cémmission Filings and Support

Bl -305 Total: 52500000
}on -7447 ﬂ#é/&? O F O\

Please make sure account numberls wntten on check and make check
payable to:

Aon Consulting'&. Inc.
FCNPC.
Aon Consulting 13442 -
300 Harmon Meadow Blvd., 3" Floor <=CEWNVED
Secaucus, NJ .07094 cco 9 4 1998

macREMENT DEPT.
+ Please include a copy of this invoice with your remittanciRQCUREMEN

000141



United Water.
UNITED WATER FLORIDA

-~ Old Hook Road
. agton Park, New Jersey 07840-1738

PAY Nine thousand and 00/100 Dollars

FLCRIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
2540 Shumard Qak Bivd
To the Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0870

order of

MELLON BANK NA, PHILACELPHIA 22-4314
Meilon Bank (DE) NA. -
Wilmingten, DE
Check Number Check Date
00076968 0s/11/98

$9,000.00***

*****Fl LE COPY*****

CHECK DATE CHECK NUMBER
UNITED WATER FLORIDA 05/11/98 000763966
INVOICE - VOUCHER NUMBER |  GROSS AMOUNT DISCOUNT NET AMOUNT
NUMBER DATE
98 RATE FILING 05/08/98 00010896 9,000.00 0.60 $,000.00
DOCK #980214WS
pur~gd
\° 'd \d&\
4y &
N
3
® A
-
-
VENDOR NAME VENDOR TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL DISCOUNTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT
Florida Public Service Commission 0000002249 $9,000.00 $0.00 $9,000.00




" FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

2540 Shumard Oak Bivd. ¢ Tailahassee, Florida 32399-0850 az‘( 5
10/07/1998 '
- 4 L ]
:k Schreyer —| DatzPaid BPENDING This pumber mrust appest on
0 01d Hook Road paid all checks of comespondence
Harrington Park, NJ 07640 Amoaat reganding this invoice.
Check #
O chex O Cash
_I PSC Signature
Dlease make 2 nayable to ORIDA PUB 3 O O
UANTITY DESCRIPTION ’ PRICE AMOUNT
Audit related travel expenses for
Christine M. Vendetti from 08/30-09/04/1998 $975.98
PER DIEM 22 0o® $__so.e0 -
MEALS 222 90 75
LOOGING %2 O :j%%g—
MILEAGE 2829505 s E E
AIRFARE 22 O0e s337 co
RENT-A-CAR 8__ o7 s
MISCELLANEGUS 230 09 s_J/o0od
TOTAL $2725.98
o5 06 V0¥ C. Venclet?s
RAR-S Rev. 1154 ) ; TOTAL $975.98

#4275 1759
#4277 /33392
# 427§ '/0{5’,05 o

Tome . 332795

000143



"FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

2540 Shumard Oak Bivd. Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850

10[07[1998 . QZTT
: L ] 4
'k Schreyer —‘ DatePaid PEMDING —— This sxnber must sppesr on
01d Hook Road Paid ‘ all checks or correspondence
Harrington Park, NJ 07640 Amount regarding this invoice.
Check #
O Cheex [0 Cash
] PSC Signature

Please make checks payable to: FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE
JANTITY ' DESCRIPTION

COMMISSION

Audit related travel expenses for
Christopher L. Holman from 08/30-09/04/1998 ‘

$1333.92
PER OIEM 282 O s S5o.00
MEALS PR 3 70% .20
LODGING 239 o4 s 727,905
MILEAGE B3 qos s -
ARFARE 230 08 s
MISCELLANEOUS 2238 o S 7ol %5
TOTAL $/333.92
05 0f <0 C. 4b/mcn

ARSRev. 1154

TOTAL [51333.92

000144



FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

2540 Shumard Oak Bivd. & Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850

«_10/07/1998 | 4218
—i + »
Tack Schreyer Date Paid PENDING This number must sppear on
30 01d Hook Road . \ ¢ Pi all checks or commespondence
rrington Park, NJ 07640 Paid regarding this invoice.
Check #
O Cheekx [ Cash
| PSC Signature
Please make s payable to ORIDA PUB 2 O ®
QUANTITY | DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT

Audit related expenses for Robert T. Moore
from 08/30/1998 to 09/04/1998.

$1018.05
PER DIEM s % -3 s /o;{_o.co )
EALS %39 3 2.0
\oooma magw ILne
MILEAGE 8 _ 0 s
AIRFARE %33 o8 s 32 7.0
RENT-A-CAR % 07 s
MISCELLANEOUS 8200 s 39.35 .
TOTAL s/el8.05
o5 &4 00 A. r7care

IC/RAR-E Rev. 1154

TOTAL $1018.05

000145



Jnited Water.

 MELLON BANK NA, PHILADELPHIA

_02-4\(:11
Meilon Bank (DE) NA.
~ - Wimington, DE
UNITED WATER FLORIDA : o
200 Otd Hook Road 728 Check Number Check Date
i New Jersey 07840-1
Hamington Park, New Jersey 00092820 09/01/58
PAY One thousand sixty four and 55/100 Dollars
FUTCH PRINTING & MAILING INC
228 E Forsyth St $1,064.55***
To the Jacksomnna,. FL 32202
order of
*****F“_E COPY*****
’ CHECK DATE CHECK NUMBER
. UNITED WATER FLORIDA 05/01/98 00092820
INVOICE VOUCHER NUMBER |  GROSS AMOUNT DISCOUNT NET AMOUNT
NUMBER DATE
27463 08/04/98 00012917 1,064.55 0.00 1,064.55
VENDOR NAME VENDOR TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL DISCOUNTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT
Futch Printing & Mailing Inc 0000002353 $1,064.55 $0.00 $1.004.58




(VAVRVIV/VAZ

INVOICE | X915

FUTCH PRINTING & MAILING, INC. ' .
DATE INVOICE NO.

228 E. Forsyth St.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32202

‘04) 355-3606

BILL TO:
UNITED WATER FLORIDA

- 1400 MILLCOE RD
‘JQCKSONUILLE FL32225

' 8/4/1998 37463

PROJECT

ANTITY DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT
SC,lZHZHZJ OFFSET 1 COLOR REGULAR # 1@ ENYELIRES 523,358 S92.387
BLACK INK ;
. Flaorida Sales Tax &. SAU 684,57
VA
4y’
)
P/
) t g ‘
;;bnc'_l RECEIVED
Acct 186400 AUG 1 2 1998
QL% o To 5292) PROCUREMENT DEPT
T D
i;2£[?.~42>¢£>
I/ ] >

g I L s $1,064.55

000147



'MELLON BANK NA, PHILADELPHIA

» ) g 0224311
nite aterl. ¥ Mellan Bank (D€) NA
N
''NTED WATER FLORIDA . gion, D

Ofd Haok Road . z Check Number [ Check Cate

' ington Park, New Jersey 07840-1738 ) PRy
" PAY One hundred nineteen and 28/100 Dollars
. FUTCH PRINTING & MAILING INC - -
228 E Forsyth St . ik

e Jacksonville, FL 32202 $119.28

o the -
ordac of

iit**F"_E copYi*t**
| CHECK DATE CHECK NUMBER
INVOICE R
YOUCHER NUMBER ou DISCOUNT
UMBER SATE: GROSS AMOUNT NET AMOUNT
7479 08/11/98 00013007 119.23 0.00 115.28
00148
VENDOR NAME . VENDOR TOTAL AMQUNT TOTAL DISCOUNTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT
Citan Bindnn L Lielina In~ OANNNIAEA R11Q 28 0 0o €119 94




Ny OVUMr 12U )

Futch Printing & Mailing, Inc. / The Létter $hop Invoice
Futch Printing and Mailing, Inc. ___
. 228 East Forsyth Street DATE INVOICE #
Jacksonwville, FL 32202 8/11/1998 37479
BILL TO
UNITED WATER FLORIDA
1400 MILLCOE RD
JACKSONVILLE FL32225
ey = Yl
P.O. NO. TERMS PROJECT
36157 Net 30 36157
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT
2,000 OFFSET 1 COLOR REGULAR# 10 ENYELOPE BLACK INK 112.00 112.00T
Florida Sales Tax ' 6.50% 7.28

4

4 )
M -,(—l-— l%/(o LFOD REGENFD

RECEIVED

nuG 1 4 1% aus 117 1992

( : vaccum'ﬂ“ e UNITED WATER FLORIDA )

c YA i |
g%’

—
Reg. 2ok 757 i 4:)7/%
Total B $119.23
000149



United Water. -

UNITED WATER FLORIDA
Old Haok Road ,
.ngxpn Park, Now Jersey 07640-1738

PAY One thousand nine hundred seventy eight and 08/100 Dollars

FUTCH PRINTING & MAILING INC
228 E Forsyth St

To the Jacksonvile, FL 32202

ordsr of

MELLON BANK NA, PHILADELPHIA 821
Melon Bank (DE) N.A.
Wimingten, DE
e ey
: Check Number Check Data
;00083851 09/08/98

4

$1,978.08%%*

E 2 i**F' LE copY**tii

: CHECK DATE CHECK NUMBER
UNITED WATER FLORIDA . 09/08/98 000383651
INVOICE '
__ VOUCHER NUMBER | GROSS AMOUNT DISCOUNT

NUMBER DATE ou NET AMOUNT
374834 08/14/98 00013107 1,031.28 0.00 1,031.28
37488 08[}4/98 0013108 945,79 0.60 948,79

VENOOR NAME VENDOR TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL DISCOURTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT

Fiteh Pdnting & Mailina Ine 0000002353 $1.974.08 $0.00 $1,978.08




L I |

Futch Printing & Mailing, Inc. / The Letter Shop

Invoice
' Futch Printing and Mailing, Inc.
@ 228 East Forsyth Street DATE T NVOICE#
Jacksonville, FL 32202 &/14/1998 37484
BILLTO =
UNITED WATER FLORIDA -
1400 MILLCOE RD
JACKSONVILLE FL32225
N P.O. NO. TERMS PROJECT
36160 Net 30 36160
QUANTITY : DESCRIPTION RATE AMOUNT
31,000 OFFSET REGULAR # 10 ENVELOPES | COLOR BLACK INK PERMIT # 968.35 963357
842 , .
Florida Sales Tax 6.50% 62.94
I
4 _ : / Rzox,,.)
RECP L . L TYERER
=T | imng ]
' - ‘_.‘l ‘
c-"T' TS ey l
Ve, et
el T
AR 7S
RECEIVED 23
AUG 17 1993 3
UNITED WATER FLORIDA - . —z
. . i ¢ ~
SZe N
000151 Al D
Total $1,031.29




United Water.

UNITED WATER FLORIDA
200 Old Hook Road

Harmington Park, New Jersey 07640-1738

{ [

PAY Two thousand three hundred eighty five and 60/100 Dollars
IKON OFFICE SOLUTIONS

MELLON BANK NA, PHILADELPHIA 824311
Mellon Bank (DE) N.A. ’
Wilmington, DE
Check Number Check Date
00093855 09/08/9a

$2,385.60***

Document Services
To the PO Box 281236
order of Atlanta, GA 30384-1236
*****FILE COPY*****
CHECK DATE CHECK NUMBER
© UNITED WATER FLORIDA 09/08/98 00093655
INVOICE _ VOUCHER NUMBER |  GROSS AMOUNT DISCOUNT NET AMOUNT
NUMBER DATE
L19023057 08/20/98 00013422 2,385.60 0.co 2,385.60
|
L
VENDOR NAME VENDOR TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL DISCOUNTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT
0000002950 $2,385.60 $0.00 $2,385.60

Ikon Cffice Sclutions




V¥ Ov MO~

Recelved and approved by:

lKON L. INVOICE Page 4
Office Solutions~ P—— NPT
4 . : Involce Date 08/20/1398
[ sument Services Due Dats 081301398
Customer # '
Phone: (304) 356-4380 Ordor 2 L19-MARA
Fax:  (304) 3555161 TERMS: Net 10 Days l 98080241
SOLD TO: SHIP TO: REMIT TO:
MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICK MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICK KON Office Solutions
3000 Independent Drive 3000 Independent Drive Document Servicas
Jacksonville,FL 32202-0000 Jacksonville,FL 32202-0000 P.0. Box 281236
Atlanta,GA 30384-1236
Order Date Ordered By Referonce / Case # Account Manager
08/19/1998 SCOTT SCHILDBERG UNITED WATER CUSTOMER NOTICE | Andrew C. Dedrick
Description Quantity Unit Price Extension
565 AUTOFEED 56000 0.040 T 2240.00
Po
—-\ Sz? -3 1998
_ m
SROCUREMENT DEPT. 2
' o
o
o
Thank You For Using IKON
Taxablﬁe. Sales: © 2240.00
PLEASE PAY FROM THIS INVOICE salesiia ~| o o 145.60
YOUR SIGNATURE BELOW IS AN AGREEMENT THAT THE ABOVE DESCRIBED WORK HAS BEEN Non-Taxablez: \. Z / i Y 0.00
AUTHORIZED AND RECEIVED. THE PARTY ABOVE ASSURES PAYMENT OF THIS INVOICE WITHIN Postage: - - |/ [ ) 0.00
30 DAYS. ALL INVOICES ARE DUE UPON RECEIPT, INTEREST AT THE RATE OF THE LESSER 15% Delivery: 0.00
f PER MONTH OR THE MAXIMUM LEGAL RATE WILL BE CHARGED ON INVOICES NOT PAID IN 30 DAYS. : -
' CUSTOMER AGREES TO PAY LEGAL FEES INCURRED IN THE COLLECTION OF PAST DUE ACCOUNTS. | PAYY THIS 2385.60
~ - | AMOUNT:
Data:

(Please pay from this copy. The party named on this billis held responsible for payment )




lnvolee# DS e

f i ~-ﬁ.,-

3| lnvolea Date

‘ﬁ&, ms

Fax: (90;0 3556" i.5’1 : K

SOLDTO: - -5%. - »
MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICK 5 IKON Office Soluﬁons E_@‘ o
R R Lo S
3000 lndapendent Drive _ Dpcut_nent sgmm""fggg
Jacksonvﬂle,FL 32202-0000 v ‘-‘ s s 3 < 5F
L T Aﬂanﬁ,GIA 30384-1236‘
OrderDate | . OrderedBy = . . . | Reference/Case# -~~~
08/07/1998 AT ROCEMN | UNITED WATER RATE - R | . . g :
. Descﬂpﬂon R : "URIt PHES | SalfEdtanslon
565 T AUTOFEED - — T = 0.040] R 23720.0
000154
Thank You For Using IKON -
Taxable Sales: 3720.0
PLEASE PAY FROM THIS INVOICE Sales Tax: 241.3
YOUR SIGNATURE BELOW IS AN AGREEMENT THAT THE ABOVE DESCRIBED WORK HAS BEEN Non-Taxable: 0.c
AUTHORIZED AND RECEIVED. THE PARTY ABOVE ASSURES PAYMENT OF THIS INVOICE WITHIN Postage: 0.C
30 DAYS. ALL INVOICES ARE DUE UPON RECEIPT. INTEREST AT THE RATE OF THE LESSER 1.5% Delivery: 0.c
PER MONTH OR THE MAXIMUM LEGAL RATE WILL BE CHARGED ON INVOICES NOT PAID IN 30 DAYS.
CUSTOMER AGREES TO PAY LEGAL FEES INCURRED IN THE COLLECTION OF PAST DUE ACCOUNTS. | PAY THIS 3961.8
' AMOUNT:
Recelved and approved by: -  Date: :

G’leasa pay from this copy. The party named on this biil Is held responslble for payment ) I -""*'.i__




‘vv- —— e 3.

1 e . . - ILADELP HIA
United Water MELLON Banc ki, P
: ﬁ UNITED WATER FLORIDA .3 Wimington, DE .
200 Cid Moak Road

Hamington Pusk, New Jarsoy 07640-1733 001

o285
PAY Three thousand nine hundred sivey one qng 80/100 Dollars

S e saumens 9,981 00

PO Box 281236

AR, GA 30384-1238

00 00Ss584 12034 000 212

295 ) LEGw ]
ECRBA CHECK NUMBER
UNTTED WATER FLORIDA 10/28/%8 00166558
INVOICE o 8 DISCOUNT NT
NUNAER BATE— VOUCHER NUMBER GROSS AMCUNT NET ANOU.
L1902238 cas10/58 001410 3,961.8Q 0.00 3,96%.80
YENDOR NAME VENDOR TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL DISCOUNTS TOTAL PAID AMOUNT
Ikon Qffice Sontions 0000002950 £3.961.28 e An aa mes -




United Water. .

UMITED WATER FLORIDA
200 Oid Hook Road

Harrington Park, New Jersey 07840-1738

.Y Three thousand one hundred ninety four and 99/100 Dollars
KINKO'S

PO Box 105522

Aflanta, GA 30348-5522

v

‘.

MELLON BANK NA, PHILADELPHIA 82-4/311
Mellon Bank (DE) N.A.
Wilmington, DE
Check Number Check Date
000733818 06/22/98

$3,194,99%*+

To the
order of
**t**FlLE COPY*****
CHECK DATE CHECK NUMBER
UNITED WATER FLORIDA 05/22/98 00078818
__INVOICE _ VOUCHER NUMBER | GROSS AMOUNT DISCOUNT NET AMOUNT
NUMBER DATE
238400280196 05/17/98 00011121 3,194.99 0.00 3,194.99
VENDOR NAME VENDOR TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL DISCOUNTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT
Kinko's 0000003400 $3,194.99 $0.00 $3,194.99
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P P S
The new way to offices:
-z =2 G =
2z wE

For the appfqbn’hte

PaymentProcesst‘ng Center, - T e
g ecezr.d.'
\_wsta&rj. :

pbase refer to map o reverse, -

x'ons?}’lease call:

800-488—3705

'g...".:

.’
|
!

b
sﬁa
k,

9,
3

NS TS

= , s A ~ Plew l'-.._'_| Prme @am
Delivery Address I A A
GivTiAs PN YNV asb8 Y
. BISD LELQ CLR4R STAHTARD -
‘ f W ’-—6} : @I B - 9k

Co-worker's Initials

Signarure :

) A} }:jnc une
pn%anifo J g Mmﬁf

. LA
(¥6Ydo s WOV

PR
;052,%) ?\Oé\\?\ax\e

RTOTAL £994.%%

, -

Visit the Kinko's Web Site at
hetp//www.kinkos.com - .
BRANCH COPY - WHITE

AR COPY - YELLOW

CUSTOMER COPY - PINK

000157



: MELLON BANK NA, PHILADELPHIA 824311
nited Water. e bk 5 .0
UNITED WATER FLORIDA mingten, DE
~q Cid Heok Road — Check Numbert “Check Oata )
ington Park, New Jersey §7840-1738 00096488 oy
PAY Eight hundred and 96/100 Dollars
KINKOQ'S
PO Box 105522 sew
An GA 303488522 $800.96
To the anta,
order of
t*i*iFlLE COPY****t
' CHECK DATE CHECK NUMBER
INVOICE v
N _ OUCHER NUMBER R DISCOUNT
239400281078 08/21/88 800.98 0.0 800.86
000158
VENDOR NAME YOTAL AMGUNT TOTAL CISCOUNTS | TOTAL PAID AMOUNT
Kinko's 2300.96 $0.00 $300.96




RS ., . INVDICE
g Offizisl BiLL of Sale
“‘n o.t - Terss liet 30 Nays

Bl . i Please Refererce Invoice R below

: The ne,tfr!way to*ofﬁce* 2

T Invoicet:23940028107E

. - H t 4 Fager |
it
Paynwntl'ms:empgﬁmfep " Custoser ¢ UMITED WATER FLIKIEA
o plaué [erlomapomv . ".‘-.;auu: Useré ANITED MATER FLORKDA
I\ TRAL Wi o "&efermn'

K 'x.-; WRIEMEILS 724400

i: n:m “UB/21/98: 12320 FN

Co-Barbiars 5997

B '5 :Ot)' Frice Disc.  Awant
’ _ 5 FS Yoc Creation Tabs
;- | 785 200, ' 0.0 1.0 T
FS Btodt Jabs . L.
iae 00 -~ 0.0 02007
gm 8.5 X L1 SINGLE ST - ;
o AW .49 000 25T
: L snm. VL VR 1 . T
Cot3 350 0.0 105.00 T
LQVERSTZE POSTER/RAN 18 X 2 WITE DOND
m 25 0.00 89.50 1
=FS AL Features Special imﬂ.w;
X e 0.5 00 29T
.F8 §/3 FL Prc Special Price
“CUsNe 0.0 0.0 TeTT
r,h S/5 F1 Prc White {13 17
N 2558 0.4 % 0:00 [T
\ mx OTHER FOLDING twm D
v oA 00 0.0 51077
S t 75 8/ F1 Prc Fastel, Astro, Calor - KX
oL el gy, 009 000 L ILST )
.-+ .- FSWSFLPre Special Price
AR 1w - 0.0 0.90 45T
9 2 s LRSS L Pre Pastel, fstro, Calor
.;.g,:z g & o2 AR 0m 0.00 LET
520 S
,‘.mmm;m&wa‘é.‘& E.'; NEXT RAGE FOLLOWS -
i g pmbipkon oy LR K
IO AT - )
gjé_mm-; j‘?f T EE

kinko’s

The néw way to office:

For the appropriate

Please refer [0 map on rererse.

Questions? Please call:

1-800-488-3705

Payment Processing Center,

fﬂh‘cﬁ Address

1

Co-worker's Initials

Ao\ LL@»,_

Print Name

>

isit the Kinko's Web Sile 4t
itp:/Avww.kinkos.com

RANCH COPY -VHITE
M COPY - YCLLOW
USTOMEN COPY - PINK

)X /804 Tos2 558

, wvoice . VSN Y W
afficial Bilk of Sal

irrus Hot 39 Pays k'—,) l

toasa feforenze fmvoice W Lelow
PREVIOUS FaBGE. EXISTS

Invoice#z 2:_5‘?400281078

- Receipt H: 406984 Reg: 4 Fage: 2
Custosier Wz (000207974 OO0
Dustomer ¢ LRITED WATER FLORIDA
&uth. User: UHITED.VATER FLORIIA
Referemce :

WARTE BELLS T21-4600

00159

Co-Marker: 9991
Disc,  fwouat

21/73 12:Q0 Ph
Frice

.

bate: 3/
fity

REQ.ID

Jo/0

RECEWE
%ﬁt"ﬁ 2 W26 1998

.‘lfl}f“”‘;/ﬂ ',‘ y -o.?‘x)vqb
Kit#o's L )
The rem wiy ta urhce,iu -U/ [ D
LKirko's - the cofy center (04} 442-3085
O SWI2-16 RAYHEADOALS .
- RORK - :
" JWJWILLE, R




LAW QFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A.
3000 INCEPENCENT SAUARC

POST OFFICE BOx %9 TCLEO~ONE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 19041 35a-20s%0

FEICRAL Tax 10 #39-235c27>

March 13, 1998
Billed through 02/28/98
Bill number 600-00000~-333 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
1400 Millcoe Road
Jacksonville, Florida 32225

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses
DISBURSEMENTS

02/28/98 Federal Express Charges on 02-04~98 10.00

000160



United Water Florida Inc. ‘ ‘ PAGE 2

Bill number 500-00000-333 JLA

02/28/98 FALR, Database Search for All references to

P “Retroactive Ratemeking” 61.75

02/28/98 Long Distance Telephone Chargzes 1.74
Total disbursements for this matter S 73.49

000161

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, RA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201



LAW QOFFICES
MARTIN, ADE. BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A.
3CCO INDEPENDENT SOQUARE

POST OFFICE B8OX SO
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

TELERPMONE
{904 384-2080
FEOERAL Tax 10 #59-2380277

June 10, 1998
Billed through 05/31/98

Bill number 600-00702-007 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 01d Hook Road L
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attention: Mr. Walton F. Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses

DISBURSEMENTS
04/30/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges ' o 2.30
05/31/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 2.71
05/31/98 Federal Express Charges on 05-13-98 and 05-15-98 40.45
05/31/98 Copy Charges from the FPSC Re: Hugh Larkin Jr.’s
Testimony 4,60
Total disbursements for this matter ;-——-;6?06

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 50.06

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 50.06

000162



LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.
3000 INDEPENOENT SOUARE
POST OFFICE BOX %9

T!Ll:ﬂuc,.,:
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

19041 3842080

FEJERAL TAX iD 559-2: 7

July 20, 1998
Billed through 06/30/98

Bill number 600-00702-010 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 01d Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attention: Mr. Waltop F. Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses

DISBURSEMENTS

06/30/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 8.84

06/30/98 Federal Express Charge on 06-22-98 19.40
Total disbursements for this matter S 28.24%

000163



LAaw OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE., BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A,
3000 INDEPENDENT SOUARE
POST OFFICE BOX %9 TELEPHONE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 1904l 354-20m0

FECERAL Tax 10 #59-2380277

August 13, 1998
Billed through 07/31/¢%8
Bill number 600-00702-013 JLA
United Water Florida Inc.

700 Kinder Kamack Road
Oradell, NJ 07649

Attention: Mr. Walton F. Hill

e

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses

DISBURSEMENTS
07/31/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 1.10
07/31/98 Photocopy Charges - 20 copies of Response to
Deficiency Letter June, 1998, furnished to FPSC 172.80
Total disbursements for this matter $ 173.90

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 173.90

- ———— s -

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 173.90

000164



LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.
3000 INDEPENDENT SOUARE

POST OFFICE 8OX 52 TELEPHONE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 1904 354-2050
FEDERAL Tax 1D #59-2380277
September 18, 1998
Billed through 08/31/98
Bill number 600-00702~017 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.

200 01ld Hook Road

Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attention: Mr. Walton F. Hill

UWF[1998 Rate Case Expenses

Balance forward as of bill number 013 dated 08/13/98 $ 173.90
DISBURSEMENTS
08/31/98 Federal Express Charges on 07-30-98, 08-12-98,

and 08-14-98 83.95
08/31/98 Ikon Office Solutions, Documant Services

Re: Notice of Application for Adjustment of Rates 251.08
08/31/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 2.55%
08/31/68 Ikon Qffice Solutions, Document Services

Re: Response.to Florida Public Service

Commission Data Request dated July 24, 1998 82.84

Total disbursements for this matter - §  420.43

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 3 420.43

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL s 420.43



AW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A.
3000 INCEPENDENT SOUARE

POST OFFICE 8OX =9

TELEPMONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 (904 354-2080
November 2, 1998 FESERAL TAx 10 #359-2350277
Billed through 09/30/98
Bill number 600-00702-019 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 0ld Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-179%
Attention: Mr. Walton F. Hill
UWF[/1998 Rate Case‘Ekpenses
Balance forward as of bill number 017 dated 09/18/98 S 420.43
Payments received since last bill (last payment 10/06/98) $ 420.43
Net balance forward $ .00
DISBURSEMENTS -
09/30/98 Fee Charge from the FPSC for requested copies of

customer comments 9.80
09/30/98 Federal Express Charges on 08-25-98 and 09-11-98 55.80
09/30/98 Ikon Office Solutions, Document Services

Re: Response to Florida Public Service

Commission Data Request dated August 28, 1998 90.06
09/30/98 Priority Couriers 09-02-98 6.50
09/30/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 8.21

Total disbursements for this matter S 170.37
BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 170.37

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL S 170.37

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE $ 170.37



RGNS LNVOLCE

h .:\ - Bficial Bill of Sale

Terss HNot 30 Nays

a . i Please Refererce Invoice N F—S

H3<Ouc.n.@n= 239400281078

PR LA Y
k .G v i
: B Receipt Nz 40870 1 s
,§~¥abbas§3 Al € - s 853%%%8._ Fages 1
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kinko’s

The new way to office:r pg

For the appropriate

wvoice VMY UwW
Gificial Ball of Sale ﬂ
irruz Het 19 Days . \.~V Vr
*legsa Heference Ivoice  Delom
EvIOUs FAGE. EXISTS

Invoice# z239400281078

| - Receipt H: 406584 Req: 4 Fage: 2
Payment Processing Cenler,  cvone e ﬁamqﬁmﬁa e
Mease refer Lo map on reverse. Dustomar = UNITED WWIER FLORIDA o))
&uth. Users GITED. YATER FUIRTIA n
Referencr : i
Questions? Please call: WARIE WelLS 721500 nnW
_-moo,@m-u.\cm Uate: G3/21/33 122 P Co-Narker: 9797
fity Frice Disz.  faont:
EX TS REQID
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| 7270 ¢
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, Fr%man -

g

. RECES
P r% L G2 61998

PROCUREMENT DEPT
i

Prini Name

..:: Ea_oareﬁf_.m:n.:
*_6 /v kinkos.com
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LAw OFFICES

MARTIN. ADE. BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.
3000 INOEPENDENT SQUARE

POST OFFICL 8OX SS9 TELES~ONE

JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 19021 3%4-20180

FEOCRAL Tax © #29-2380277
March 13, 1998
Billed through 02/28/98
Bill number 600-00000-333 JLA
United Water Florida Inc.

1400 Millcoe Road
Jacksonville, Florida 32225

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses
DISBURSEMENTS

02/28/98 Federal Express Charges on 02-04-98 10.00

000160



United Wwatar Florida Inc. : ' PAGE 2
Bill number 600-00000-333 JLA

02/28/9s8 FALR, Database Search for All references to

B “Retroactive Ratemeking” 6L.75

02/28/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 1.74
Total disbursements for this matter S 73.49

000161

MARTIN. ADE. BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, PA.
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 3220



LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.

. 3000 INDEPENDOENT SQUARE

POST OFFICE 8OX =9

TELEPHONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

(904) 384.2050
FEOERAL Tax 10 #59-238027
June 10, 1998
Billed through 05/31/98
Bill number 600-00702-007 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 0ld Hook Road o
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attention: Mr. Walton F. Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses

DISBURSEMENTS
04/30/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges ' : ‘ 2.30
05/31/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 2.71
. 05/31/98 Federal Express Charges on 05-13-98 and 05-15-98 40.45
05/31/98 Copy Charges from the FPSC Re: Hugh Larkin Jr.’s
Testimony 4.60
Total disbursements for this matter ;—--—gajag

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 50.06

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 50.06

000162




LAW QFFICES

MARTIN, ADE, BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.
3000 INDEPENDENT SQUARE
POST OFFICE BOX =9

TEL:BuQNg
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201

(SOt} 354.2°5°
FESCRAL TAX 1D #55-29m0277

July 20, 1998
Billed through 06/30/98

Bill number 600~00702~-010 JLA

United Water Florida Inc.
200 0ld Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attention: Mr. Waltop F. Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses

DISBURSEMENTS

06/30/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 8.84

06/30/98 Federal Express Charge on 06-22-98 19.40
Total disbursements for this matter ] 28.24
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LAW OFFICES

MARTIN, ADE. BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER. P. A.
A00O0 INDEPENDENT SQUARE
POST OFFICE BOX S9 TELEPMONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 {9041 354-2080

FEOERAL Tax 1D #59.235“77

August 13, 1998
Billed through 07/31/98
Bill number 600-00702-013 JLA
United Water Florida Inc.
700 Kinder Kamack Road
Oradell, NJ 07649

Attention: Mr. Walton F. Hill

‘e

UWF/1998 Rate Case Expenses

DISBURSEMENTS
07/31/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 1.10
07/31/98 Photocopy Charges - 20 copies of Response to
Deficiency Letter June, 1998, furnished to FPSC 172.80
Total disbursements for this matter s 173.90

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS S 173.90

——— ———— —

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 173.50
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LAW QFFICES

MARTIN, ADE., BIRCHFIELD & MICKLER, P. A.
30CO INDEPENDENT SQUARE

POST OFFICE BOX %59

TELEPMONE
JACKSONVILLE, FLORIDA 32201 1904 354-20%0
November 2, 1998 FESERAL Tax 10 #39-2380277

Billed through 09/30/98

Bill number 600-00702-019 JLA
United Water Florida Inc.
200 01d Hook Road
Harrington Park, NJ 07640-1799

Attention: Mr. Walton F. Hill

UWF/1998 Rate Case‘Ekpenses

Balance forward as of bill number 017 dated 09/18/98 $ 420.43
Payments received since last bill (last payment 10/06/98) $ 420.43
Net balance forward $ .00
DISBURSEMENTS
09/30/98 Fee Charge from the FPSC for requested copies of

customer comments 9.80
09/30/98 Federal Express Charges on 08-25-98 and 09-11-68 55.80
09/30/98 Ikon Office Solutions, Document Services

Re: Response to Florida Public Service

Commission Data Request dated August 28, 1998 90.05
09/30/98 Priority Couriers 09-02-98 6.50
09/30/98 Long Distance Telephone Charges 8.21

Total disbursements for this matter $ 170.37

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $ 170.37
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $ 170.37
TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE $ 170.37





