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Public Service Cornmission 
Capital Circle Off ice Center 

Tall ah assee I f I 3 2 3 9 9 -08 50 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard i3EPQSFT 

0 3 6 8  $U1,25 
RE: TG835-02-0-R 

To Public Service Comlnission: 

Let this letter be a notice of CANCELLATION of my certificate. 1 nc, longer have an interest in 
providing pay phones in my area, Enclosed is the balance that is due on the account, 

loAnne Costa0 
j C Communication s 
3956 Town Center Blvd., #273 
Orlando, FL 32837-6 103 



Ruth Nettles ************ Official Filing 712512003 I I :09 AM 

Ruth Nettles 

To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
RE: TG835 

Okay, I'll open a docke t  today .  Thanks P a u l a .  

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Pau la  Isler 
S e n t :  F r iday ,  J u l y  2 5 ,  2003  11:09 AM 
T o :  Ruth Nettles 
S u b j e c t :  RE: T G 8 3 5  

I t  i s  OK t o  open t h e  d o c k e t ,  e f f e c t i v e  t h e  da t e  we r e c e i v e d  t h e  r e q u e s t .  Thanks.  

----- O r i g i n a l  Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
S e n t :  F r i d a y ,  July 2 5 ,  2003 1 0 : 5 8  AY 
l o :  Pad- Tsler 
Sub] ect : T G 8 3 5  

Good morning. I have r e c i e v e d  a l e t t e r  f o m  JC Communicat ions/Costel lo  r e q u e s t i n g  
c a n c e l l a t i o n  of c e r t i f i c a t e ;  t h e y  have p a i d  RaFs $149 .50 ,  Penalty of $12.50, and I n t e r e s t  
of $3, postmarked 7 / 2 2 / 0 3 .  L e t  m e  know i f  w e  can open a docket t o  process t h i s  
c a n c e l l a t i o n  r e q u e s t .  Thanks Pau la .  

1 


