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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler qace.00 -73L-d  

3cc.00 & n e  
10- 07- OB 

Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully 

Monday, October 13,2008 2:07 PM 
L' - I q $ q  a 9,: 

Subject: RE: Docket 080492-TX - RAF fine received 8 7 4  QCT 14200fi 
R-i- 

Concerning Touchtone Communications Inc. of Delaware - TX936 - Deposit $804 as you normally would for 2007 RAF and late 
payment charges. The $500 balance is for the fine. Please deposit $200 in the Public Service Commission Regulatory Trust Fund 
and the balance of $300 in the General Revenue Fund. Please provide proof of payment to the Clerk's Office for documenting in 
Docket No. 080492-TX. Thanks. 

- ___ ___ __ - _ _ _ ~  -- 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, October 13,2008 2:02 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: Docket 080492-TX 

TX936, paid $1,304.00. Please let me know the breakdown 

10/13/2008 


