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Amended Return c Global Operating Company 

alhoun Place Suite 650 
CLER&kville. MD 20855 

1 ,_ .. . PERIOD COVERED: 
,.1 :."sJ i J j -vsc 8 2- 01/01/09 TO 12/31/09 

(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip) 

I 

LINE 
NO. __ 
14. 
15. 
16. 
17. 
18. 

19 

20. 

21. 

22. 
23. 
24. 
25. 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

Long Distance Services 
Access Services 
Private Line Services 
Leased Facilities & Circuits Services 
Miscellaneous Services 

TOTAL Telephone Services 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Telecommunications Companies ('I 

TOTAL REVENUES Far Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 8 by 0.0020) 
Penalty far Late Payment (see"3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 
Interest for Late Payment (see"3. Failure to File by Due Dale" on back) 
Extension Payment Fee (see "4. Extension" on back) 

26. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ($700.00 MINIMUM) s 700.00 
~ 

0 )  These amounts must be intrastate onlv and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back) 
(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of a wmpany, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $700 shall be imposed as provided in 

Section 364.336, Florida Statutes. 

C U R R E N T  COMPANY STATUS 
( ) Facilities-Based Carrier ( X ) Reseller ( )Call Aggregator 
( ) Alternate-Operator Service ( ) Rebiller ( )Other: 

BILLING INFORMATION 
Complete below if billing agent if other than yourself. 

(Name) (Address: City/State/Zip) (Telephone) 
What is the total amount of customer deposits collected? What is the total amount ofbond held (if applicable)? 

Amount. s for Amount: s Expires: 

C O M P A N Y  INFORMATION 
Do you lease telecommunications' facilities? ( ) YES ( ) NO 
If YES, who do you Icase facilities from7 Name: 

Address: 

I, the undersigned ownerloficer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief, the above 
information is a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false Statement in writing with 
the intent to mislead a public servant in the performance of hisher duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree. 

General Counsel (Officer) 
(signaty6 af Company Official) (Title) (Date) 

Telephone Number 301-610-4300 Fax Number 240-314-4219 
(Preparer  of Form-Please P r in t  Name) 
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Raquel Tully 

From: Paula lsler 

Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully 

cc: Melinda Watts 

Subject: RE: TKO51 

Tuesday, May 12,2009 924  AM 

Yes, they have requested cancellation and were required to pay the 2009 RAF Please provide the Clerk's Ofice with proof of 
payment so that it can be documented in Docket No 090076-TI Thanks. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Tuesday, May 12,2009 9:20 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject TKO51 

TK051, paid $700.00 on a 2009 Raf form, they do not have a cancellation letter. Do you know if they are trying to cancel? 




