
DATE DEPOSIT Page 1 of 1 

Raquel Tully 
- - - -_ 

From: Toni Earnhart 
0 2 2 m u  

Sent: 

To: Bob Casey; Ray Kennedy 

cc: Raquel Tully 

Subject: $250,000 received by American Dial Tone (Docket No. 110082-TP) 
This is a fine payment. 

Tuesday, August 02,201 1 955 AM 

The total $250,000 should be applied to the General Revenue Trust Fund. 

From: Raquel Tully 

To: Toni Earnhart 
Sent: Tuesday, August 02,2011 9:30 AM A 3 3  d m  

- 0  
Subject: g s r ; !  r z  I received a $250,000.00 check from American Dial tone, please let me know how to deposit this. I amn3: 
trying to get it in this mornings deposit, so if you could please let me know by 1O:OO I would appreciate GS 4' 
Thanks s$e = 47 s a 2  
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