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Lance J.M. Steinhart, P.C.

Attorney At Law
1725 Windward Concourse
Suite 150
Alpharetta, Georgia 30005
Also Admitted in New York Telephone: (770} 232-9200
and Maryland Facsimile: (770) 232-9208

Email: Isteinhart@telecomcounsel.com
July 12, 2011

VIA OVERNIGHT DELIVERY

Florida Public Service Commission
Beth Salack, Director

2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.

Gunter Bldg.

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850
(850)413-6770

Re:  Global Capacity Group, Inc. and Global Capacity Direct, LLC
Voluntary Cancellation of Authority O o 201

pram——
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On behalf of the above-referenced anies, I hereby respectfully request Global
Capacity Group, Inc.’s Registered as an Intr#state Interexchange Telecommunications Company;
Docket No. 080569-TI granted on August 26/ 2008 and a Certificate to Provide Competitive
Local Exchange Telecommunications; Docket(é;lo 080570-TX granted on November 18, 2008

To Whom It May Concern:

and Global Capacity Direct, LLC’s \Registered as an Intrastate Interexchange
Telecommunications Company; Docket No. 100291-T1 granted on June 16, 2010 and a
Certificate to Provide Competitive Local Exchange Telecommunications Service; Docket No.
100273-TX granted on August 17, 2010 be cancelled.

Global Capacity Group, Inc. and Global Capacity Direct, LLC assert that there are no ’j
customers whose service would be impacted by these cancellations.

I have also enclosed an extra copy of this letter to be date stamped and returned to me in the
enclosed, self-addressed, postage prepaid envelope.

If you have any questions or if I may provide you with any additional information, please do
not hesitate to call me.

and Global Capacity Direct, LLC

ce: Mr. Dan Kardatzke
DOCUMENT NEMREE-[ATS
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This transmission may be: (1) subject to the Attorney-Client Privilege; (2) an Attorney Work Product; or (3) Strictly
Confidential. This transmission, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient. Any
unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact
the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message. Thank you for your cooperation.

From: Toni Earnhart [mailto: TEarnhar@PSC.STATE.FL.US]

Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2011 12:23 PM

To: Lance Steinhart
Subject: Voluntary Cancellation Request for Global Capacity Direct, LLC (TY026) and Global Capacity Group, Inc.

(TX976)
Importance: High

Lance,

Giobal Capacity Grbup, Inc. (TX976) paid the 2011 RAF necessary for voluntary cancellation. Actually they paid $700
and only needed to pay $600.

Global Capacity Direct, LLC (TY026) has not yet paid the 2011 RAF necessary for voluntary cancellation. They need only
submit $500 and state in a letter that they paid $700 in error to TX976 and ask to apply the overage of $100 be applied to

the 2011 RAF for TY026. ‘
Qe |35

Can you check with the Company about the TY026 2011 RAF payment. iﬁ

I would like to open one docket to handle both per your letter of July 12, 2011.

Thanks,

. @-\\

Toni Joy McCoy-Earnhart .
Regulatory Analyst '/E:T
Florida Public Service Commission

Division of Regulatory Compliance

2540 Shumard Oak Blvd.

Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850

TEARNHAR@PSC.STATEFL.US

850/413-6532 Direct Line

850/413-6533 Fax Line
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Comp iance Telecom Tax Services
Sales Tax S
OhUTIONS Trsemeres,,

407-260-1011 » 407-260-1033/fax * mark@csilongwood.com « 740 Florida Central Pkwy, Ste. 2028, Longwood, FL. 32750

September 8, 2011
Via FedEx, 2% day

Florida Public Service Commission
Attn: Toni Joy McCoy-Earnhart
Regulatory Analyst

Division of Regulatory Compliance
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0850

RE:  Global Capacity Group, Inc. (TX976) & Global Capacity Direct, LLC (TY026)
2011 RAF

Dear Toni,

As per your e-mail dated August 16, 2011. We paid $700 in error to Global Capacity Group,
Inc. (TX976) we are requesting that the overage of $100 be applied to Global Capacity Direct,
LLC (TY026) 2011 RAF. Also, enclosed is a check for $500 to cover the amount due for Global
Capacity Direct, LL.C’s 2011 RAF necessary for voluntary cancellation.

Please do not hesitate to contact me at 407-260-1011 or mark@csilongwood.com if you have any
questions or concerns.

Thank you for your assistance in processing this filing.

Sincerely,

Mark G. L
Attorney-in-F
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Compliance Solutions, Inc.

740 Florida Central Parkway
. Suite 2028
Longwood, FL 32750
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 05/20/2011 at 08:57:50 by TJE

Complete Name: Global Capacity Group, Inc.

Mailing Name: Global Capacity Group, Inc.
Company Code: TX976 FEID Number: 75-2970073

COMPANY INFORMATION

Address Line 1: 200 Scuth Wacker Drive, Suite 1650

Address Line 2:

City: Chicago State: IL Zip Code: 60606-5847
Reg. Date: 11/18/2008 Inactive Date:

Transferad To:

Trans. From:

Certificate 1: 8740 Certificate 2:
Corporate Type: Corporation
Service 1: CLX -~ Competitive Local Exchange

Service 2@

Service 3:

Service 4:

Class (WAW):

Phone Count:

County 1: County 2:
County 3: County 4:
Bankruptcy: Yes


http:Transfer.9d

Complete Name:

Mailing Name:
Company Code:

COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 09/20/2011 at 08:57:38 by TJE

Global Capacity Group, Inc.

Global Capacity Group, Inc.

TX976

FEID RNumber:

75-2970073

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2011 THROUGH 06/30/2011

Reg. Date:
Service:
Received:
Status:
Amended:
Frozen:
Payment Count:

11/18/2008

Inactive Date:

CLX - Competitive Local Exchange

Actual RAF Form
Satisfied

No

No

1 Payment Made to Date

Extensgion: No
Comments: No

Operating Rev: $2.,510.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00
RAF Rate: 0.0020
Assessment Due Paid Owe
RAF $600.00 $700.00 $-1060.00
Penalty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Interest $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Extension Fee $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $600.00 $700.00 $-100.00
Last modification was made on Monday, August 1, 2011 at 4:04 PM by Valorie Moore




