Linda Roberman

From: Chris Johnson <chris@kwru.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 06, 2017 7:46 AM
To: '‘Admin’

Cc: chriskw@bellsouth.net

Subject: RE: Lindholm Roofing Estimate

Rick,

Thank you for the quote on the maintenance building.

We also have a second building that has extensive roof damage, you may not have seen it because the damage is only
on the water side. Itis a double wide office building 60’ x 24‘. Is there any way we could get a quotation for that as
well? We will want to do all the roofing at once as | am sure this is more cost effective than making multiple

trips.  Best — Chris (305) 522-0052

* Christopher A. lohnson
‘ President
6630 Front Street

Key West, FL 32040

(305) 295-3301
www. kwru.com

KW RESORT UTILITIES

From: Admin [mailto:Admin@ricklindholm.com]
Sent: Tuesday, November 07, 2017 4:15 PM

To: chris@kwru.com

Subject: RE: Lindholm Roofing Estimate

Good Afternoon!

Attached you will find your requested roof proposal. If you have any questions related to the outlined work, please feel
free to call or e-mail us so that we may best assist you. Concerning our schedule, we are currently several months out for
all new re-roofs. However, if you decide to move forward with the work and you are currently experiencing leaking or are
in need of making your roof water-tight, please let us know and we would be happy to address a temporary repair until
the re-roof process can take place.

To move forward with work, please confirm by phone or e-mail and we would be happy to follow up with permit app.
forms and deposit info.

* Due to the high volume of calls and e-mails we are receiving at this time, please allow up to 1-2 days for
response time.
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* If you are unable to reach us on our office line, please e-mail us any questions you may have- this is our
most reliable form of communication.

*We will be sure to get back with you as soon as we possibly can. We thank you in advance for your
patience!

Thank you & have a wonderful day,

Abbey Lindholm

Lindholm Construction Inc. Roofing & Sheet Metal

Call (305) 852-5730

Email admin@ricklindholm.com

88005 Overseas Hwy. Ste. 10-157 Islamorada, Fl. 33036 (POST NET Facility- Mailing Address Only!)

KWRU 015068





