
OR IC 1NA I: 
REQUESTTO ESTABLISH DOCKET 

(PLEAsE TYPE) 

Date 9 / 2 5 / 0 1  Docket No. 0 / / 3 & ? -  7c 
1. Division Name/Staff Name Division of RequlatorV Oversiqht/McCov 

2. OPR Division of Requlatory Oversiqht/McCoy 

3 .  OCR Leqal Services 

4. Suggested Docket Title Request f o r  Cancellation of Pay Teleuhone Certificate No. 7459 

M i k e  A Reed d/b/a Lake Eustis Laundry, effective 8/10/01. 

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary) 

A. Provide NAMES ONLY for regulated companies or ACRONYMS ONLY regulated industries, 

B. Provide COMPLETE name and address for all others. (Match representatives to clients.) 
as shown in Rule 25-22.104, F.A.C.  

1. Parties and their representatives (if any)  

2. Interested Persons and their representatives (if any) 

6 .  Check one: 
XX Documentation is attached. 

Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 

I:\PSC\RAR\WP\ESTDKT. 

PSC/RAR 10 (Revised 01/96) 



M i k e  A Reed d /b /a  

COMPANY NAME: Lake Eustis Laundrv CO.  CODE: TG708 

COMPANY LIAISON: Same, Owner 

DOCKET NO.: CERTIFICATE NO.: 7 4 5 9  EFFECTIVE: 0 6 / 1 6 / 0 0  

RAF RETURN NOTICE: 

DELINQUENT NOTICE: 

OTHER RETURNED MAIL: 

RAR’ S RETURNED MAIL: 

YEAR(s) RAFs NOT PAID: 2001 

YEAR(s) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID: 

REVENWES/YEAR: 

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT: 

OTHER INFORMATION 

08/10/01 - From company - l e t t e r  r e q u e s t i n s  c a n c e l l a t i o n .  

0 8 / 1 3 / 0 1  - Wrote company and a d v i s e d  t o  e i t h e r  pay 2 0 0 1  RAF o r  p r o v i d e  date 

certain it  would be pa id .  Response due  08 /28 /01 .  



Paula Mer  

from: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Catherine Smith 
Tuesday, August 28, 2001 3:37 PM 
Paula lsler 
FW: New filing in undocketed matter 

----- Original Message----- 
From: Della Fordham 
Sent: Tuesday, August 28, 2001 2 : 5 7  PM 
To: Catherine Smith 
Subject: FW: New filing in undocketed matter 

1-1-1 Original Message----- 
From: Lwilliam@psc.state.fl.us [mailto:Lwilliam@psc.state.fl.us] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 28, 2001 2 : 2 6  PM 
To: CCRAIG@psc.state.fl.us; LGIVENS@psc.state.fl.us; 
DFORDHAM@psc.state.fl.us; SHOWARD@psc.state.fl.us 
Subject: New filing in undocketed matter 

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = CCA/FISCAL - Copy of $50.00 payment record from Lake 
Eustis Laundry for 2001 
RAFS, Deposit D112 dated 8/28/01. 

DOCUMENT PATH = 
file://L:\PSC\LIB~RY\FILINGS\Ol\lO64l-Ol 

Document Filed 08/27/01 

The filing described above is now available i n  PDF format, and may also be 
available in Wordperfect or other formats. 

To access it, click on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows 
Explorer window. You will see the PDF (Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also 
see other versions if they exist. Double-click on the preferred version and 
the document will open. 

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later 
when the reformatted version is available. (For more information, see PDF Tips 
on the How To menu.) I 

You can also go to the docket in CMS by triple-clicking on the DOCKET NUMBER, 
typing ctrl-C to copy, and using the paste icon to paste t h e  docket  number 
into the query line in CMS. 
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This is an  automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is necessary. 
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DATE 

8 ,  

I 

I .  1:: 
I I 

Plume Complete m o w  IC Omcirl Mailing Addrcs  HA,Chmg+ 

. 4  * .  . $ ' .. .:. 1 .a 0; 
1.  Gross Operating Revenue (Fidrida) 
2. Gross Intrastate Revenue ' ' I 1 '  , I  

. .  
5.  Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) * ' '1.- - 

6.  Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 
1 

7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 



STATE OF FLORIDA 
COMMISSIONERS : 

' E. LEON JACOBS, JR., CHAIRMAN 
J. TERRY DEASON 
LILA A. JABER 
BRAULIO L. BAEZ 
MICHAEL A. PALECKJ 

DIVISION OF COMPETmVE SERVICES 
WALTER D'HAESELEER 
(850) 413-6600 

August 13,2001 

Mr. Mike Reed 
Lake Eustis Laundry 
1004 Pine Meadows Road 
Eustis, FL 32726 

Dear Mr. Reed: 

On August 10, 2001, the Commission received your letter dated August 8 requesting 
cancellation o f  your pay telephone certificate. Rule 25-24.5 14, Florida Administrative Code, 
provides that when requesting cancellation of a certificate, a company must either pay the current ' 

year's Regulatory Assessment Fee (RW) or provide a date certain it will be paid. Therefore, 
enclosed is the 2001 RAF return form. The RAF is .0015% of a company's revenues or $50, 
whichever is greater. 

Once the Commission receives your payment or the date the 2001 RAF will be paid, a docket 
will be established to cancel your certificate voluntarily. In the meantime, if you have any 
questions, just Iet me know. I can be reached at (850) 413-6502-voice, (850) 413-6503-fax, by 
internet e-mail at pisler@psc.state.fl.us, or at the above address. 

Sincerely, 

Paula J. Isler, Research Assistant 
Bureau of Service Quality 

Enclosure 

CAPITAL CiRCLE OFFICE CENTER 2540 SHUMARX) OAK BOULEVARD TALLAHASSEE, FL 323994850 
An Affirmative ActionEqurl Opportunity Employer 

PSC Websitc: htta:llwww.floridaim.com Internet E-mail: contocrepsc.statc.fl.us 



TO AVOID PENALTY AND TNTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FLED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2002 

Pay Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return 

Florida Public Service Commission 
cc: RU\Q Zalcr 

STATUS: (See Filing Instructions on Back of Form) 
I 

Actual Return I TG708-01-O-R 
Lake Eustis Laundry 
1004 Pine Meadows Road 

Estimated Return 
Amended Return 

Eustis, FL 32726 
PERIOD COVERED: 
0 1 /O 11200 1 TO 12/3 1 /2001 

Please Complete Below If Oflicial Mailing Address Has Changed 

FOR PSC USE ONLY 
Check# 

0603002 
00300 I 

0603002 
00401 I 

$ 

s P 

$ I 

Postmark Date 
Initials of Preparer 

(Name of Company) (Address) (C ity/State) (Zip) 

LINE 
NO. 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

6.  

7. 

8. 

9. 

ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION 

Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) 

Gross Intrastate Revenue 

LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* 
(see "2. Fees'' on back) 

TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation 
(Line 2 less Line 3) 

Regulatory Assessment Fee Due - (Multiply Line 4 by 0.001 5 )  

Penalty for Late Payment (see "3, Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 

Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date'' on back) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE 

AMOUNT 

$ 

AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $SO 

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED 

Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered 
by this Retum 

These amounts must be intrastate only and must bc verifiable. 

I, the undersigned owner/oEcer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that IO the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a 
true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a 
public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the second degree. 

(Signature of Company Oficial) (Title) @ate) 

Telephone Number 1 1 FaxNumberI ) 

F.E.I. No. 
(Preparer of Form - Please Print Name) 



August 08,2001 

Florida Public Service Commission 
Division of Co"unications 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee,Florida 32399-0850 

Re: Cancellation of CertSmte 

Please cancel my pay telephone operator certificate &&ve immediately. I never have installed the equipment. 
It seems there is not enough business to support and it is to much of a hassle. If there is any money due please 
inform me. 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 08/13/2001 at 12:25:49 by P J I  

Complete Name: Mike A Reed d/b/a Lake E u s t i s  Laundry 

Mailing Name: Lake Eustis  Laundry 
Company Code: TG708 F E I D  Number: - 

MAILING 

Attention: 
Address Line 1:1004 Pine Meadows Road 
Address Line 2: 
City: Eustis 
E-mail Address:MJREED1004@aol.com 
W e b  Address: 

Liaison 1 : M i k e  Reed 
T i t l e  : O w n e r  

Phone : (352) 357-8961 
E-mail: MJREED1004@aol.com 

Fax I: -34 

County : 

INFORMATION 

State: FL Zip Code: 32726 

Liaison 2: 
Title: 
Phone : 
E-mail : 

Fax 2: 

1 



COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 08/13/2001 at 12:26:04 by P J I  

Complete Name: Mike A R e e d  d/b/a Lake E u s t i s  Laundry 

Mailing Name: Lake Eustis Laundry 
Company Code: TG708 F E I D  Number: - 

RELATED DOCmTS 

0 0 0 4 3 9 - TC Closed Application for certificate to provide pay telephone service by 
Mike A R e e d  d/b/a Lake Eustis Laundry. 

1 



COMPANY I DENT IF ICAT 3 ON 
Printed on 08/13/2001 at 12:25:59 by PJI 

As sessrnent I D u e  

Complete Name: Mike A Reed d/b/a Lake Eust is  Laundry 

P a i d  m e  

Mailing Name: Lake Eustis Laundry 
Company Code: TG708 FEID Number: - 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2000 THROUGH 12/31/2000 

R e g .  Date: 
Service : 
Received: 
Status: 
Amended: 
Frozen: 
Payment Count: 
Operating Rev: 
RAF Rate: 

06/16/2000 
PAT - Pay Telephone 
Actual RAF Form 
Satisfied 
No 
NO 
1 Payment Made to Date 

$ 0 . 0 0  

0.0015 

Inactive D a t e :  

Extension: 
Comments : 

Interstate R e v :  
N e t  €" Due: 

No 
No 

$0.00 
$ 5 0 . 0 0  

I---- - I- $ 5 0 . 0 0  I $ 5 0 . 0 0  I $ 0 . 0 0  I 
I Penalty $ 0 . 0 0  I $ 0 . 0 0  I $ 0 . 0 0  I 
I Interest $ 0 . 0 0  I $ 0 . 0 0  I $0.00 I 
I Extension F e e  I $ 0 . 0 0  I $ 0 . 0 0  I $ 0 . 0 0  I 
I t a 1  I $ 5 0 . 0 0  I $ 5 0 . 0 0  I $ 0 . 0 0  I 
L a s t  modification was made on Wednesday, January 10, 2001 at 2:09 PM by Jackie Knight 

Period covered: Ol/Ol/ZOOO through 12/31/2000 

Documents: Actual RAF form received on 12/16/2000 
RAF form mailed on 12/05 /2000 

Operating revenue: $0.00 

Postmarked Trans Date Date Posted-By Dep # Check # 
12/16/2000 12/22/2000 01/10/2001-JIK GE'398 838 

RAF paid GF398 

RAF r a t e :  0.0015 

C h e c k  Amount 
$50.00  

$50.00 
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