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STATE OF FLORIDA

DIVISION OF RECORDS & REPORTING
BLANCA S. BAYO

DIRECTOR

(850)413-6770

Commissioners:

J. TERRY DEASON, CHAIRMAN
E. LEON JACOBS, JR.

LiLA A. JABER

BRAULIO L. BAEZ

Public Serbice Commission

November 3, 2000

Elias Obaed, President
Amity Enterprises, Inc.

160 North Arlington Road
Jacksonville, Florida 32211

Re: Docket No. 001661-TC

Dear Mr. Obaed:

This will acknowledge receipt of a request for cancellation of Pay Telephone
Certificate No. 5601 by Obaed Enterprises, Inc. and application for certificate to provide
pay telephone service by Amity Enterprises, Inc., d/b/a Food Mart Express, which was filed
in this office on November 2, 2000, and assigned the above-referenced docket number.
Appropriate staff members will be advised.

Mediation may be available to resolve any dispute in this docket. |f mediation is
conducted, it does not affect a substantially interested person’s right to an administrative
hearing. For more information, contact the Office of General Counsel at (850) 413-6248

or FAX (850) 413-7180.

Please make notes as well that Commission Rule 25-22.005(7), F.A.C., requires
certificated companies to notify the Commission of any changes in name, telephone,
address, or contact person. Should your application be granted by the Commission, you
will be expected to comply with this rule by advising us of any changes as they occur.

Division of Records and Reporting
Florida Public Service Commission

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER * 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD ¢ TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850
An Affirmative Action/Equal Opportunity Employer
PSC Website: http://www.floridapsc.com Internet E-mail: contact@psc.state.fl.us




RAR Official Filing:
11/3/00***¥*x* 8:58 AM*****x*x*|inda Williams****k*¥*kx¥kxq

Linda Williams

To: Toni McCoy
Subject: RE: TG274

Ok. He did have a handwritten note on his cancellation letter saying that he was
submitting his RAF for year 2000. What I have is a copy of his letter and a copy of the
$50.00 check and I've document numbered it separate from PATS app. Thank you for your
expertise.

————— Original Message-----

From: Toni McCoy

Sent: Friday, November 03, 2000 8:37 AM
To: Linda Williams

Subject: RE: TG274

Hi Linda,

I had spoken with this gentleman last week. His intention is to cancel his current
certificate and apply for a new PATS certificate at the same time. We don't need an
effective date because he wants the cancellation and approval to coincide so he doesn't
have any uncertificated time. Don't bother mentioning the RAF payment, just forward it to
Administration with a note that it is the 2000 RAF's for Certificate 5601 if that isn't in
the letter already.

We make them pay their RAF's in advance when cancelling certificates so they don't get
confused by RAF letters after they have been cancelled. He just did it all together to
save time.

Take Care,
Toni

————— Original Message-----

From: Linda Williams

Sent: Thursday, November 02, 2000 5:43 PM
To: Toni McCoy

Subject: TG274

Hi Toni. We have a copy of a letter and $50.00 check from this company requesting
cancellation of Cert 5601 and he sent a new application and filing fee in the name of
Amity Enterprises Inc. d/b/a Food Mart Express. My question is, should I put this letter
in the new docket and call the new docket a cancellation of PATS Cert 5601 and pats
application by new company and enter the RAF payment in the new docket also?

Thanks Toni.
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Matilda Sanders A ?‘% - f%/} -7Z-
From: Andrea Cowart L( DCH

Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2000 9:06 AM ) I

To: RAR - Orders-Notices

Cc: Janet Harrison

Subject: Order

The following order has been moved to GCORDERS and is ready to be issued.
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