
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Thursday, January 16,2003 8:28 AM 
Ruth Netttes 
RE: cancellation request ORIGINAL 

Hi Ruth. Yes, since payment for the 2002 RAF was included, you may open the docket-. Make 
the effective date 12/31/02. Thanks. 

_ _ _ -  -Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Wednesday, January 15, 2003 4:30 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: cancellation request 

Hi, Paula. This afternoon I received RAF payment from (TI724) ATC requesting cancellation 
of certificate. Please advice if we can open a docket. Thanks. 
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