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Ruth Nettles **+ersrees Official Filing 2/11/2004 8:32 AM

Ruth Nettles

To: Paula Isler
Subject: RE: Ti374

Thank you, Paula.

————— Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, February 10, 2004 3:15 PM
To: Ruth Nettles

Subject: RE: TI374

Correct. No action necessary by Commission. I checked MCD and the certificate for TI374
was cancelled effective 7/3/03. They just paid their final return for when they were
active. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Tuesday, February 10, 2004 2:40 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TI374

Paula, I have 2003 RAFs from Broadwing Communications Services, Inc., the company paid
total of $532.45. On top of the RAF company has written note, "final report. No longer in
business, operations sold 6/13/03. I found Docket 030288 where the IXC Cert was transfered
to CIII, so really this company does not exist any longer? correct? does the Commission
need to take any other action? Let me know. Thanks, Paula.

Ruth.



