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Ruth Nettles, #sssrasses . Official Filing | 2/27/2004 8:45 AM
Ruth Nettles

To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: TE621/Big Minni Food Store

Okay, I'll open a docket with today's date, 2/27/04, Thanks, Paula.

————— Original Message-----
From: Paula Isler

Sent: Friday, February 27, 2004 8:40 AM
To: Ruth Nettles

Subject: RE: TE621/Big Minni Food Store

Hi Ruth. It is OK to open a docket with an effective date of 12/31/03. Thanks.

————— Original Message-----
From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Wednesday, February 25, 2004 2:01 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TE621/Big Minni Food Store
Importance: High

Paula, I have another payment record from company for $50, they are requesting

cancellation of certificate. I'll place in undocketed until I hear from you, thank you in
advanced for your help.
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