TO AVOLs PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGUI Y ASSESSMENT PEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/ 004

Pay Telephone wwrvice Provider Regulatory Assessare¢nt Fee Rgturn

Florida Public Service Coniffission "~ | il . FOBESCISEONLY
STATUS ’ on (See Flll'llng lf\sctrucllonu on Back of Form) Checld, #3%
Actual Return TF465-03-0-R s S0 00 'oggg%
R ii:m‘g:g RRetum JB Telecom &8 SO :
ended Retum 1359 Bristol Park Place = 0603002
. Lake Mary, FL 32746-4328 $ SO [
PERIOD COVERED: . o L/
01/01/2003 TO 12/31/2003 | Posimr Dte_i2- 2 P02
s Initials of Preparer
Q‘RLQ)Q&C! S’_ Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed
(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip)
o40%00 - TC
LINE
NO. ACCOUNT CLASSIFICATION : AMOUNT
L
L. Gross Operating Revenue (Florida) g\k‘j \Ne s \5. %)0\_,5' $ '/I b3, 2.+
2 Gross Intrastate Revenue C\os @,& N eb /
e B 27.7)
3. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies* ( \ ' )
(see "2. Fees" on back)
4, TOTAL REVENUES for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation $ l" 9 5 ‘ Ci 6
(Lipe 2 less Line 3)
3. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due — (Multiply Line 4 by 0.0015) t q?
6. Penalty for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on baclgso m;:\.r\. . K0
7. Interest for Late Payment (see "3. Failure to File by Due Date" on back) 1 m .
1
8.  TOTAL AMOUNT DUE N~ ' ¢ 52,00
AS PROVIDED IN SECTION 364.336 FLORIDA STATUTES, THE MINIMUM ANNUAL FEE IS $50
THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED REGARDLESS OF THE AMOUNT OF REVENUES REPORTED
0. Number of pay telephones in operation at close of period covered V 6
by this Return '

* These amounts must be intrastate only and must bo verifiable, 9)«“{‘5 \ ;'\e 55 C/\O/j Q__—-(Q ‘%k/g:z
’

1, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief the above information is a
true and correct statement. 1am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a false statement in writing with the intent to mislead a

pPplid\servant in the performance &sj fficial duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the sec egree.
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3/2/2004 2:00 PM

Ruth Nettles ****#xx¥*¥**x  ~ Official Filing
Ruth Nettles

From: Paula Isler

Sent: Tuesday, March 02, 2004 1:48 PM

To: Ruth Nettles

Subject: RE: TF465/JB Telecom

No. They now owe 2004. Fax to me and I'll contact them.

————— Original Message-----

From: Ruth Nettles

Sent: Tuesday, March 02, 2004 12:27 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: TF465/JB Telecom

Importance: High

Good afternoon. I have a request for cancellation of PATS certificate from company; they
have enclosed $53 payment for P/I, and RAFs for 2003. Can I open a docket to cancel

certificate?



