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Official Filing 3/2/2004 159  PM 

Ruth Nettles 

To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
RE: TG7051Mi Ranchito Meat Market 

Okay, thank you. 1'11 fax right now. 

- - - -  -Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Tuesday, March 02, 2004 1:49 PM 
To: Ruth Nettles 
Subject: RE: TG705/Mi Ranchito Meat Market 

Hi Ruth. No do not cancel. They paid 2003 RaF and P&I fo r  2003. They also owe 2004. 
Fax to me and 1'11 contact them. Thanks. 

- - - -  -Original Message----- 
From: Ruth Nettles 
Sent: Tuesday, March 02, 2004 1:26 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TG705/Mi Ranchito Meat Market 

Good afternoon, again. I have another request for cancellation of PATS certificate from Mi 
Ranchito, they have submitted $53 payment. Can you provide the information of what is 
being paid? the year for the RAF would be very helpful, and what year interest are they 
paying? 

Thank you, Paula. 


