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F": Toni MCCOY" ~TMC~OY~FW.STATE.FL.US~ 
To: Cjcapo rale@cfl. m. corm DEPOSIT 
Sent: 
Subject: ' Cancellation of PATS certificate Effective 4/2/04 

. Monday, April 05,2004 1 1 :17 AM 
4 5 5 APR 0 8 loo4 

Ms. Caporde, 
3 

I have received YOIN letter dated March 27th regarding the cancellaii 3n of D'aroc Corporation Inc.'s pay 
telephone certificate. 

In order to process the cancellation in good standing,, the 2003 and 2 104 minimum regulatory 
assessment fees will need to be remitted for the company. The min 1 num Regulatory Assessment Fee is 
$50 and penalties 2nd interest will apply to the 2003 minimum fee i E  it was due 1/30/2004. 

2003 

b $50 plus $9 in penalties and interest =: $59 

$50 minimum 

The total to remit h r  2003 and 2004 is $109 before April 30th to au rid additional P&I. 

Once these fees have been received, 1 can process the cancellation c9 Fective April 2,2004 as this is the 
oficiai day cancellation day since your letter was date stamped rea:. ved by the Commission. Please be 
sure to copy me on your letter and fee: payment. Be sure to put your company code 'TG914/Certificate 
No. 8223' on the memo section of your check. 

Call me if you have any questions, 

Sincerely , 

Toni Joy McCoy 
Regulatory Analyst 
Florida Public SerYice Commission 
Bureau of Market 'Development 
--- TMCC'OY((;.%PSC.!3TATE:FL:_VS -.- 
850/413-6532 Dircxt Line 
850/413-6533 Fax Line 





877-502-2265 

b 
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March 27,2004 

Toni J. McCoy 
Regulatory analyst 
Certification section 
Bureau of Market Development 

RE:Daroc Corporation,Inc. d/b/a Nova Family Campground 
payphone certificate no. 8223 
company code TG9 14 

Dear Toni 5 McCoy, 

We are requesting the cancellation of the pay phone certificate for D'aroc corp inc 

Please forgive me I did not know it could not be transferred. I n hopes to help the new owners with 
An easy transition was our only intent. 

We sold the business and the physical pay phones with the sale. I t was by their request and our ours to 

Have beli south shut off the service to the phones at the time of sale transfer. We shut the sexvice to the payphones 

As of 2/1/04. Leaving it their responsibdiv to follow through and appfy or transfeere. 

We are responsible to take care of any assessments and fees up until that point of SALE. 
Our accountant Mary Knepley was preparing the report to complete the final along with OUT other ending statements for the 
corporation. 

We wish to finalize in good standings with the state public service commission. 

Thank you for your help in this matter. 

9 D'AROC 

CORP INC 

w 



STATE OF FLORIDA 
COMMISSIONERS: DIVISION OF COMPETITIVE MARKETS & 

ENFORCEMENT 
BETH W. SALAK 
DIRECTOR 

BRAULIO L. BAEZ, CHAIRMAN 
J. TERRY DEASON 
LILA A. JABER 
RUDOLPH “RUDY” BRADLEY . 
CHARLES M. DAVIDSON 

(850) 413-6600 

March 26,2004 

Ms. Janet Caporale 
6339 Palmas Bay Circle 
Port Orange, Florida 32 129 

RE: D’XOC Corporation, Inc. d/b/a Nova Family Campground 
Payphone Certificate No. 8223 
Company Code TG914 

Dear Ms. Caporale: 

D’XOC Corporation, Inc. d/b/a Nova Family Campground is currently certified as a pay 
telephone services provider in the State of Florida. The company that purchased the Nova Family 
Campground is not allowed to operate payphones under D’aroc Corporation, Inc.’s certificate. Pay 
Telephone Certificates are not transferable and can not be sold as stated in Pay Telephone Rule 25- 
24.5 13, Florida Administrative Code. 

The new campground owners are not obligated to assume any responsibility for D’aroc 
Corporation, Inc.’s pay telephone certificate. It is D’XOC Corporation, Inc.’s responsibility to request 
cancellation of its pay telephone certificate and pay any regulatory assessment fees associated with the 
certificate in order for the Commission to cancel Certificate No. 8223 in good standing. 

Please submit a letter requesting cancellation of f a y  Telephone Certificate No. 8223 and state 
that you intend to pay any associated Regulatory Assessment Fees. If you have any questions 
concerning this matter, pIease call me at (850) 413-6532. 

Regulatory Analyst 
Certification Section , 
Bureau of Market Development 

Attachments 

Cc: Dawn Ho-lung (Nova Family Campground) 
Gilchrist (CMP) 

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULE\’XRD TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0850 
An Aflirmative Action / Equal Oppoi-nih Employer 

PSC Website: http://H\5.w.floridapsc.com Internet E-mail: cont;lct@psc.state.fl.us 
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CCA Official Document -3/23)2004 7:49 AM 

TO: 
Subject: 

Jackie Gilchrist 
RE: TG914 

Okay. Undockted till I hear further. 

Thanks. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Jackie Gilchrist 
Sent: Tuesday, March 23, 2004 7:48 AM 
To: Kay Flynn 
Subject: RE: TG914 

We need to contact the company to confirm and to see whether the name is registered. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Kay Flynn 
Sent: Monday, March 22, 2004 4:49 PM 
To: Jackie Gilchrist pi 

Subject : TG914 

This MCD update form has the corporation name (D'aroc Corporation, Inc.) scratched through and 
"Emerald Corp" written above it. Do we open a docket for name change? 

c 

Document number is 03789-04. 
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Phvsical Location: 
1190 Herbert Street 
Port Orange, f L  32129-41 99 

i 

i 
I 
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\ Maitina Address: 
11 90 Hetbert Street 
Port Orange, F t  32129-41 99 

38' \ 

Fax No(sk (386) 767-1 666, Fax 2 

Web address: 
http://gocam pi ng america .com/n ovacam p , com 
Federal Employee ID No.: -s9e4556857 

Email address: L/ 

WP I ENTER CORRECT10 
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IMPORTANT NOTE?, 
\ The following section is applicable ONLY to companies w i t K p / a  as part of their oficiaf 

company name, \ 

be part of the official company name. 

MAILING NAME: 

COMPLETED BY: 
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