
ST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET 

Date 

(Please Type) 

May 4,2004 Docket No. 0 4 0 ~ l o -  

2. OPR: 

3. OCR 

W 

Toni McCoy, CMP 

GCO 
-~ ~~ ~~ 

4. Suggested Docket Tide: Request for cancellation on PATS certificate No. 5050 by St. Luke's Hospital Association, 
effective 4/26/04. 

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary) 

A. 

B. 

Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company. 

Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match represeiitarives to companies.) 

1. Parties and their representatives (if any): 

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any): 

~ 

6. Check one: 

X Documentation is attached. 

Documentation will be provided with recommendation. 



. COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 05/04/2004 a t  09:37:07 by TJM 

Complete Name: St. Luke's Hospital Association 

Mailing N a m e :  
Company Code: TF947 FEID Number: 59-0714831 

St. Luke's Hospital Association 

COMPANY INFORMATION 

Address Line 1:4201 Belfort Road 
Address Line 2: 
City : Jacksonville 
Reg. Date: 01/29/1997 

1, State: FL Zip Code: 32216-1431 

Inactive Date: 

Transfered To: 
Trans. From: 
Certificate 1: 5050 Certificate 2: 

Corporate Type: 
Service 1: PAT - P a y  Telephone 

Service 2: 
Service 3: 
Service 4: 
Class (WAW):  

Phone Count: 9 

County 1: 
County 3: 
Bankrupt cy : No 

I 

I 

, 

County 2: 
County 4: 

1 
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COMPANY IDENTIFICATION 
Printed on 05/04/2004 at 09:36:21 by TJM 

Assessment 

RAF 

Penalty 

Interest 

Extension Fee 

Total 

Complete Name: St. Luke's Hospital Association 

Due Paid Owe 

$50.00 $50.00 $0 * 00 

$ 0 . 0 0  $0 * 00 $0.00 

$ 0 . 0 0  $ 0 . 0 0  $0.00 

$0.00 $0 00 $0.00 

$50.00 $ 5 0 . 0 0  $0.00 

Mailing Name:  St. Luke's Hospital Association 
Company Code: TF947 FEID Number: 59-0714831 

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2004 THROUGH 12/31/2004 
Reg. D a t e :  01/29/1997 Inactive D a t e :  

Service : FAT - P a y  Telephone 
Received: Actual RAF Form 

Status: Satisfied 
Amended : No Extension: No 
Frozen : No Comments: No 

Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to D a t e  
Operating R e v :  $0.00 Interstate Rev: 
RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: 

$ 0 . 0 0  

$50  - 0 0  

Last modification was made on Wednesday, April 28, 2004 at 10:30 AM by David Brown 
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4500 San Pablo Rd. 
Jacksonville, FL 32224 . 

FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE 2540 SHUMARD OAK BLVD, TALLAHASSEE FL 32399-0850 

Dat4 Description 

03 / 05/04 01/01/04-12/31/04 
PAY PHONE REGULATORY FEE 2004 

Gross Amount 

$50 00 

No. 532133 
Check Date: 04/20/2004 

$0.00 $50.00 

c- . 

' : 



COMPANY NAME: St. Luke's H o s p i t a l  Association CO. CODE: TF947 

COMPANY LIAISON: Gary P. Pezall, P.E., Operations Manaqer 

CERTIFICATE NO.: 5050 EFFECTIVE: 01/29/97 DOCKET NO. : 

RAF RETURN NOTICE: 

DELINQUENT NOTICE: 

OTHER RETURNED MAIL: 

CCA'S RETUJWED MAIL: 

YEAR(s) RAFs NOT PAID: 

YEAR(s) PENALTIES & INTEREST NOT PAID: 

Amount Year Paid 
REVENUES/YEAR: 

DATE LOTUS CHECKED FOR PAYMENT: 

OTHER INFOBMATION 

04/26/04 - Fiscal provided me a copy of this companv's proof of pavment of 

the 2004 RAF. 

05/03/04 - I called Susan Lanninq, Telecommunications Operations Manaqer, at 

904-953-0008 and asked if the company was requestinq cancellation 

of its certificate. She stated yes, that she had written the PSC 

a letter March 5,  2 0 0 4 ,  and t h a t  someone called her and advised 

her to pay the 2004 RAF, which is what she did. 



Continued 

05/03/04 - 1 asked Ms. Lanninq to fax me a copy of her l e t te r .  

- See attached copy of t he  letter requestinq cancellation. 

- E-mail Jackie Gilchrist and asked if her section had received the 
! L  

oriqinal request. She advised no. 

- Forwarded file to Jackie Gilchrist for handlinq since the company 

I 

is Daid in full throuqh 2004. 

oluntary cancellation, effective 04/26/04. 



From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Jackie Gilchrist 
Monday, May 03,2004 9:11 AM 
Paula lsler 
RE: St. Luke's HospitallMayo Clinic 

NO 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Paula Mer 
Sent: 
To: Jackie Gilchrist 
Subject: St. Luke's Hospital/Mayo Clinic 

Monday, May 03,2004 9:09 AM 

Good morning. Fiscal sent me a copy of this company's $50 check for payment of the 2004 RAF. Nothing else was 
attached. This is usually an indicator that a company has been in contact with us and probably requested cancellation 
of their certificate. I couldn't find record of a request for cancellation so I called them. I was told by Susan Lanning 
that she mailed a letter dated March 5, 2004 requesting cancellation and was told via telephone (she does not know 
who she talked with) to pay the 2004 RAF. Has your group received the request? 

, 
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r Paula Mer 

From: NET SatisFAXtion [postmaster] 
To: Paula lsler 
Subject: 2 page(s) 

This is a FAX message received by NET SatisFAXtion 

Received: 5/03/2004 8 : 5 2  AM 
Total pages: 2 
C S I D  : 
Transfer time: 0:00:40 
Transfer rate: 14400 
Error count: 0 
P o r t  used: Rockwell 56000 External M...#10 
Sta tus:  Success 

FAX.TIF 
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COVER SHEET 

DATE: May 03,2004 

TO: Paula 

DEPARTMENT/LOCATION! . Florida Public Service Commission 

Fm #: 850-41 3-6503- ,_ TELEPHONE #: 

FROM: Susan Laming 

REPARTMBNT/LOCATION: TelecommunicationslMayo CiinieSt. Lukes 

?his fax transmission m y  contain matefial which is cofidential. under IFI~rida and Federal statute and is 
intended M be delivered to only the named addressee. Unauthorized use of this infomation may be a vidation 
of mm statute% If this Wonnatiw is nxeived by anyone othRF than the named address=, the nxipient 
shuld immedatdy notify us at the phme number above to obtain instruction as to the disposal hmf. Under 
no circumstances should this matmiid be mad. retained or copied by anyone other than the named addwee.  

SLH4%BRQ202 



MAY, 3, 2004  7 : 5 1 A M  

sincerely, n 

I 

I 
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