
Dorothy Menasco g w - x !  
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
cc: 
Subject: 

Paula Isler 
Wednesday, June 09,2004 1 1 :05 AM 
Kay Flynn 
Dorothy Menasco 
RE: TF495 

I 

Yes, effective t&e date the request was received. 

- - - -  -Original Message----- 
From: Kay Flynn 
Sent: Wednesday, June 0 9 ,  2004 10:56 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Cc: Dorothy Menasco 
Sub] ect : TF495 

We received payment record for this PATS company for 2003 RAFs with P / I  and 2004 RAFa. 
Their letter requests cancellation. Do we open a docket to cancel? 
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