REQUEST TO ESTABLISH DOCKET
(Please Type)

Date: | 9/30/2004 Docket No.: ()A 75 -] [

1. Division Name/Staff Name: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement/lsler

2. OPR: | Division Of Competitive Markets & Enforcement

3. OCR: | Office Of The General Counsel

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Acknowledgment of cancellation of IXC Registration No. TJ489 by GoBeam Services, Inc.,

5. Suggested Docket Mailing List (attach separate sheet if necessary)
A. Provide NAMES OR ACRONYMS ONLY if a regulated company.

B. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (Match representatives to companies.)

1. Parties and their representatives (if any):

2. Interested persons and their representatives (if any):

6. Check one:

X Documentation is attached.

[ Documentation will be provided with recommendation.

]
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MCWHIRTER REEVES

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

TAMPA OFFICE PLEASE REPLY TO: TALLARASSER OFFICE:
400 NoRTH TaMPA STREET, SUITE 2450 117 S0UTH GADSDEN
Tamra, FLORIDA 35602-5126 TALLAHASSER TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 33201
P.0. BOX 3350, TamPa, FL 356)01-3350 (R50) 22225628
(815) 224-0866 (B13) 221-1854 Fax (850) 222-5606 Pax

September 23, 2004

Ms. Paula Isler

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, F1 32399

Re: Voluntary Cancellation of Certificate Nos. TX 542 and T 489, GoBeam Services,
Inc.

Dear Ms, Isler:

GoBeam Services, Inc. requests the vohuntary cancellation of Certificate Nos. TX 542
and TJ 489, The company has no customers in the state of Florida. GoBeam will pay the
required Regulatory Assessment Fee by Jamuary 30, 2005

Thank you for your assistance. Please contact me with any questions.

Sincerely,

Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Cc: Gene Watkins

MCWHIRTER, REEVES, MCGLOTHELIN, DAVIDSON, KAUFMAN & ARNOLD, F.A.



RAF Form Page 1 of 2

Paula Isler

From: Paulalsler
Sent:  Thursday, September 23, 2004 11:50 AM

To:

Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Subject: RE: Voluntary cancellation

It looks good. 1l open the dockets as soon as the original is received. Thanks.

From: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Sent: Thursday, September 23, 2004 11:22 AM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: Voluntary cancellation

Importance: High

Paula:The letter requesting voluntary cancellation of the GoBeam certificates is attached. | will send you the
original via mail. Let me know if you need anything further. Thanks. Vicki

----- Original Message-----

From: Paula Isler [mailto:PIsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US]
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2004 3:48 PM

To: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Subject: RE: RAF Form

| forgot to tell you on the phone that the letter needs to state the company does not have any customers (if
the company did have customers, it would have to provide us a copy of its "notice to customers” telling
them they have to choose another carrier by a specific date). Thanks.

From: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2004 4:46 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: RAF Form

Thanks again, | knew it was there. | will get you my letters soon. Appreciate your help. Vicki

From: Paula Isler [mailto:PIsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US]
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2004 3:45 PM

To: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Subject: RE: RAF Form

Just above the second baold line that says "Current company status”. The line above states "As
provided in Section 364.336, Florida Statutes, the minimum annual fee is $50."

From: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2004 4:43 PM

To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: RAF Form

| got them both, thanks, but | know | am missing it, where on the form does it telt you the minimum
fee? Vicki

9/23/2004
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From: Paula Isler [mailto:PIsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US]
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2004 3:41 PM

To: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Subject: RE: RAF Form

Yes, the RAF System is set up so that [ can only send one form at a time. Our IT bureau got
hack to me and told me to try again. I'm glad the IXC form at least went through. | also just
sent the CLEC. Let me know if you did not get it. Thanks.

From: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2004 4:39 PM
To: Paula Isler

Subject: RE: RAF Form

Is there a RAF for the CLEC too? Vicki

From: Paula Isler [mailto:PIsler@PSC.STATE.FL.US]
Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2004 3:37 PM

To: Vicki Gordon Kaufman

Subject: RAF Form

This e-mail was sent from The Florida Public Service Commission's Regulatory Assessment
Fee (RAF) System.

Attached document type: Adobe Portable Document Format (PDF)

9/23/2004



7 COMFPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 05/30/2004 &t 12:22:30 by PJI

Complete Name:

GoEeam Services, Inc.

Mailing Name: Inc.

FEID Number:

GoBeam Services,

Company Code: 'TJ489 94-3365126

RAF ACCOUNT FOR THE PERIOD 01/01/2003 THROUGH 12/31/2003

Reg. Date: 03/23/2001 Inactive Date:

Service: IXC - Interexchange Telephone
Received: Actual RAF Form
Status: Satisfied
Amended: No Extension: No
Frozen: No Comments: No
Payment Count: 1 Payment Made to Date
Operating Rev: $0.00 Interstate Rev: $0.00
RAF Rate: 0.0015 Net RAF Due: $50.00
Assessment Due Paid Owe
RAF &50.00 $50.00 £0.00
Penalty £2.50 $2.50 $0.00
Interest $0.50 $0.50 50'00
Extension Fee £0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total £53.00 £53.00 50.00
Feriod covered: 01/C1/Z00F through 12/31/2007 RRF rate: 0.001&
Operating rev: £0.00 Interstate ryew £€C.00
Documents: Rctuel REF form received on 0z2/27/2004
Delinguent letter weiled on 0z/20C/2004
Delinguent lettery mailed on 0z2/1%/2004
Delinguent letter meiled on 02/1&/200¢4
RKAF form maiied on 12/03/2002
Fostmarked Trans Date Deate Posted-By Dep # Check # Check Amcunt
02/27/2004 02/03/2004 0z/04/2004-VPM JI¢ZE E2CE £z .0¢C
RAF paic J143E £50.0¢C
Fenzltv paic Ji4ZE £z .8¢
Interest paid JI43E $C.5¢C




MCD Company Information for TJ489

Printed on 09/30/2004 at 12:18:02 by PJI

Company Code: TJ489 .

Complete Name: GoBeam Services, Inc.

Mailing Name: GoBeam Services, Inc.

Certificate No(s): 7744

Status: Active :

Regulation Date: 03/23/2001

Bankruptcy: No

Company Liaison #1:  Chris Rasmussen

Title: VP - Regulatory/Law & General Counsel

Mailing Address: 5050 Hopyard Road, Suite 350
Pleasanton, CA 94588-2782

Physical Location: 5050 Hopyard Road, Suite 350
Pleasanton, CA 94588-2782

Phone: 4083 850-6181

Fax: 925) 847-1792

Related Dockets:

001737-T1 A{Jplication for certificate to provide interexchange
telecommunications service by GoBeam Services, Inc.



