
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Paula lsler 
Wednesday, December 29,2004 12A8 PM 
Dorothy Menasco 
RE: 

Hey Dorothy. They are paid up through 2004, so it is OK to go ahead and open a docket. Thanks. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Dorothy Menasco 
Sent: Monday, December 27,2004 3:36 PM 
To: Paula Isler 
Cc: Kay Flynn 
Subject: 

Hi Paula, I have a Pay Telephone RAF form from Sun Tel North America, Inc. 

TF98 1 

$77.19 pd 
DN 13494-04 

The attached note requests PATS Cert No. 5083 be cancelled, effective immediately. 

Please advise as to how 1 should handle this. Thank you! 

Dorothy 


