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To: 
Subject: 

Thanks! 

Paula lsler 
RE: TF696 (AMA INC) 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Paula Isler 
Sent: Thursday, December 30, 2004 9:15 AM 
To: Kay Flynn 
Subject: RE: TF696 (AMA INC) 

Yes. This pays them up through 2004. 

-- - - - 0 rig in a 1 Message-- - - - 
From: Kay Flynn 
Sent: Thursday, December 30, 2004 8:53 AM 
To: Paula Isler 
Subject: TF696 (AMA INC) 

Paula, another 2004 RAF payment, another copy of letter requesting cancellation. Do we open a docket? 
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