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Raquel Tully —7Q 175~ //— . O C’lﬁm‘ fiem  CEH 9AT
From: Toni Eamhart ' #‘ 0. R .E
Sent:  Thursday, August 09, 2012 2:.07 PM . —
To: Raquel Tully : ’ 300. 98 %__&
Subject: RE: Hillsborough County Aviation Authority Docket No. 120135-TS TS175 ?/9 / /2
Hi Raquel, ym

Per what they submitted, please apply it as listed below. - DATE DEPOSIT

AUG 13 2012 2 5 7
Hilisborough County Aviation Authority

Docket No. 120135-TS (TF269)

2011 RAF  $600.00

Penalty $50.00

Interest $42.00

Fine $500 ($200 to PSC Trust Fund and $300 to General Revenue)

Thank you,

Toni Joy Earnhart

Regulatory Analyst

Office of Telecommunications
2840 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, FL 32399
Office Phone: 850/413-6532
Office Fax: 850/413-6533

Email: TEARNHAR®PSC, STATE Fi. .US

From: Raquel Tully '
Sent: Thursday, August 09, 2012 1:06 PM
To: Toni Earnhart

Subject:

TS175 sent in a check for $1,292.00 please let me know the breakdown
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http:1,292.00
http:TEABNHABePS<;.STATE.FL.US

